File No. 190866 . ___Committee ltem No. 7
‘ S Board ltem No. g

1

COMMITTEE/BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AGENDA PACKET CONTENTS LIST

Committee: Land Use and Transportation Committee Date October 28, 2019

Board of Supervisors Meeting Date Noverrer & 2015
Cmte Board . , '

Motion

Resolution

Ordinance

Legislative Digest

Budget and Legislative Analyst Report
. Youth Commission Report

introduction Form

Department/Agency Cover Letter andlor Report

MOU

Grant Information Form

Grant Budget

Subcontract Budget

Contract/Agreement

Form 126 — Ethics Commission

Award Letter

Application

Public Correspondence

I

0 2
DDDDDDDDDDDDDEEDD

OTHER : (Use back side if additional space is needed)

x] Leg Exhlblt A
X [X| [2019Cal Fire Code] <--** CLICK HERE TO VIEW
X Referral CEQA 100119
Xl [kl - Hearing Notice 102819

' E] Ea CEQA Determination 102419
L1 L ’ ~
L Ol
L O
0. 0O
O O
N

0 O

- Completed by:___- Erica Major - : Date__ October 24, 2019
Completed by: Erica Major Date  QOctaher 29 2019
P ATH NAME:

* https://sfgov.]egistar.com/View.ashx?
M=F&ID=7745215&GUID=E622D040-7087-4B64-B235-D77F5116FA06


https://sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?

" BOARD of SUPERVISORS

v City Hall .
Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244
San Francisco 94102-4689
Tel. No. 554-5184
Fax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227 -

MEMORANDUM
| LANDAUSE AND TRANSPQRTATION COMMITTEE
'SAN FRANCISCO BOARD OF SUPERVISORS |

TO: Supervisor Aaron Peskin, Chair, Land Use and Transportation Committee ‘
FROM: . Erica Major, Assistant Clerk, Land Use and Transportation Committee '

DATE: October 29, 2019

- SUBJECT: COMMITTEE REPORT, BOARD MEETING

Tuesday, October 29, 2019

~ The following file should be presented as a COMMITTEE REPORT at the Board meeting,
‘Tuesday, October 29, 2019. This item was acted upon at the Committee Meeting on
" Monday, October 28, 2019, at 1:30 p.m., by the votes indicated.

Item No. 30 File No. 190866

~ Ordinance repealing the existing San Francisco Fire Code in its entirety and
enacting a new San Francisco Fire Code.consisting of the 2019 California Fire
Code and portions of the 2018 International Fire Code, together with
amendments specific to San Francisco with an operative date of January 1,
2020; adopting findings of local conditions pursuant to California Health and
Safety Code, Section 17958.7; directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to
forward San Francisco’s amendments to the California Building Standards
Commission and State Fire Marshal; and making environmental findings.

RECOMMENDED AS A COMMITTEE REPORT

4Vot'e: Supervisor Aaron Peskin - Aye
Supervisor Ahsha Safai - Aye
Supervisor Matt Haney - Aye

Board of Supervisors

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board
Alisa Somera, Legislative Deputy
Jon Givner, Deputy City Attorney

56



—

]'\)]’\J._‘.'..L_..x__x_.x..;_;._\_;_;
MR B RNR S © 3. 1 2 a » © N o

o © o ~N o o »~ ow N

FILENO. 190866 | | ORDINANCE, ™ ”;

[Fire Code - Repealing 2016 Code, Adopting 2019 Code]

Ordinance repealing the éxisﬁng San Francisco Fire Code in its entirety and enacting a
new San Francisco Fire Code consisting of the 2019 California Fire Code and portions
of the 2018 International Fire Code, together with amendments specific to San
Francisco with an operative date of January 1, 2020; adopting ﬁndmgs of iocal
conditions pursuant to California Health and Safety Code, Section 17958.7; directing
the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward San Francisco’s amendments to‘ the

California Building Standards Commission and State Fire Marshal; and making

environmental findings.

NOTE: Unchanged Code text and uncodified text are in plain Arial font.
Additions to Codes are in single- underlzne ztalzcs Times New Roman font.
Deletions to Codes are in
Board amendment additions are in double-underlined Arial font.
Board amendment deletions are in strikethrough-AriaHont.
Asterisks (* * * *)indicate the omission of unchanged Code
subsections or parts of tables.

Be it ordained by the People of the City and County of San Francisco:

Section 1. _Environnﬁental Findings.

The Planning Department has determined that the actions contemplated in this
ordinance comply with the California Environmental Quality Act (California Public Resources
Code Secﬁons-21 000 et seq.). Said determination is on file with the Clerk of the Board of

0866 . . . . ) .
Supervisors in File No.___ and is incorporated herein by reference. The Board affirms this

determination.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 1

o7




e

g A O N & S v ®m N o o A~ ® N oo

[N (o] <o ~ D 84 =N w N

Section 2. General Backgro.uhd: Repealing and Replacing the Fire Code.

The State of California adopté a new California Fire Code every three years. The
California Fire Code consists ofé moael code, the International Fire Code, with amendments
made by various State agencies with jurisdibtion over the California Fire Code. The California
Buildihg Standards Commission issues the California Fire Code. |

The California Building Standards Commission recently iséued the the new California
Fire Code (the “2019 California Fire Code”), which is based on the 2018 International Fire

Code, and which will go into effect on January 1, 2020. A copy of the 2019 California Fire

Codg is on file with the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors in File No. 190866 and is

incorporated herein by reference.

' Local jurisdictions are required to enforce the California Fire:Code, but may enact mo—re
restrictive build'ing standards than those set in the California Fire Code where those more
restrictive standards are reasonably necessary due to local Conditions caused by climate,
geology, or topography. Such local amendments to building sténdards are not effective until
the required findings are locally adopted and sent to the California Building Standards
Commission. |

As in past three?year code cycles, thié ordinance repeals San Francisco’s existing Fire
Code (the "2016 San Francisco Fire Code”) and enacts a new Fire Code (the “2019 San
Francisco Fire Code”). The 2016 San Francisco Fire Code incorporated by reference the
2016 California Fire Code (Title 24, Califorhia Code of Regulations, Part 9), including
appendices adopted by the State. In addition, the 2016 San Francisco Fire Code
-incorporated by reference, except as expreésly deleted, modified, or amended, those portions
of the 2015 International Fire Code that were not adopted}by the California Building Standards

Commission in the 2016 California Fire Code. The 2016 San Francisco Fire Code also

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 2

58




[e¢] ~ (o)} g s W N —

«

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

22

23
24

25

included amendments specific to San Francisco, some enacted when the 2016 San Francisco
Fire Code was enacted, and some enacted later. |

The 2019 San Francisco Fire Code incorporétes by reference, except as expressly
deleted, modified, or amended herein, the 2019 California Fire Code (Title 24; California Code
of Regulations, Part 9), including appendices adopted by the State. In addition, the 2019 San

Francisco Fire Code incorporates by reference, except as expressly deleted, modified, or

-~ amended herein, those portions of the 2018 International Fire Code that were not adopted by

- thé California Building Standards Commission in the 2019 California Fire Code. The 2019

Section 3. Findings Regarding Local Conditions.

The City and County of San Francisco (the “City”) is unique amongACalifo.rnia
communities with respect to local climatic, geological, topographical, and other conditions.
Among other things; (1) certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk |
for earthquake-induced structural failure and bonsequent fire due to local hazardous
microzones, slide areas, and local liquefaction hazards; (2) éertain buildings/occupancies in
San Francisco are at increaséd risk of fire due to high density of buildings on very small lots,
with‘many buildings built up to tﬁe property lines; (3) the topography of San Francisco has Ied
to development of a high density of b.uildings on small lots, necessitating special provisions for
exiting, fire separation, or fire-resistive construction; (4) many buildingsv are built on steep hills’
and narrow streets, requiring special safety considerations; (5) additional fire, structural, and
other protection is required due to high building density and crowded occupancy; and (6) the
City is expetriencing a surge in high-rise and super-high-rise development, requiring spécial
safety considerations. Because of the great density of buildings, occupants, and pedestrians

in San Francisco, fires in San Francisco can be especially devastating.’

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 3

59




—

California Health and Safety Code sections 17958 and 17958.5 allow the City to

- change or modify requirements contained in the provisions published in the California Building

Standards Code, including the California Fire Code, when the City determines that those
changes or modifications are reaéonably n'ecessary because of local climatic, geological, or
topographical condi'tions.b California Health and Safety Code section 1 7958.7 proQides that
before making any such changes or modifications, the locality’s governing body must make an
express finding that such changes or modificaﬁons are reasonably necessary because of
speci'ﬁedllocal conditions, and those findings shall be ﬁlled with the California Building
Standards Commission. A list of the “Standard Findings for San Francisco Fire Code

Amendments” and “2019 San Francisco Fire Code Findings,” providing a section-by-section

. statement of the reasons for each deviation from the 2019 California Fire Code, are included

in “Exhibft A’ to this ordinance, which is on file with the Clerk of the Board of Supetrvisors in

File No. 190866 » and which is hereby declared to be a part of this ordinance as if set -

forth fully herein.: '

Pursuant to the applicable California Health and Safety Code sections, the Board of
Supervisors hereby finds and determines that the local climatic, geological, and topographica.l
conditions described above constitute a general summary of the most significant local
conditions compelling variance from the California Fire Code. Further, the Board of
Supervisors hereby finds and determines that, as set forth in Exhibit A, the proposed
variances are reasonably necessary based on these local cbﬁditions, and that theée ’
conditions justify more restrictive standards applicable to buildings and obcupancies in San

Francisco.

-Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 4]

60




<]

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

0 ~ » [ BN N w N

X Fl ativiolu

R

Section 4. Repéal of 2016 San Francisco Fire Code; Adoption of 2019 San Francisco
Firé Code.

(a) The 2016 San Francisco Fire Code is hereby repealed in its entirety. The 2016 -
San Francisco Fire Code being repealed consists of Ordinance 234-16, as amended by -
Ordinances 164-17, 174-17, and 192—19. These ordinances are available on the website of .

the Board of Supefvisors, and in Board File Nos. 161082, 170626, 170682, and 190627,

‘respectively.

(b) The 2016 San Francisco Fire Code is hereby replaced with the 2019 San

California Code of Regulations, Part 9, including appendices adopted by the State (the “2019

California Fire Code”), except as expressly deleted, modified, or amended herein. In addition,
the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code incorporates by reference, except as expressly deleted,
médiﬁed, or amended herein, those portions of the 2018 International Fire Code that were not

adopted by the California Building Standards Commission in the California Fire Code,

including but not limited to Section 503, Section D105 of Appendix D, and Appendix |.

(c) The following provisions supplement, modify, amend, or delete specified provisions
of the 2019 California Fire Code and the 2018 International Fire Code. The prefix “[For SF]"
denotes a 2019 San Francisco Firé Code provision that replaces a'l‘I or part of a corresponding
section from the 2019 California Fire Code or 2018 International Fire Code. Where a 2019
San Francisco Fire Code provision has no analog in the 2019 California Fire Code or 2018

International Fire Code, it does not appear with a “[For SF}” prefix.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 5

61



o © ®m N O g AW N -

NNN—L-—L_L—L_L_L—-L._L.—L_L
BJT § B N — o [¢o] (o] ~l (2] [ SN N OV ] nNo —

e
e

CHAPTER 1. — SAN FRANCISCO GENERAL CODE PROVISIONS.
DIVISION I — SAN FRANCISCO ADMINIST, RATION.
SECTION 1.1. -

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

1.1.1. [For SF] Title.

These regulations shall be known as the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code, may be cited as such,

and will be referred to herein as “this code.” This code incorpbrates by reference the 2019 California

Fire Code { Title 24, California Code of Regulations, Part 9), including appendices adopted by the

State, except for those portions of the 2019 California Fire Code that are expressly deleted, modified,

or amended herein. In addition, this code zncorporates by reference those portions of the 20] 8

International Fire Code that were not adopted by the California Building Standards Commzsswn in the

2019 California F 1re Code, except for those portions of the 2018 International Fire Code that are

expressly deleted modified, or amended herein.

1.1.2.1. Promotion of General Welfare.

In undertaking the adoption and enforcement of this.code, the City and County of San Francisco

is assuming an undertaking only to promote the general welfare. It is not assuming, nor is it imposing

on itself or its officers and employees, an obligation for breach of which it is liable in money damages

to any person who claims that such breach proximately caused injury.

1.1.8.3. Adoption of New Code.

The Chief of the San Francisco Fire Department (hereinafter “Fire Department” or “SFFD”)

shall review all adoptions of the California Fire Code by the California Building Standards

Commission. Within 180 days of publication of such adbptions, the Chief shall recommend to the Board

of Supervisors, through the Fire Commission, more restrictive standards as are reasonably necessary

Mayor Breed S .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 6

62




<]

10
11
12

13

14
15

- 16

17
18

19

20
2
22
23
24
25

o N O U A W N

to accommodate local climate, geological, or topographical conditions. This section does not prohibkit

amendments to this code in the interim between code adoptions by the California Bu'ildin;\7 Standards

Commission.

DIVISION II. - ADMINISTRATION.

PART I - GENERAL PROVISIONS.

SECTION 101. — [DELETED)].

Section 101 of the International Fire Code is deleted,

SECTION 102.
102.3.1. Group E.

All schools shall register with the Fire Departiment’s Bureau of Fire Prevention prior to

OCCUPAncy.

Sections 102.6 through 102.8, and 102.10 through 102.12, of the International Fire Code are
deleted. |

SECTION 103.

Sections 103.1 through 103.3 of the Intemational Fire Code are deleted.

SECTION 104. - GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES.

104.1.1. Administrative Bulletins.

The Fire Departiment is authorized to issue Administrative Bulletins that establish or clarify

requirements under this code, provide interpretations of this code, and set policies and procedures of

the Bureau of Fire Prevention, These bulleting shall be posted on the Fire Department’s website.

Mayor Breed-

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page7

63




—t

104.1.2. New Administrative Bulletins; Reyisions to Existing Administrative Bulletins.

When the fire code official determines that it is appropriate to develop or revise an

Administrative Bulletin ( “Bulletin” ), the Fire Department shall post the proposed new or revised

Bulletin on its website for 30 days, and provide notice of that Bulletin to parties who have registered to

receive notice on the Department’s website. The posting shall include instructions for providing written

comments on the proposed Bulletin and notice of a public hearing regarding the proposed Bulletin. The

fire code official shall conduct a public hearing on the proposed Bulletin to obtain public comment. The

hearing shall be held after the 30-day posting period. The Fire Commission shall appro've any

proposed new or revised Bulletin at a noticed meeting. A Bulletin shall not be effective until approved

o © o N o oo~ W N

[\Y] no NN nNo N — —_ — - — s —s e — —

by the Fire Commission. The fire code official and the Fire Commission may amend the proposed

Bulletin during the approval process without re-posting the Bulletin for 30 days.

104.6.2.1. Inspection Photographs.

The fire code official is authorized to take photographs during inspections as deemed

appropriate by the fire code official.

104.10.2. Investigation Phgtbgraphs.

The fire code official is authorized to take photographs during fire investigations as deemed

appropriate by the fire code official.

104.10.3. Reward.

The Mayor is authorized to offer a reward for the arrest and conviction of any person found

pguilty of arson or attempted arson according to the California Penal Code.

SECTION 105. — PERMITS.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

105.1.1. [For SF] Permits Requtired,

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . ' Page 8

64




o N o o B~ W N

o

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

Any person who engages in an activity for which an operational permit is required under

Section 105.6 shall obtain the appropriate permit from the fire code official prior to engaging in the

activity. Any person installing or modifying systems or equipment that reqguire construction permits

under Section 105.7 shall obtain a building permit from the San Francisco Depariment of Building

Inspection prior to the start of work. Any person applyving for a permit shall pay permit fees, as

required by Section 106, and any fees required by other departments as applicable, prior to the

. applicable Departiment issuing the permit. The permit.holder shall keep the permit on the premises

designated therein at all times and shall make the permit readily available for inspection by theﬁre,

. code official.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the éorrespon'ding California Fire

Code section:

105.1.3. [For SF Z. Multiple Permits for the Same Location.

When more than one Fire Department permit is required for the same location, the fire code

official may consolidate the permits into a single permit at the time of issuance. The applicant shall pay

a fee for permit consolidation as sgebiﬁed in Section 106.2.1.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

105.2.3. [For SF] Time Limitation of Application.

The fire code official is authorized to cancel a permit application when the applicant fails to

make _corrections or to provide additional information required by the fire code official within 180 days

after fiZin o the application.

105.2.5. Hearing for Certain Permits.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 9

65




—

NN NN e e ek e ke A e ek

o ©W O N o g W N

Certain permit applications are subject to hearings in accordance with San Francisco Business

and Tax Regulation Code, Article 1, Section 22.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

105.3.1. [For SF] Expiration.

An operational permit shall remain in effect until re-issued, renewed, or revoked, or for such a

period of time as specified in the permit. Construction permits shall be administered through the San

Francisco building permit process in accordance with the San Francisco Building Code. Permits are

not transferable, and a new permit is required for any change in occupancy, operation, tenancy, or

ownership.

105.3.9. License.

When San Francisco Business and Tax Regulation Code, Article 1, Section 23, requires a

. license in conjunction with the issuance of a permit, the fire code official shall forward an approved

permit to the Tax Collector for issuance.

Exception: Permits for permitted activities occurring on Port of San Francisco property are

administered separately. ' ' ' o

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

105.4.1. [For SF] Submittals.

Construction permit applicants shall submit documents and supporting data in accordance with

procedures established in the 2019 San Francisco Building Code and San Francisco Fire Department

Administrative Bulletins when applicable.

Mayor Breed _
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 10

66



The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

105.4.6. [For SF] Reténtion of Construction Documents.

. The building official shall be the custodian of approved construction documents in accordance

with procedures established in the San F ran'cisco Building Code.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

. 105.6.23. [For SF| Hot Work Operations.

An operational permit is required for hot work including, but not limited to:

1. Public exhibitions and demonstrations where hot work is conducted.

2. Use of portable hot work eqguipment inside a structure.

Exception: Work that is conducted under a construction permit.

3. Fixed-site hot work equipment such as welding booths.

4.  Hot work conducted within a wildfire risk area.

5. Application of roof coverings and any other associated work while roofing or waterproofing

. the exterior surfaces of a building with the use of an open-flame device.

6. When approved, the fire code official shall issue a permit to carry out a hot work program.

This program allows approved personnel to regulate their facility’s hot work operations. The approved

personnel shall be trained in the fire safety aspects denoted in this chapter and shall be responsible for

- issuing permits requiring compliance with the requirements found in Chapter 35. These permits shall

be issued only 1o their employee for hot work operations under their supervision.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 11

67




o © oo N o o b~ W N =

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

105.6.27. [For SF] LP-Gas (Liguified Petrol-e‘um Gas).

An operational permit is required for storage and use of LP-gas,

Exception: A permit is not required to use one LP-fueled cooking device per building or to store

one additional cylinder wiih a 20 lb. (9.1 ko) ageregate water capacity outside of the building of

residential occupancies. See Section 308.1.4 for additional requirements.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section.:

105, 6.33JEbr SF] Open Flame and Torches.

An operational permit is required to use a torch or open-flame device in a wildfire risk area.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section;:

105.6.36. [For SF | Outdoor Assembly Event.

An operational permit is required to conduct an outdoor assembly event where planned

attendance exceeds 500 persons.

_] 05.6. 52ﬁberational Permits fbi' Battery Systems.

An operational permit is required for stationary storage systems having a liquid capacity of

~ more than 50 gallons (I 89L). See Section 608.

105.6. 53.' 0perational Permits for Mobile Fueling.

An operational permit is required for mobile fueling operations carrying a liguid capacity in

excess of 10 gallons (38L), in aggregate, of flammable or combustible liquids,

Mayor Breed . o .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 12

68




—

w

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23

24 |

25

©® N o o A~ W N

J 05.6.54. Indoor Cannabis Cultivation.

An operational permit is required to cultivate cannabis inside any building, green house, pier,

shed, or any other structure.

105.7.26. Car S tackigg Parking Systems.

A construction permit is required to install car stacking parking systems in buildings.

SECTION 106. — FEES.

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section 106 replaces the corresponding Internationtil

Five Code Qpr'fr'om 106
LEIFE A OLE SCELLIDN LV0.

/ |44

106.1. [For SF] General.

Tl_ze Fire Department shall assess fees in accordance with the provisions of this section.

106.2. [For SF] Operational Permit Filing Fees.

The filing fee for operational permits is set forth in Table 106-A. Inspections necessary for

permit issuance that require more than two hours to complete shall be subject to an additional fee of

3130 for each hour. The Fire Department shall not issue a permit until the fees are paid.

106.2.1. [For SF] Consolidation of Operational Permits Fee.

The fee for consolidation of operational permits is $95.00 for each activity added to the original

permit. -
106.2.2. [For SF] Posting Fee.

The fee for posting notice of application for certain permits are set in the San Francisco

Buisiness and Tax Regulation Code, Article I, Section 27.

106.2.3. [For SF] Permit Fees for Vendors at Street Fairs Involving Temporary Street Closures
(ISCOTT).

Permit fees for vendors at street fairs involving temporary street closures are set in the San

Francisco Transportation Code, Division 1, Article 6, Section 6.6.

Mayor Breed . . ‘
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : Page 13

69




-

o ©w o N O ;s W N

.

106.3. [For SF] Construction Permit Fees.

The Central Permit Bureau at the Department of Building Inspection collects construction

permit (building permit) fees in accordance with the San Francisco Building Code. When the Fire

Department conducts plan review for buildings or portions of buildings under its authority, the

Department will assess plan review feés in qccordance with Section 106.4, When the Fire Department

conducts inspections for buildings or portions of buildings under its authority, the Department will

assess Inspection fees in accordance with Section 106.5.

1 06.4. [For SF] Plan Review Fees.

Upon application for a permit for the erection of a new building or for alteration work for

-which plans are required by the Department of Building Inspection, the Central Permit Bureau shall

" charge and collect a fee to compensate the Fire Department for its costs of reviewing plans submitted

with building permit applications for compliance with fire safety regulations. The fee shall be based on

the valuation of the work as determined by the Department of Building Inspection. The fee for each

permit is set in Table 106-B. The Fire Department shall assess a fee in the amount of $130 per hour to

review revisions to any previously approved plans. The Central Permit Bureau shall collect the fee

before issuing the permit.

106.5. [For SF] Field Inspection Fees.

When the Fire Department determines a ﬁ'eld Inspection is required to verify that building

construction is in compliance with fire safety regulations and this code, it shall notate the application

accordingly to provide notice to the Central Permit Bureau. The Central Permit Bureau shall collect

the inspection fee due, before issuing a building permit. The fee for each permit is set in Table 106-C..

Initial field inspection fees will be charged for inspections of new fire alarm, sprinkler, and gaseous

suppression systems per the no_tation in Table 106-C.

After buildingpermit issuance, when the fire code official notifies the applicant that additional

inspection time is required over the amount of time set in Table 106-C, the applicant shall purchase

Mayor Breed ) . .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ] . Page 14

70



o ~N o o s W

[<e]

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

additional inspection time before the inspector schedules additional inspections. The Fire Department

“shall collect a fee of $130 per hour for the cost of providing the inspection service.

106.6, [For SF] Pre-Application Plan Review.

When an applicant wishes to discuss specific design issues or submit preliminary designs for

review and comment by the Fire Department before the applicant submits a formal application for

permit, the Fire Departinent shall assess a fee of $390. This fee provides the applicant with up to three

hours for research and meeting with Fire De’bartment personnel. When the time spent by the Fire

Department exceeds three hours, the Department shall assess additiondl fees at the rate of $130 per

) B
novur.

106.7. [For SF] Re-Inspection of Violation Fees.

If the fire code official issues a notice of violation under this code, the notice of violation may -

set a period of time that is reasonable to remedy the violation, and the fire code official may re-inspect

the gr‘oberty to verify that the person responsible has made the required correction. The Fire

Department shall collect a fee in the amount of $260 for re-inspections. If the time required for the re-

inspection exceeds one hour, the Fire Department shall assess an additional fee at the rate of $130 per

hour.

106.8. [For SF] High-Rise Inspection Fees.

For inspections of high-rise structures pursuant to Section 13217 of the California Health and

Safety Code, the owner of the structure shall pay a fee to cover the Fire Department’s costs of

inspection. The Department shall calculate the fee on the basis of $13.50 per 1000 square feet kof gross
floor areaq.
106.8.1. [For SF] Gross Floor Area.

For purposes of this section, the term “gross floor area” is defined as the entire area of each

floor, attic, basement or shaft of a building included within the exterior walls of a building, including

Mayor Breed ' :
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS , Page 15

71




——

o W o N o o A~ W N

e

any portion not included within the exterior walls that is under the horizontal projection of the roof or

floor above.
106.9. [ For SF] Referral Fees.

If a government agency requests a preliminary site inspection or survey of a premise for

compliance with this code or other regulatory codes enforced by the Fire Department, the Fire

Department shall collect a service fee of $130 per hour for the on-site inspections and consultations.

When the referral inspection is requested by another San Francisco agency, the reqﬂesting agency

shall transfer the fee to the Fire Department through electronic transfer. The requesting agency shall

pay the fee before scheduling the inspection or consiltation. Fees referenced in the California Health

and Safety Code take precedence over this fee.

106.10. [For SF] Overtime Fee.

If a person requests an inspection or other service that requires the assigned Fire Department

emplovyee to work outside of the employee’s normal working schedule, the Department will charge an

overtime fee of $143.00 per hour. The person requestiﬁg the services shall pay the fee before the

inspection or other service is performed, The minimum compensation is four hours.

106.11. [For SF] Collection of Other Fees.

The fire code official may collect fees as required by other portions of the San Francisco

Municipal Code for services by other City departments pertinent to the issuance of permits required by

this code.

106.12. [For SF] Water Flow Request Fee.

Upon a request from a person for water flow information, the Department will charge a water

flow fee of $130. If the information requested requires that Fire Department employees perform an on-

site water flow test, the Department will charge a fee of 3250,

106.13. [For SF] False Alarm Fees.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ) : ‘ Page 16

72




—

B RBRBNES 5 I 0 » e 0 =

The Fire D_eparﬁnent shall charge a service fee of $250 for each false fire alarm to which the

Depariment responds after the first two false fire alarms at that address within any calendar vear. The

Fire Departzﬁent shall charge a service fee of $500 for each false fire alarm to which the Department

responds after the first five false fire alarms at that address within any calendar yvear. The fire code

official may waive the false alarm fee for good cause as determined by the Chief. The Fire Department

“shall send notice of the fee to the responsible person, requiring payment within 30 days of the date of

. the notice.

106.14. [For SF] Residential Apartment/Hotel Inspection Fee.

The Fire Department shall charge an inspection fee of 3157.00 to inspeci buildings under the

R1 and R2 Residential Apartment/Hotel Inspection Program.

106.15. [For SF] Voluntary Seismic Retrofit Fee Waiver.

Notwithstanding the fees established herein, if a project involves volunt&ry seismic retrofit

upgrades to soft-story, wood-frame buildings, as defined by the Director of the Department of Building

Inspection, the project applicant is exempt from the proportionate share of plan review fees specified

under this code that related to the retrofit work.

106.16. [For SF] Cost Recovery Related to Vehicle Incidents.

(a) The Fire Department may submit a claim lo recover its reasonable costs incurred

responding to a motor vehicle incident in the City and County of San Francisco where a person has

willfully or negligently caused or permitted the contents of a motor vehicle to be deposited on a street

or highway, or its appurtenances, and the Fire Department removes those vehicle contents from the

street or highway, or its appurtenances. Vehicle contents may include gas, oil and vehicle debris. The

Fire Department shall submit the claim to the insurance company of the person responsible for willfully

or negligsently causing or permitting-the vehicle contents to be deposited on the street or highway, or its

appurienances.

(b} The Fire Department shall submit claims in the following amounts:

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 17

13



'y

qw'(

R

] }
Description of Incident . 4 Charge
One suppression unit provided vehicle $249

content removal (one hour or less)

Two or more suppression units provided 3498
vehicle content removal (one hour or less)

Any incident where the vehicle content An amount based on the reasonable time and
removal exceeds one hour materials costs incurred

(c) After a noticed hedring, the Chief of the Fire Depariment may promulgate rules to

effectuate the purposes of this section or to facilitate the claim process.

106.17. Reserved.

106.18. Reserved.
106.19. Reserved.
106.20. Reserved.

106.21. [For SF] Fee-Setting Procedure.

{a) No later than a date that the Controller shall prescribe, the Chief of the Department shall

annually report the revenues received from each type of fee the Department collects. The report shall

include the costs, both direct and indirect, the Department incurs in providing the services for which

each fee is assessed, the anticipated costs for the ensuing fiscal year, the level of service the

Departmernt anticipates it will provide for each service for which it charges a fee, and the rate that

would be necessary to support each service. The Controller shall file the report with the Board of

Supervisors no later than July Ist of each year. If the fees are insufficient to recover SFFD costs, or if

the fee recovers more than the actual costs, the Controller shall submit legislation to the Board of

Supervisors to ensure that over time the City fees do not exceed the cost of providing the service for

which the City charges the fee. The amount of the license fee for the Fire De'pdrtment permit for the

2019-2020 fiscal year shall be as set forth in the BL;silzess and Tax Regulations Code Section 75 et seq.

Mayor Breed ) .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ' Page 18

14




o N o o A~ W

W

10
11
12

13

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

i
e

(b) Beginning with the set of fees for fiscal year 2019-2020, and each fiscal year thereafter, the

Controller shall annually adjust the Department’s fees as provided in this section to the extent

 necessary to ensure that over time each departmental fee does not exceed the cost of providing the

service for which the City charges the fee. This process will occur as follows. The Chief of the

Department shall annually report to the Controller the revenues received from each type of fee the

Department collects for the immediately preceding vear. The report shall include the costs, both direct

and indirect, the Departmenf incurred in providing the services for which each fee is assessed, the

anticipated costs for the ensuing fiscal year, the level of seryice the Department anticipates it will

. . .
vouide fav saeh covrvirs forwwhich 1t rhavose a frp nand the »
[#4'4151% f_‘ufv CaAcn SerVice jor WillCnl it cinarges a jece, ana < 7

oy
o

_each service. No later than April 15 of each year, the Chief of Department shall submit this report and

SFFD’s current fee schedule to the Controller. No later than July 1 of each vear, the Controller shall

make such adiusfments to the fees as are necessary to comply with this ordinance and file a report with

the Board of Supervisofs reporting the new fee schedule as adjusied under this ordinance and

certifying that: (1) each will produce sufficient revenue to support the costs of providing the services

for which the fee is charged and (2) each fee will not pr oduce revenue that exceeds the costs of

provsz the services for which each permit fee is charged No laz‘er than September of each vear, .

SFFD’s fee schedule showing the current fee amounts inclusive of annual ad;ustments shall be

published in an Appendix 1o the Fire Code, posted on SFFD’s website, and made available upon

request at SFED headquarters.

TABLE 106-A. — OPERATIONAL PERMIT FEES.
TYPE OF PERMIT

FEE
Aérbsol Products, Regulated Activities 375
Amusement Buildin,qs, Op?ration $375
Aviation Facilities, Regulated Activities 375

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 19

715




-t

[\ [N N N N — — -t - —_ —_ — — i —

S ©® ©® ~N o U b W N

R

Aviation Facilities, Aircraft Refueling Vehicle 9375
Battery System, Operation 375
Carnivals and Fairs, Operation 3375
Cellulose Nitrate Film, Regulated Activities 375
COmbustible Dust-Producing Operatiéns 3375
Combustible Fiber, Regulated Activities 3375
Co;npfessed Gas, Regulated Activities 375
Conditional Use | $95
Covered Mall Buildings, Operafion 375
Cryogenic Fluids, Regulated Activities $375
Cutting and Welding, Operation $375
DJ’V Cleaning Pldm‘, Operation 375
Exhibits and Trade Shows, Operation $375
Explosives, Regulated Activities $375
Fireworks, Display 375
Firefi gl'lter Air>Svstéfms, Maintenance $375
Flammable and Combustible Finishes, Application of (Including $375
Floor Finishes)

Flammable or Combustible Liquids, Regulated Activities 3375
Fruit énd Crop Ripening‘ | 3375
Fumigation and Thermal Insecticidal Fogging $375
Hazardous Materials, Regulated Activities | $375
Hazardous Production Material (HPM) Facilities 375
High-Piled Storage | $375

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

76

Page 20




o ~N o o~ W N

0

#

Hot Work Operations, Regulated Activities 3375
" Indoor Cannabis Cultivation | 3375
Industrial Ovens ‘ $375
Liquefied Petroleum Gases, Regulated Activities 3375
Live Audience, Production Facility, Studio, Séund Stage $375°
Lumberyards and Woodworking Plants : 375
Magnesium Processing 3375
Miscellaneous Combustible Storage - $375
T&a’abile food preparation vehicles and caris “$375
Motor Fuel-Dispensing Facilities o ‘ $375
Mobile Fueling of hydrogen-fueled vehicles 375
Open Burning ' 4 | 3375
Open Flame and Carzdles in Assembly Areas $375
Open Flame and Torches — Wildfire Risk Area o $375

15
16
17
18
19
A20

22
23
24
25

. Organic Coating, Manufacturing

Qutdoor As&embly event

Place of Assembly

Place of Assembly — Permanent Occupancy for Non—Proﬁt Group

Plant Extraction Systems 3375
Private fire hyvdrant - Remove, use, or operate 375
Pyrotechnic Special Effects Material ' $375

Pyroxylin Plastics

Refrigeration Equipment

Repair Garages and Motor Fuel Dispensing Facilities

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERV[SQRS

11

|

©a
G

|

a

5
n

|




e

Rooftop Heliports

J
pa—

s
3
D

|

3
A

Spraying or dipping - Operational

Temporary Membrane Structures and Tents

2
n

Tire Storage

Tire Rebuilding Plants

Waste Handling, Regulated Activities

:

0
3R
(PR

|

3
A

TABLE 106-B. — PLAN REVIEW FEES.

VALUATION
$1.00 TO $2,000

$2,001 TO $50,000

$50,001 TO $200,000

- $200,001 TO $500,000

$500,001 TO $1,000,000

FEE

374.00 for the First $j,000 or less plus $72.879Ifor each
additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof. to and including

$2.000.00

$146.88for the First $2,000 or less plus $14.0747 for each
additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof. to and including

$50.000.00 ' 4

3822.46 for the First $50,000 or less plus $5.6482 for each
additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof. to and including
$200,000.00 :

31,669.69 for the First $200.000 or less plus $2.6327 for each

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and including
$500,000.00

$1,000,001 TO $5 ,000,000

$2,459.50 for the First $500,000 or less plus $1.75 73 fof each

additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof. to and including
$.1,000,000.00 ‘

$3.338.12 for the First $1,000,000 or less plus $1.3360 for

each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof, to and.
including $5,000,000.00

$5,000,001 $8.681.96 for the First $5,000,000 or less plus $0.6737 for
: each additional $1,000.00 or fraction thereof
NOTATION TO TABLE 106-B:
Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

18

Page 22




—re

— —_ — — — —t —t — :

N
(&)}

S
e’

EVACUATION SIGNAGE: Plan review beyond thirty minutes will be assessed at an hourly rate
of $130 per hour.

TABLE 106-C. — FIELD INSPECTION FEES (See notation for additional fees).

VALUAT. TON ' FEE/INSP. TIME CREDIT
Over Not More Than
$0 $10,000 . 3130 ONE HOUR
$10,001 - $50,000 ' $260 TWO HOURS
350,001 $500,000 $390 THREE HOURS
$500,001 | $5,000,000 » $650 FIVE HOURS

| 35,000,001 $10,000,000 $1,300 TEN HOURS
$10,000,001 $25,000,000 , | $2600 TWENTY HOURS
$25,000,000 - . , $3,900 THIRTY HOURS

NOTATION TO TABLE 106-C:

NEW FIRE ALARM SYSTEMS $260 TWO HOURS
NEW SPRINKLER SYSTEMS A $390 THREE HOURS
NEW GASEQUS SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS $260 TWO HOURS

This initial minimum inspection fee covers all inspections up to the hours specified above. If the

inspections for the new system exceed the hours specified above, additional hourly fees will be

assessed.

SECTION 109. — [DELETED].

Section 109 of the International Fire Code is deleted.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 23

79



o © o N o 0 W0 N

e

,,,,,,,

—

SECTION 110, — VIOLATIONS.

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code Section:

110.1. [For SF] Unlawful Acts.

(a) It shall be unlawful for a person to erect, construct, enlarge, alter, repalr, move, improve, _

remove, convert, demolish, equip, use, occupy, or maintain a building, occupancy, premises, system, or

yehicle, or any portion thereof: or cause the same to be done, in violation of any of the provisions of

this code.

(b) - It shall be imlawfyl for a person to engage in any activity for which a peimit is required

under this code without the required permit, or to engage in any activity in violation of conditions set in

a permit issued under this code.

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section replaces the corresponding California Fire

" Code Section.

170.2. [ For SF] Person Responsible.

(a) Except as provided in subsection (c), the persbn responsible for a violation that pertains to

a building, occupancy, premises, system, or vehicle is the owner of the building, occupancy, premises,

system, or vehicle.

(b) The person responsible for a violation that pertains to an activity conducted without a

permit required under this code or in violation of a permit issued under this code is the person

engaging in that activity, except that if the person engaging in the activity is the emplovee of a business

and is performing the activity in the course and scope of his or her employment, the owner of the

business is the person responsible.

Mayor Breed : '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS - Page 24

80




o N OO o A wWwN

[do]

10
11
12

13

14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(¢) The person responsible for a violation of Section 108.6 or Section 1031.2 is the owner of

the business operating at the building or premises.

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code Section:

110.3. [For SF] Remedies Available.

The fire code official may enforce the provisions of this code by: issuing a notice of violation

under Section 110.4; issuing an administrative citation under Section 110.5; or issuing criminal

penaliies under Section 110.0.

In addition to the above remedies or other remedies authorized by law, in cases where there is a

continuing or recurring fire hazard in a residential building with three (3) or more dwelling units, the

fire code official may issue a Fire Life Safety Notice and Order that requires the owner of the building

to do one or more of the following to abate or mitigate the fire hazard: (1) install a new fire sprinkler -

system; (2) improve an existing fire sprinkler system or upgrade it to current code requirements; (3)

install a new fire alarm and/or detection system; or (4) improve an existing fire alarm and/or detection

system or upgrade it to current code requirements. For purposes of this Section 110. 3, a “fire hazard”

is defined in Section 102A.1 of the San Francisco Building Code.

The fire code official may exercise this authority in cases where the fire official has determined

that:

(a) Notwithstanding the Department’s issuance of two or more notices of violation under '

Section 110. 4 or administrative citations under Section 110. 5, a fire hazard continues to exist or

recurs after abatement in a residential building of three or more units; and

(b) While the cited code violations have not risen to the level of an imminent hazard, they are so

extensive and of such a nature (including but not limited to a nonworking fire alarm or sprinkler

Mayor Breed ]
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS - : ‘ Page 25

81




——ky

N
o1

Pe—
e

system, a broken or deteriorated fire escape or egress system, or locked or permanently blocked exits)

that the health and safety of the residents and/or the general public is substantially endangered; and

(c) The property owner has failed to abate or mitigate the violations in a timely way in

accordance with an order issued pursuant fto Section 110.4.3(g) of this Code,

Each notice of violation or administrative citation for a fire hazard issued pursuant to Sections

1104 or 110.5 shall provide information about the Fire Life Safety Notice and Order and the

consequences for not abating fire safety violations within the specified compliance period. In addition,

prior to issuance of a Fire Life Safety Notice and Order, the fire code official shall send a letter by

regular and certified mail to the building owner at the address listed with the Assessor-Recorder’s

Office and to the persons or entities listed in subsection (b) below informing them that because the

building has been cited with two or more notices of violation for a fire hazard under Section 110.4 or

_administrative citations under Section 110.5 of this Code, the owner is a potential recipient of a Fire

Life Safety Notice and Qrder.

All the notice and hearing procedures set forth in Section 110.4.3 shall apply to a Fire Life

Safety Notice and Order, except as that procedure may be modified below.

(a) The Fire Life Safety Notice and Order shall:

' (1) Be signed by the ﬁre code official

(2) Set forth the street address of the building and a description of the building or

property sufficient for identification;

(3) Identify edch code violation that the fire code official has determined is a fire haéard

substantially endangering the health and safety of the residents and/or the general

public;

(4) Specify the fire safety installation, improvement, and/or upgrades required; and

(5) Contain time frames reqguired for compliance with the order.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ' Page 26

82




o N o a0 A W N~

«w -

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(b) The fire cbde official shall serve the Fire Life Safety Notice and Order by certified mail on

the building owner(s) at the address listed with the Assessor-Recorder’s Office. A copy shall also be

sent by certified mail to:

(1) The person, if any, in real or apparent charge and conirol of the premises involved;

(2) The holder of any mbr;‘gage, deed of trust, lien, or encumbrance of record; and

. (3) The owner or holder of any other estate or interest in the building or property, or the

land on which it is located.

(c) The fire code official shall post a copy of the Fire Life Safety Notice and Order in a

conspicuous place on the subject property and either mail or.deliver a copy o the resideni(s) of each

unit on the subject property.

(d) Unless the building owner demonstrates to the fire code official’s satisfaction that the owner

has made substantial progress in complying with the Fire Life Safety Notice and Order, if the building

owner has not complied with said Notice and Order according to the required time frames the fire code

official shall schedule an administrative hearing to be held no later than 14 days after the compliance

deadline.

(e) Ifan Administrative Hearing is held, the fire code official shall attend the heari.ng, which

shall be conducted by a designated Hearing Officer. A written decision signed by the fire code official

shall be issued no later than 30 days after the hearing.

(f) A copy of the fire code official’s written decision shall be recorded. in the Assessor-

Recorder’s Office.

{(g) The fire code official shall refer the case to the City Attorney for its review and possible

action within 90 days after recording said Notice and Order.,

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code Section:

Mayor Breed .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ) . Page 27|

83




—e

1104, [For SF ] Notice of Violation.

(a) When the fire code official finds a building, occupancy, premises, system, or vehicle, or any

portion thereof, that is in violation of this code, the fire code official shall, within 15 days, prepare a

written notice of violation, which shall identify the code sections violated, describe the violation, and,

where applicable, require correction of the violation. The notice of violation shall also set forth the

penalties, fees, and costs for the violation. The notice of violation shall also identify the violation as a

priority complaint, for violations presenting immediate life safety issues, or a standard complaint, for

all other violations. Wh@ correction is not immediate, the notice of violation shall specify a time for .

compliance and re-inspection.

(b) When the fire code official finds a person performing any activity l‘equirirzg a permit under .

 this code without the required permit, or conducting an activity in violation of conditions set in a

permit issued under this code, the fire code official may prepare a written notice of violation, which

- shall identify the code sections violated and describe the violation. The notice of violation shall also

set forth the penalties, fees, and costs for the violation. The notice of violation shall also identify the

violation as a priority complaint, for violations presenting immediate life safety issues, or a standard

complaint, for all other violations. In addition, the fire code official may issue a stop work order under

Section 112, requiring the person to immediately cease performing the activity.

The following San Francisco Fire Code Section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code Section:

110.4.1. [For SF] Service of Notice of Violation.

(a) When a notice of violation pertains to a specific building, occupancy, premises, system, or

vehicle, the fire code official shall mail a copy of the notice of violation to the owner of the building,

occupancy, premises, system, or vehicle by regular U.S. mail. The fire code official shall post the

notice of violation in a conspicuous place on the subject property.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ] : Page 28

84




o N o o B~ W N

(o]

11
12
13

14

15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

(b) When a notice of violation pertains to a person engaged in an activity for which a permit is

required without the required permit, or in violation of a permit issued under this code is the person

engaging in that activity, the fire code official shall serve the notice of violation upon the person

responsible for the activity as follows: by personal service, by regular U.S. mail and certified mail, or

by leaving it with a person of responsibility at site of the activity. - The fire code official shall post the

notice of violation in a conspicuous place on the subiect property.

(c) Service by certified or registered mail is effective on the date of mailing if the certified or

registered letter is mailed, postage prepaid, return receipt requested, to the person responsible at that

person’s current address as listed with the Assessor's Office. If ihe Assessor’s Office records do not

include an address for a person entitled to notice, then the fire code official shall serve that person by

mailing the letter to the address of the building, occupancy, premises, or system involved in the

proceedings.

110.4.2. Re-Inspection Fee.

When the fire code official issues a notice of violation and sets a date for compliance and re-

inspection to certify compliance with code requirements, the fire code official shall charge-a $260

violation re-inspection fee for each re-inspection and the person responsible shall pay that fee.

110.4.3. Hearing on Notice of Violation.

(a) If the person responsible to correct a violation identified as a priority complaint fails to do

so within the time period specified in the notice of violation, the fire code official shall set the matter

for hearing, to be heard within 60 days of the deadline. If the person responsible to correct any other

violation fails to do so within the time period specified in the notice of violation, the fire code official

shall set the matter for hearin@ to be heard within 180 days of the deadline.

(b) Notice of hearing. If the fire code official determines to set the matter for hearing, the fire

code official shall serve a notice of hearing that provides at least 10 days notice of the hearing. The

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 29

85




m——

m-m]\)m[\)_.x_a...x.__l._x_;_:._x_g_x
E W N - o © [00] ~l (@)} a1 N w N -t

notice shall include the following information: (1) the street address of the building, occupancy,

premises, or system that A) in violation of the code, or the date and location of any activity conducted

 without a required permit or in violation of permit conditions; (2) the date, hour and place of the

hearing; (3) a statement that the hearing is an opportunity for all interested parties to appear before

the fire code official to show cause why the fire code official should not order the building, occupancy,

premises, or system repaired or altered to be brought into compliance with code, or vacated or

demolished, or require a permit or compliance with permit requirements; (4) a warning that describes

o © . N o o A~ W N

the penalties for violation as set forth in subsection (k) below and Séction 1104.4; and (5) a c-op& of the

‘notice of viclation.

(c) Service of hearing notice. The fire code official shall serve the notice of hearing on each of

the following persons: {1) the person, if any, in real or apparent chafge and control of the building,

occupancy, premises, or system, or responsible for any activity; (2) the owner of record of any

building, occupancy, premises, or system, or where an activity occurred; (3) the holder of any

morteage, deed of trust, lien or encumbrance of record; (4) the owner or holder of any recorded lease;

and (5) the holder of any other recorded estate or interest in the building, occupancy, premises, or

system, or the land upon which it is located. The fire code official shall include an affidavit or

declaration under penalty of perjury, certifying to the time and manner in which the notice was served.

The fire code official shall serve the notice of hearing as follows: by personal service; or by regular

U.S. Mail and certified or registered mail. Service by certified or registered mail is effective on the date

of mailing if the certified or registered letter is mailed, postage prepaid, return receipt requested, to

each person entitled to notice as that person’s address appears on the last annual tax roll of the county

or at the address to which the Tax Collector mailed the most recent real property tax bill for the

building, occupancy, premises, or system. If the annual tax roll or the Tax Collector records do not

include an address for a particular person entitled to notice, then the fire code official shall serve the

noftice to that person at the address of the building, occupancy, premises, or system involved in the

Mayor Breed '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS. ' . Page 30

86




5 © ®m ~N o o b W N =

}'\);_J._L_.J._\._.L_L_.L_J._L_a.
RRBRNRBEBGS® I o x» o b=

proceedings. The failure of any owner or other person to receive a notice of hearing shall not affect in

any manner the validity of any proceeding taken or order issued under this section.

(d) Posting of notice. The fire code official shall ensure that a copy of the notice of hearing

and notice of violation is posted in a conspicuous place on the building or property, and at the location

of the hearing. The notice shall be posted at both locations at least 10 dais before the date set for the

hearing.
(e) [Reserved].

(f) Hearing. The fir;e code official or designee shall conduct a public hearing on the matter, at

the date, time and location speciﬁed in the notice of hearing. The fire code official or designee may

‘ continue the hearing for good cause, except that any continuance shall not exceed 30 days, and only

one continuance is allowed. Subject to any procedures prescribed by the fire code official for the

orderly conduct of the hearing, the fire code official may permit persons with an interest in the

building, occupancy, premises, or system, or with knowledge of facts material to the allegations of the.

notice of violation, to present evidence for the fire code official to consider. The fire code official shall

promulgate procedures for implementation of the hearing.

(g). Decision and Ordér, The fire code official shall give full and fair consideration 1o the.

evidence received at the hearing, and within 30 days of the conclusion of the hearing, shall issue a

written decision either: (1) finding no violation and issuing an Order of Rescission that withdraws the

notice of violation and dismisses the proceedings; or (2) finding that the building, occupancy, premises,

or system, or any portion thereof, is in violation of this code and issuing an Order to Abate. The order

shall state that the person responsible take action as ordered by the fire code official to briﬁg the

building, occupancy, premises, or.system into compliance with this code. The order may also include

an Qrder to Vacate directing the building, occupancy, or premises be vacated pending compliance with

the requirements of this code.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 31

87




—

s
it

Any Order to Abate da violation of this code or an Order to Vacate a building, occupancy or

premises shall include the following: the street address of the building, occupancy, premises, or system;

findings and conclusions about the specifics of the violations and the code section violated; a statement

of work the person responsible must perform to remedy the violation and, if applicable, an order to

vacate; and time requirements for compliance with the order. The fire code official shall require the

person responsible to commence work required under the order within not more than 30 days from the

date of the decision, and shall set a reasonable period of time, not to exceed six months from

commencement, for the person responsible to complete the required work.

"(h) Service of. posting, and recording decision. The fire code official shall serve the decision

and order on the persons and in the manner specified in subsection (c) above. The fire code official

shall post the decision and order in the manner specified in subsection (d) above. The fire code official

shall record the decision and order in the Assessor-Recorder’s Office.

(i) Extension. The person responsible may submit a written application to extend the date to

commence work required under the decision and order or to extend the date to complete required work.

The fire code official may grant a request to extend the time to commence oy to complete work, for

good cause shown, only where there is no imminent risk to life or property, and for a time not to exceed

90 days.

(i) Compliance, Order of Compliance. When the fire code official determines that the person :

responsible has completed all work required under the order, and that the building, occupancy,

premises, or sy&tem complies with the requirements of this code, the fire code official shall issue an

Order of Compliance, acknowledging that the person responsible has complied with the original order.

The fire code official shall serve and post the Order of Compliance, and file it in the Assessor-

Recorder’s Office after all associated fees, fines, and penalties have been paid.

(k) Penalties for disregarding order. Any person responsible who fails to comply with an Order

to Abate under this section shall be guilty of an rifraction as set forth in Section 110.6. Any_peréon who

Mayor Breed :
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 32

88




(@] <o) o] ~ » [9) B w nno—=

NN = ek ek b b el
X BRRBIE I a R R 3

removes any notice or order posted as required in this section shall be guilty of an infraction as

provided in Section 110.6.

Any person in possession who fails to comply with an Order to Vacate shall be guilty of a

misdemeanor as provided in Section 110.6.

All Orders to Abate and Orders to Vacate filed at the Assessor-Recorder’s Office shall be

referred to the City Attorney’s Office (CAT) for cvil action within 30 days after recording if work to

correct the violation has not commenced, or if the fire code official determines that the work to abate

the violation has not progressed.

110.4:3. 1. Administrative Hearing Referral Fee.

When the owner of the building, occupancy, premises, system, or vehicle fails to abate a

violation by the compliance date and the fire code official refers the matter for hearing, the department

shall charge a $130 administrative hearing referral fee for the processing of the Notice of

Administrative Hearing as per Section 110.4.3 (a)(b)(c) and the person responsible shall pay that fee.

110.4.3.2. Administrative Hearing Fee.

When the owner of the building, occupancy, premises, system, or vehicle fails to abate a

violation and the fire code official refers the matter for hearing and sets a date for the violation to be

heard before a hearing officer, the fire code official shall charge a $390 administrative hearing fee for

each Administrative Hearing where the violation is heard and the person responsible shall pay that fee.

110.4.3.3. Administrative Hearing Re-Inspection Fee.

When the hearing officer sets a date for violatiogzs to be corrected and verify compliance with

code requirements, the fire code official shall charge a $130 violation re-inspection fee for each re- -

 inspection and the person responsible shall pay that fee.

110.4.3.4. Allocation of Administrative Hearing Fees.

All administrative hearing and reinspection fees, including late payment fees, shall be payable

to the Fire Department and upon receipt by the Department, these associated revenues shall be

Mayor Breed - ' '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ) Page 33

89




—_

no
&)}

RS

deposited in a designated Bureau of Fire Prevention project account to support expenditures related to

community outreach, internal fire prevention personnel training, and other fire safety education and -

prevention programs.

110.4.4. Civil Action and Penalties.

Any person violating this code, or who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects or refuses to comply

with any notice of violation or decision and order under this code, shall be liable for a civil penalty of

up to $1,000 for each day the violation is committed or permitted to continue, in addition to attorney’s

fees and costs, which penalty shall be assessed and recovered in a civil action brought by the City and

County of San Francisco in any court of competent jurisdiction. In assessing the amount of the civil

penalty, the court shall consider any one or more of the relevant circumstances presented by any of the

parties to the case, including but not limited to, the following: the nature and seriousness of the

misconduct, the number of violations, the persistence of the misconduct, the length of time over which

the misconduct occurred, the willfulness of the defendant’s misconducL and the defendant’s assets,

liabilities and net worth. Any penalties imposed pursuant to this section shall be paid to the City other

remedies provided by law. No provision in this section shall preclude prosecution of actions for

‘crimina_l penalties concurrently, sequentially, or individually.

110.4.4.1. Allocation of Civil Penalty Fines.

All fines and late payment fees shall be payable to the Fire Department and upon receipt by the

Department, these associated revenues shall be deposited in a designated Bureau of Fire Prevention

project account to support expenditures related to community outreach, internal ﬁre prevention

personnel training, and other fire safety education and préventiqn programs.

110.4.5. Presumption of Noncompliance.

Notwithstanding any other provision of this code, any person served with a notice of violation

that sets a date to correct the violations shall be presumed, in civil proceedings, to have failed to

Mayor Breed . 1l
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : Page 34

90




—

B RRBEE S I o> N =

N
[&)]

comply with that notice of violation if the date to correct the violation has passed without correction of

the violation.

110.5. Administrative Citations.

Violations of this code may be punishable by administrative citation. Chapter 100 of the San

Francisco Administrative Code is herein incorporated in its entirety and shall povern the amount of

fees and the procedure for imposition, enforcement, collection and administrative review of

© © oo ~N o ¢ b W P

Ny
I~

_administrative citations under this section, except that the amount of the penalties for the code sections

set ‘in Section 110.5.2 shall be the amount specified in that section, and all fines shall be allocated as

' specified in Section 110.5.3.

110.5.1. City Employees Who May Issue Administrative Citations.

The City employees specified in Section 110.7 may issue administrative citations for any

violation of this code.

110.5.2. Fines for Administrative Citations for Specific Code Violations.

The fine for vielation of Sections 105.1.1, 108.6, 112.4, 901.8 and ]0311.2 shall be $1000.

110.5.3. Allocation of Administrative Citation Fines.

All administrative citation fines and late payment fees shall be payable to the Fire Department

and upon receipt by the Depariment, these associated revenues shall be deposited in a designated

Bureau of Fire Prevention project account to support expenditures related to community outreach,

internal fire prevention personnel training, and other fire safety education and prevention programs.

110.6. Criminal Penalties.

Pursuant to California Government Code Section 36900, any person who violates, disobeys,

omits, neglects, or refuses to comply with any of the provisions of this code or any lawful order issued -

under this code shall be guilty of an infraction or a misdemeanor. The fire code official shall determine,

and the citation shall specify, whether the violation charged is a misdemeanor or an infraction.

Mayor Breed .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 35

91




—

~t — s — -t — — — ke ' &

—
©

20

21
22

23

24
25

If charged as an infraction of a ciry building or safety code, the penalty shall be 1) a fine not to

exceed $130 for a first violation, 2) not to exceed $700 for a second violation of the same section or

‘subsection within one year of the date of the first violat_ion, and 3a) not to exceed $1,300 for each

additional violation of the same section or subsection within one year of the date of the first violation,

or 3b) a fine not exceeding $2,500 for each additional violation of the same ordinance within two years

of the first violation if the property is a commercial property that has an existing building at the time of

the violation and the violation is due to failure by the owner to remove visible refuse or failure to

prohibit unauthorized use of the property.

If charged as a misdemeanor, the penalty shall be a fine of not less than $500, or more than

$1,000, or imprisonment in the county jail not exceeding six (6) months, or both a fine and

Imprisonment, no part of which may be suspended. Every day such violation, disobedience, omission,

neglect or refusal continues is a new offense. Any person engaging in any work in violation of the

provisions of this code, and any person having charge of such work who permits it to be done, shall be

liable for the penalty provided.

- 110.6.1. Allocation of Criminal Penalty F ihes.

All criminal penalty fines, including late payment fees, shall be payable to the Fire Depariment

and upon receipt by the Department, these associated revenues shall be deposited in a designated

'Bureau of Fire Prevention project account to support expenditures related to community outreach,

internal fire prevention personnel training, and other fire safety education and prevention programs.

11 0 7. Designated Officers and Emplovyees.

Pursuant to California Penal Code Section 836.5, the classes of officers or employees of the

City and County of San Francisco listed below are empowered to enforce all provisions of this code

against violations.as a misdemeanor or infraction by exercising arrest and citation authority:

Mayor Breed ) .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ) Page 36

92




—t

o © W ~N o g~ W N

- C lassification No.

' Class Title

H-51

Assistant Deputy Chiezf]f

Assistant Chief

Assistant Fire Marshal

Battalion Chief

Captain Division of Fire Prevention and
Investigation

Captain

Lieutenant Bureau of Fire Investigation

Lieutenant Bureau of Fire Prevention.

Lieutenant

" Chief's Aide

Investigator

Fire Inspector

Fire Safety Inspector II

110.8. Civil Action to Recover Costs.

e

Under California Health and Safety Code Section 13009, any person who negligently, or in

violation of the law, sets a fire, allows a fire to be set, or allows a fire kindled or attended by him or her

to escape onto any public or private property is liable for the fire suppression costs incurred in fighting

the fire and for the cost of providing rescue or emergency medical services, and those costs shall be

charged against that person. The City and County of San Francisco may initiate a civil action in any

court of competent jurisdiction to recover all amounts authorized under Health and Safety Code

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

93

Page 37




b,

S U U G R VUE G ’ .

Section 13009 and Section 13009.1. Any amounts recovered shall be paid to the City Treasurer and

credited to the Fire Departmem‘.

110.9. Remedies are Non-Exclusive.

Notwithstanding the provisions of Sections 110.1 through 110.8, the City may institute civil

proceedings for injunctive and monetary relief. including civil penalties, against any person for

violations of the Fire Code under any circumstances, without regard to whether a complaint has been

filed or the fire official has issued a notice of violation under Section 110.4 or an order to correct

under Section 110.4.3(zg).

.. SECTION 112. ~ STOP WORK ORDER.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding. California Fire

Code section:

1124. [For SF] Failure to Comply.

Any person who continues any work after having been served with a stop work order, except

such work as that person is directed to perform to remove a violation or unsafe condition, shall be in

violation of this code.

SECTION 113. - SERVICE UTILITIES.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

113.1. [For SF] Authority to Disconnect Service Utilities.

The fire code official may order disconnection of utility service to a building, structure, or

" system in order to safely execute emergency operations or to eliminate an immediate hazard.

Mayor Breed . )
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS _ Page 38

94




—

- — —_ - -1 s — e Y :

SECTION 114. - FEE COLLECTION.

114. 1. Collection of Fees.

For services that are conducted before the collection of fees, the Department shall proceed in

accordance with this section.

114.1.1. First Notice.

When fees are due under Sections 106.7, 106.8, 106.13, or 106.14, the Department shall send

the responsible person a notice of payment due.

114.1.2. Seéond Notice.

If the Fire Department does not receive full payment within 60 days after it sent a notice of

payment due pursuant to Section 114.1.1, the Department shall sent a second notice of payment due to

the responsible person. That written notice shall state that the responsible person is liable for the

payment of the fee indicated on the notice and provide notice that if payment of the Fire Department

“does not receive the fee within 30 days of the mailing date of the second notice, a penalty of 10 percent

plus interest at the rate of one percent per month on the outstanding balance shall be added to the fee

indicated on the notice from the date that notice of payment due was sent under Section 106.

114.1.3. Report to Bureau of Delinguent Revénue Co_llection.

If the Department does not receive payment within 30 days following mailing of the second

notice, the Department may report all accounts receivable over $300 to the Bureau of Delinquent

Revenue Collection in accordance with San Francisco Administrative Code, Chapter 10, Article V.

" Accounts receivable under $300 shall be administered in accordance with Administrative Code Section

10.41-1.

Mayor Breed _ '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : Page 39

95




(@] [4e] o] ~ ()] 4] N w N —

ST ST S T 1 T S S U e

CHAPTER 2. - DEFINITIONS.

SECTION 202.

The following San Francisco Fire Code definition replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code definition in S ection 202:

[For SF] STANDPIPE SYSTEM, CLASSES OF. A standpipe system is g wet system of piping,

valves, outlets and related equipment designed to provide water at specified pressures and installed

exclusively for the Mtinggc fires, including the following:

Clas; 1 is a standpipe system equipped with 3-inch (76.2 mm) outlets.

Class Il is a standpipe system directly connected to a water supply and equipped with 1/4-inch

i 38:1 mm) outlets and hose.

Class Il is a standpipe system directly connected to a water supply and equipped with 3- inch

(76.2 mm.) outlets or 3-inch (76.2 'mm ) and 1%2-inch (38.1 mm) outlets when a 1Y5-inch (38.1 mm) hose

is required. Hose connections for Class IlI systems may be made throum_j’-inch (76.2 mm) hose valves

with easily removable 3-inch by 10-inch (76.2 mm by 38.1 mm) reducers. -

CHAPTER 3. - GENERAL PRECAUTIONS AGAINST FIRE.

. SECTION 308. - OPEN FLAMES.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section.

308.1.3. [For SF] Torches for Removing Paint,

The use of torches or other flame-producing devices to remove paint is prohibited.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

3 08.1 62 [For SF] Portable Fueled Open-Flame Devices.

Mayor Breed ) Co
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 40

96




o © o N o o b W Nd -

¥ R RRNE S a3 s 58 8

- Portable Qvez;—ﬂanze devices fueled by flammable or combustible gases or liquids shall be

enclosed or installed in such a manner as to prevent the flame from contacting combustible material,

Exceptions:

1. LP-gas-fueled devices used for sweating pipe joints in accordance with Chapter 61.

2. Hot work and cutting and welding operations in accordance with Chapter 35.

3. Candles and open-flame decorative devices in accordance with Section 308.3.

Section 308.2' bf the International Fire Code is deleted.

SECTION 316. — HAZARDS TO FIREFIGHTERS.

316.3.1. Barbed or Razor Wire.

Barbed or razor wire shall not be on or astached to any fire escape, dry standpipe or other fire

extinguishing facility, fence, parapet, roof surface, or any other place on a building or structure where

it might hinder or obstruct fireﬁghters in performing their duties. Where barbed or razor wire is on or

attached to any location, structure or surface specified in this section, it shall be removed.

Exception: Barbed or razor wire may be installed on fences provided it does not obstruct or

hinder egress, rescue operations, or access to hazardous areas, as determined by the fire code official,

in the event of fire or other emergency.

316.7. Sienage for Buildings with Certain Types of Construction.

If a building has roofs or floors of composite wood joist or truss construction, the owner shall

post a sign specifying this type of construction. The sign shall be located adjaceni to the main entrance

door or in a location(s) as required by the fire code official. The sign shall comply with San Francisco

Fire Department Administrative Bulletin 5.05.

Mayor Breed .

BOARD Of SUPERVISORS Page 41

97




—h

—_ — — —_ -t — — —_ — — ' .

g
ant
P—

CHAPTER 4. —- EMERGENCY PLANNING AND PREPAREDNESS.

SECTION 403.

Sections 403.1 through 403.11 bf the International F ire Code and California Fire Code are

deleted.

SECTION 404.

Sections 404.1 through 404.4.1 of the International Fire Code and California Fire Code are

deleted.

The following three San Francisco sections repldce the corresponding International Fire Code

sections.

404.1. [For SF] State of California Requirements.

Emergency plans and preparedness shall be provided in accordance with Title 19, California

- Code of Regulations, and California Health and Safety Code, Section 13220.

404.2. [For SF] Fire Safety Director.

Owners of buildings having floors used for human occupancy located more than 75 feet above

the lowest level of Fire Department access are responsible to provide or employ a fire safety director.

The fire safety director shall possess a current and valid certificate of completion of an approved fire

safety director training pro;fﬂ;ml A certificate of completion shall be valid for not more than five years.

404.3. [For SF] Emergency Procedures Information.

Emergency procedures information required by the California Code of Regulations, Title 19,

Section 3.09, shall comply with San Francisco Fire Department Administrative Bulletin 2.11.

SECTION 405. — [DELETED].

Section 405 of the International Fire Code is deleted.

Mayor Breed . . ) .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 42

98




c ©we oo N o o R o Nd

g'ﬁcmoknj—aocooo\xmm.bmm—b

SECTION 406. — [DELETED].

Section 406 of the International Fire Code is deleted. |

SECTION 408. — [RESERVED].

Section 408 is not found in either the California Fire Code or the International Fire Code.

SECTION 409. — FIRE SAFETY INFORMATION DISCLOSURE.

409.1. Purpose.

It 15 the purpose of Section 409 to reduce the risk of fires to residents by requiring owners of

buildings with three or more dwelling units to disclose fire safety information to new residents on or

before they begin to live in the building and once a year thereafter.

409.2. Disclosure Requirements.

" (a) The following information (the “Disclosire Information™) shall be disclosed in writing fo

each resident of an Apartment House as defined in the Housing Code:

1. The location of all fire extinguishers on the resident’s floor, and the dates of last

- servicing;

2. The location of all emergency exits on the resident’s floor, and a statement that

they must remain unobstructed;

3. The location of all fire escapes on the resident’s floor (if applic'abl;e);and the |

dates of last inspection;

4. The Zocation of the building fire alarm control panel and all manual pull stations

on the resident’s floor (if applicable);

5. The date when the building fire alarm system was last inspected and tested as -

reguired by Section 907.8.5 of this Code, and conﬁnnati’on that the building fire alarni

system is UL certi]icatéd under Section 907.7.4 of this Code, if applicable;

Mayor Breed :
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ’ Page 43

99




o © o N o g b~ WM -

CI};)EOJI\)—*O(DOU\JOBGADJ[\J—L

et
-

6. Instructions on how to confirm that the smoke alarms are in working condition,

and a statement of when the smoke alarms were last replaced;

7. Instructions on how to confirm that the carbon monoxide detectors are in

working condition, and a statement of when the carbon monoxide detectors were last

replaced; and

8. The phone number of the appropriate contact within the Fire Department for

reporting suspected violations of Section 409.

9. Instructions and website link to access the fire safety training video that the Fire

department shall post and maintain on the Internet; and

10. Instructions in English, Spanish, Chinese, and Filipino directing persons who

wish to view general fire safety guidance in any of these languages to do so on the Fire

Department’s official website and providing a link to this website. The Fire Department

shall post such general fire safety guidance on its official website not only in English but

also in Spanish, Chinese, and Filipino. Further, fo assist owners with providing the

required instruction in their Disclosure Information, the Fire Department shall post on

its website sample instructions in Spanish, Chinese, and Filipino, that owners may copy

and include in their Disclosure Information.

The Disclosure Information may also include any other information that would assist a resident

to escape or prevent a fire in the building.

(b) The owner of the Apartment House or the owner’s agent shall provide an oral explanation

of the Disclosure Information to new residents before the new residents commence occupancy in the

building, a written copy of the Disclosure Information to new residents on or before the commencement

of occupancy, and a written copy, updated as appropriate, to all building residents on or before

January 31 of each vear.

Mayor Breed, ‘ : .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : o Page 44

100



o N ot W N

©

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20

21

22
23
24
25

(¢) The owner of the Apartment House shall maintain a record of its compliance with this

Section 409.2 by retaining a copy of the Disclosure Information for at least two vears. An owner’s

failure to maintain such records shall create a rebuttable presumption that the owner has violated this’

"BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

Section 409.2.

409.3. Posting Requirements,

(a) A sign or sticker shall be affixed at the main point of entry to the Apartment House, or at

such other location that the Fire Marshal approves in writing, that contains the phone number of the

owner, property manager, or other person who can give the Fire Department or other building *

Inspecior prompt access 1o the building to conduci safely inspeciions.

Lb) The Department of Building Inspection shall enforce this Section 409.3 pursuant to periodic

health and safety inspections required by code.

409.4. Printing Requirements.

The Disclosure Information [Section 409.2] shall be provided in writing. If provided in hard

copy, it shall be printed on white paper, 8.5” x 11" (216mm x 2797'7117@ or larger, in no simaller that 10-
point font.

409.5. Penalties and Enforcement.

Tﬁe Chief of the Fire Department (which includes, for purposes of this Section 409.5, the

Chief’s designee) shall be responsible for enforcement of the provisions of Section 409.

(a) The Fire Chief shall issue a written notice of violation to an owner the Chief determines is

in violation of Section 409. Violators shall have 30 days from the date of such warnings to correct

violation(s)..

(b) Where a violation has not been corrected after 30 days from the date of issuance of a

warning, the Fire Chief may assess and collect administrative penalties from the owner for any

violation of Section 409 in accordance with Administrative Code Chapter 100, “Procedures Governing

the Imposition of Administrative Fines,” as may be amended from time to time. Chapter 100, which is

Mayor Breed
Page 45

101




—_

incorporated herein in its entirety, shall govern the amount of fees and the procedures for imposition,

enforcement, collection, and administrative review of administrative citations. Each violation of a

provision. of Section 409 shall constitute a separate violation for purposes of Chapter 100,

CHAPTER 5. - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES.

SECTION 503. — FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS.

Section 503 of the International Fire Code is adopted. '

The Following San Francisco section replaces the corresponding Intemationdl Fire Code

Section.:

503.2.1. [For SF] Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width

of not less than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in

accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet 6 inches

(4115 mm). The Fire Department may review projects impacting street width, and may request greater

minimum unobstructed street width or unobstructed vertical clearance on a case-by-case basis.

The Following San Francisco section replaces the corresponding International Fire Code

Section.:

- 503.4. [For SF] 05struction of Fire Apparatus Access Roads.

Fire apparatus access roads shall not be obstructed in any manner, including the parking of

vehicles. Sitbject to Health and Safety Code Sections 13104, 13108, 13114, 1 894] .5..and California

Fire Code Sections 1.11.2, 104.1 and 503, the portion of the sidewalk or median, immediately adjoining

and extending into a roadway that has no utility pole, street light, street furniture, fire hydrani, trees,

shrubbery, or other structure or natural growth attached thereto and that has a height that does not

exceed six inches above the roadway shall not constitute an obstruction of a fire apparatus access road.

The minimum widths and clearances established in Section 503.2.1 shall be maintained at all times. All

Mayor Breed :
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ‘ Page 46

102



00\1'07'0'1&@1\3

<o}

10
1
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

projects impacting the width of a fire apparatus access road shall be subject to review by the Fire

.Department,

Section 503.4.1 of the International Fire Code is deleted.

SECTION 504. - ACCESS TO BUILDING OPENINGS AND ROOFS.

504.2.1. Breakable Window Marking.

Red reflectors shall be installed to indicate the location of existing breakable, tempered glass

[ S TN I SRR ST SN, WPy SUNOUNISCIICS JU NS I LI T oot lome
windows reguired under previous codes. Reflectors inside buildings shall be at least

mm) in the least dime_nsion. They shall be on the glass and within 6 inches (1524 mm) of a lower corner

of the pane. Reﬂectorsv outside buildings shall be at least 3 inches (762 mm) in the least dimension.

- They shall be placed on the wall below the lowest window in edch vertical line of windows containing

tempered glass. A 24-inch (609 mm) clear space shall be maintained around the reflectors.

504.3.1. Access to Roofs with Doors and Hatches.

Doors and hatches to a roof must be able to be opened from the inside without the use of a key,

_code or dny special knowledge.

Exceptions:

1. _Doors that can be unlocked upon a signal from a central control station or other unlocking

system approved by the fire code official. Upon failure of electrical power, the locking mechanisms '

shall retract to the unlocked position.

2. Doors may be locked when approved by the fire code official.

504.5. Identification on Steel Doors.

When rolling steel shutters or similar steel doors are located on any building or structure and

there is no easily accessible opening giving access to the building or structure within 25 feet (7620 mm

of the shutter or door, an approved marking shall be affixed on the shutter or door desi,qnating_or

Mayor Breed ]
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS A Page 47

103




e

N '[’\) N N — . — — —_ —_ - e — —

© outlining an area which, when removed by burning or cutting, will give access to locking devices,

hoisting chains or other devices that control the operation of the shutter or door. .

SECTION 506. — KEY BOXES.

506.2.1, Key Box In;?tallation and Maintenance.

Kevy boxes shall be installed and maintained in accordance with San Francisco Fire Department

Administrative Bulletin 5.09.

SECTION 507. — FIRE PROTECTION WATER SUPPLIES.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

507.4. [For SF] Water Flow and Supply Information.

The Fire Department will provide water flow and supply information when requested by the

applicant. The Depariment shall assess fees for this service as stated in Section 106.12.

507.5.3.1. Clear space around underground emergency water supply tanks.

A S-foot (1 524 mm) clear space shall be maintained around the circumference of cistern

openings, except as otherwise required or approved. Access openings shall be on the same surface level

of cistern.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

" Code section:

507.5.5. [For SF] Clear space around hydrants

A 5-foot (1524 mm) clear space shall be maintained around the circumference of fire hydrants,

except as otherwise required or approved.

Mayor Breed : ‘ .
BQARD OF SUPERVISORS : : Page 48

104




mw ~N o g s W N =

<@}

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17

18
19

20~

21
22
23
24
25

p—

507.6. Other Water Supplies.

Water tanks or pools within, on or about any building premises shall be connected with

approved 6-inch (152 mm) pipe leading from the bottom of the tank to a point designated by the fire

code official. Piping for tanks located at or below grade shall be designed and installed for drafting by

Fire Department apparatus.

Exceptions:

1. Industrial process water tanks.

2. Tanks or pools with a capacity of less than 75,000 gallons (4.6 m3).

3. Tanks or pools used to supply automatic fire sprinkler systems.

4, Water tanks or pools installed in R3 Occupancies.

507.7. Auxiliary Water Supply System.

The requirements for the installation and modification of the Auxiliary Water Supply System

shall comply with the San Francisco Subdivision Code and any requirements of the San Francisco .

Public Utilities Commission.

SECTION 508. — FIRE COMMAND CENTER.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

508.1.2. [For SF] Separation.

The fire command center shall be separated from the remainder of the building by not less than

a 2-hour fire barrier constructed in accordance with Section 707 of the California Building Code or

horizontal assembly constructed in accordance with Section 711 of the California Buildin,é Code, or

both.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 49

105




—k

g A~ W ON = O O N g P~ W N -

] © o . N o o0 b~ W N

508.1.6.1. Local Additional Features.

The fire command center shall contain the following additional features:

1. The stock of spare sprinklers required by NFPA 13 (2016).

2. Permanent signage with the name and telephone number of the applicable elevator service

comparny.

Building contact phone numbers.

Utility shut-off location map.

Public address system instructions.

- Sprinkler shut-off valve and standpipe isolation valve locations.

3
4
o)
6. Smoke control‘system procedures.
7.
8

- Emergpency evacuation/relocation procedures, location of tenant areas of refuge, and

location of any tenants requiring evacuation assistance.

9. Hazardous materials inventory statement and management plan, when required by the fire
code official.

10. Approved fire alarm operational matrix.

. 508.1.8. lWater Protection

The fire command center shall have watertight construction to prevent water intrusion from fire

sprinkler discharge and/or firefighting water on floors above the fire command center.

SECTION 510. - EMERGENCY RESPONDER RADIO COVERAGE.

- 510.1.1. Local Standard for Emergency Responder Radio Coverage.

The applicable standard for the design, installation, testing, maintenance and use of Emergency

Responders Radio Converge systems shall be NFPA 1221-2016 Sections 5.10 and 9.6 and SFFD

Administrative Bulletin 2.01.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISCORS . Page 50

106




—

MR RNBENDE S YN0 © ® N R ®N

SECTION 511. - LOCAL FIRE SAFETY FEATURE REQUIREMENTS.

511.1. Local § tanddrds for High-Rise Buildings and Tunnels.

Except as stated in the next pamﬂ*aph an approved air replenishment system shall be installed

in all buildings having floors used for human occupancy located more than 75 feet (22 860 mm ) above

the lowest level of Fire Department vehicle access. This requirement shall apply for all buildings

meeting this definition when the building permit application for construction was made after March 30,

2004,

Exception: All buildings that are covered by this section but that are equipped with a fire

~ service access elevator (FSAE) pursuant to California Building Code Seciion 3007 ure noi_required to

install an air replenishment system.

The air replenishiment system will provide a means for firefighters to refill air bottles for self-

contained breathing appa)‘atus (SCBA) through a permanently installed piping distribution system. The

system shall be tested and maintained in accordance with San Francisco Fire Department

Adminisirative Bulletin 5.07.

. The air replenishment system may be installed in all new underground transportation or

pedestrian tunnels eiceeding 300 feet (91 440 mm,).

CHAPTER 6. — BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS.

SECTION 606. ~ ELEVATOR RECALL AND MAINTENANCE.

606.9. Maintenance of Elevators.

At least one passenger elevator shall be maintained in working order and accessible for

immediate use by the Fire Department at all times.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : . Page 51

107




—h

o © os] ~N o 631 B w N

R

o

CHAPTER 9. — FIRE-PROTECTION SYSTEMS.

SECTION 901. — GENERAL.

901.8.3. Subsurface Construction.

Any person performing any subsurface work in close proximity or adjacent to any valve, gate,

hydrant, main, street cistern, or other part of the auxiliary water supply system (high pressure systeimn),

any hydrant, kydrant pipin,q, or hiidrant gate valve connected to the mains of the San Francisco Water

Depai tment shall comply with all Fire Department 7egulatzons and speczﬁcatlons which are on file

" with the Department of Public Works Bureau of Engineering.

SECTION 902. — DEFINITIONS.

The following définition shall be added to Section 902.1 of the California Fire Code:

[For SF] CERTIFICATED FIRE ALARM SYSTEM is a fire alarm system for which a serially

numbered certificate has been issued to the property owner by an organization that is part of the

. Occupational Safety and Health Administration Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory Program.

The certificate is a tool for assuring the reliability of fire alarm systems and is the alarm company's

declaration that the system will be installed, maintained, tested and monitored in accordance with the

applicable codes and standards. San Francisco Fire Department Administrative Bulletin 3.03 contains

details of the fire alarm certification program.

SECTION ?03. — AUTOMATIC SPRINKLER SYSTEMS. -
Table 903.2.11.6. Add anew line to the Table as follows:

TABLE 903 2.11. 6 ADDITIONAL REQUIRED FIRE SUPPRESSION SYSTEMS

SECTI ON__ SUBJECT

3202.3.4 Pedestrian Walkways over Public Streets

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

108

Page 52




—

listed above conducted by persons or companies known not to hold the required license. Employees of

903.3.6.1. Fire Department Hose Connection Type.

Fire Department Connections (FDC) shall have 3-inch national standard hose threads.

903.3.10. Installation Personnel Qualifications.

Contractors and personnel installing life safety equipment in San Francisco including, but not

limited to, sprinkler systems, standpipes, and other automatic extinguishing systems must possess a

valid current C-16 (fire protection) contractor license issued by the California Contractors State

License Board (CA-CSLB). The SFFD does not approve or accept work of the types listed above

conducted by persons or companies known not to hold the required license. Emplovyees of companies

hired to work on these life safety systems are also required to maintain a valid current Fire Sprinkler

Fitter Certificate (sprinkler/standpipes) issued by the CA Ofﬁce of the State Fire Marshal (CAL-
OSFM).

903.5.1. Testing, and Maintenance Personnel Qualifications.

Contractors and personnel testing, maintaining, or repairing life safety equipment in San

Francisco, including, but not limited to, sprinkler systems, standpipes, or other automatic extinguishing

systems, must possess a valid current C-16 (fire protection) contractor license issued by the California

Contractors State License Board (CA-CSLB). The SFFD does not approve or accept work of the types

companies hired to work on these life safety systems are also required to maintain a valid current Fire

Sprinkler Fitter Certificate (sprinkler/standpipes) issued by the CA Office of the State Fire Marshal
(CAL-OSFM).

SECTION 904. - ALTERNATIVE AUTOMATIC FIRE-EXTINGUISHING SYSTEMS.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the carmsponding California Fire

Code section:

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 53

109



-

904.12.5.2. [For SF] Extinguishing System Service.

Automatic fire-extinguishing systems shall be serviced at least every 6 months and after

activation of the system. Inspection shall be by qualified individuals per Section 903.5.1, and the owner

shall maintain the certificate of inspection on site for at least I vear following the inspection.

SECTION 905. — STANDPIPE SYSTEMS.

905.2.1. Local Installation Standard.

Standpipe systems shall be installed using 3-inch (76.2 mm ) ﬁational sfandard hosev thread.

' Each standpipe outlet shall be placed to provide a minimum of six inches on all sides of the handle and

18 inches on all sides of the outlet or located as approved by the fire code official.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

905.3.4. [For SF] Stages.’

Stages greater than 1,000 square feet in area (93 m2) sﬁall be equipped with a Class I1I wet

standpipe system with 1-1/2-inch and 3-inch (38 mm and 76.2 mum) hose connections on each side of

the stage.

905.3.12. Buildings with Limited Fire Department Access.

Horizontal and/or vertical Class I standpipes shall be installed and maintained in any building,

regardless of height, in which, in the opinion of the fire code official, standpipes are necessary to make

hose connections available to firefighters.

The following part of the San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding part of

the California Fire Code sectionf

Mayor Breed . . )
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : ' Page 54

110




Cd\lCD(.ﬂ-POJI\)

(o]

11
12
18
14
15

16

17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

905.4. [For SF] Location of Class I Standpipé Hose Connections.

1. In every required stairway, a hose connection shall be provided for each story above or .

below grade. Hose connections shall be located at an intermediate landing between stories, unless

otherwise apprdved by the fire code official, See Section 909.20.2.3 bf the California Bﬁilding Code for

additional provisions on smokeproof enclosures.

905.4.3. Loca_l Requirement for Location of Class I Staﬁdpipe Hose Connections.

There shall be at least one iwo-way ouilet above the roofline when the roof hus v slope of less

than 4 units ve('tical in 12 units horizontal (33.3% slope).

SECTION 907. — FIRE ALARM AND DETECTION SYSTEMS.

907.1.6. Installation Personnel Qualifications.

Contractors installing any life safety equipment in San Francisco including, but not limited to,

fire alarms, elevator recall systems, and sprinkler monitoring systens, must possess a valid current C-

10 (electrical) contractor license issued by ﬂze California Contractors State License Board (CA-CSLB).

The SEFD does not approve or accept work of the types listed above conducted by persons or

companies known not to hold thgz required license. Employees of companies hired to work on life safety

Systems are required to maintain a valid current Electrician Certificate (fire alarms) issued by the CA

Department of Industrial Relations (CA-DIR).

The following parts of the San Francisco Fire Code section replace the corresponding parts of

the California Fire Code seqtion.‘

907.2.9.1 [For SF] Manual fire alarn: system.

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 55

111



—

o © oo N o ok W N

e

3. The building contains more than 6 dwelling units or sleeping units.

4. Congregate living facilities or congregate residences three or more stories in height or

having an-occupant load of 11 or more.

 Exceptions:

[ S I

907.2.10.9. Smoke Alarm Information Disclosure.

(a) Annual Smoke Alarm Information Notice. On or before January 31, 20]‘7; dnd on or befgré

January 31 of each vear thereafter, owners of a dwelling unit intended for human occupancy in which

one_or more units is rented or leased shall provide each tenant with a written notice regarding smoke.

alarm requirements on a form provided by the Fire Department. The Fire Department shall develop the]

notice in consultation with the Department of Building Inspection and shall make the notice available

on its website in English, Spanish, and Chinese. Th_e Fire Department shall update the notice as

necessary from fime 1o time to reflect changes in the law, and the owner shall provide the most recent

notice to tenants. The notice shall include, but not be.limited to, the following information:

(1) information regarding the importance of maintaining smoke alarms in working

condition for life safety;

(2] a brief summary of legal requirements for smoke alarms in dwelling units;

(3) a statement that the landlord is ébli,qated to provide operable smoke alarms in ﬂod

working condition in the dwelling unit in accordance with the Housing Code and Fire

Code and the landlord must promptly repair or replace inoperable smoke alarms upon -

request; and

(4) attached as a separate appendix o the notice, a list, to be prepared by the Rent

Board, of tenants’ rights organizations that provide counseling 1o tenants on issues

related to fires, and contact information [or those organizations. -

Mayor Breed ‘
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 5§

112




Y

. ‘Nm___‘__k,_;_;_.\._&.—k_x._L——L

—
[N—

(b) Posting Reqguirement. For all Apartment Houses as defined in the Housing Code, the

building owner shall post the notice referenced in subsection (a) in at least one conspicuous location in

a common area of each floor of the building.

907.5.2.2.6. Local Reguirements for Emergency Voice Alarm-Communication Svstem.

Multi-channel capability is required for new emergency voice/alarm communication systems in

hvigh—rise buildings.

907.6.4.1.2.- Local Annunciation Requirement.

Building fire alarm systems shall include visible annunciation in buildings with more than four

floors, or when required by the fire code official. Visible annunciation shall be a lighi-emitiing diode

o © @ N o o W N

(LED) type display. The annunciator panel shall indicate the type of device by floor, zone or other

approved designation from which the signal originated,

907.6.4.1.3. Graphic Annunciation.

Graphic annunciation shall be installed when required by the fire code official.

The following part of the San Francisco Fire Code section is added fo the corresponding

California Fire Code section.:

907.6.4.3. [For SF] High-Rise Buildin,q Fire Alarm Alillﬂnciation.

6. Status of emergency equipment such as the emergency generator, fire pump, and secondary

‘water supply. Shall comply with San Francisco Fire Department Administrative Bulletin 3.01,

907.7.4. Fire Alarm Certification Reguired.

All new fire alarm systems' shall be certificated. Fire alarm systems providing service that

complies with all requirements of this code shall be certificated by an organization that is bart of the

Occupational Safety and Health Administration Nationally Recognized Testing Laboratory Program. A

Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 57

113



P

i N —_ — —_ — —_ Y — —x — -t a ’ ’

N
(651

R—

document attesting to the certification shall be located on or near the fire alarm System control unit or,

if no control unit exists, on or near a fire alarm system component.

Exceptions:

1. Household fire-warning systems a_;;d fire alarm systems in one- or two-family dwellings or

three-unit apartment houses.

2. Fire alarm control panels whose primary function is to monitor a sprinkler system.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California F ire

Code section.

907.8.5. [For SF] Inspection, Testing, and Maintenance.

(a) Testing, Inspection and Filing Requirements. The building owner is responsible to maintain

the fire and life safety systems in an operable condition at all times. The building owner must have the

system(s) tested and inspected every year by service personnel who meet the qualification requirements

of Section 907.8.8 and NFPA 72, as amended from time to time, for maintaining, inspecting, and testing
of the systems.

(1) Filing Statement of Compliance. With regard to fire alarm systems in Apartment

Houses, as defined in the Housing Code, the building owner shall file a Statement of

Compliance with this annual testing and inspection requirement with the Fire

Department, on a form provided by the Fire Department, in accordance with the

following schedule: (A) for buildings with nine or more units, on or before January 31,

2017. and thereafter on or before January 31 of each odd-numbered yvear, and(B) for

buildings with less than 9 nine units, on or before January 31, 2018, and thereafter on

or before January 31 of each even- numbered year. The Fire Departinent shall consult”

" with the Department of Building Inspection in developing the Statement of Compliance

form. The Fire Department shall post all Statements of Compliance it receives on a City

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 5§

114



oo\xm‘m-b-wm

<o}

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

7
R

website maintained by the Fire Department no later than 60 days from January 31 each

!

year.

(2) Posting Statement of Compliance in Common Area. In addition to filing the

Statement of Compliance, the building owner shall post a copy of the most recently filed

Statement of Compliance in at least one conspicuous location in a common area of each

floor of the building or, if no such common area{s) exist, the building owner shall

provide a copy to each residential tenant in the.building. The building owner shall

comply with this requirement no later than 60 days from the date-of filing of the

(3) Enforcement. For purposes of enforcement of this subsection (a), the Fire

Department shall be responsible only for posting the Statement of Compliqnce forms on

the City website, and the Fire Department and/or the Department of Building Inspection

shall respond to any complaint received by the respective department pertaining to

.compliance with this subsection in the case of the Fire Department, or compliance with

Section 908 of the Housing Code in the case of the Department of Building Inspection.

The Departments may.also enforce these requirements pursuant to periodic health and

safety inspections required by code.

(b) Recordkeeping. The building owner shall maintain written records of inspection and testing,

as specified in NFPA 72, as amended from time to time, until the next test and for one vear thereafter.

(c) Sticker. The building owner shall place, or shall cause service personnel to place, a sticker

on the exterior of the fire alarin control panel cover that includes the company name, phone number,

Cl0 license number, the type of last inspection or test, technician name (printed and legible), and the

date of service:

907.8.6. Certificated F ife Alayin Systems for Existing Buildings.

May‘or Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 59

115



ke

I\ N N - - —_ - — — - —_ —

e
o

Existing buildings are required to have certificated fire alarm systems in accordance with

Section 1103.7.10,

907.8.7. Reporting of Fire Alann System Operational Matrix.

All fire alarm inspection and tes(ing reports for high-rise buildings shall clearly state how the

fire alarm system’s matrix was designed and approved to operate. The report shall indicate if the

O O W N o o~ W oN

system Ls de;signed as a Full Evacuation System (all floors are notified and shall evacuate), a Partial

Evacuation System {only some floors are notified of the alarm and must evacuate), or as a Relocation

Svstem (only some floors are notified and asked to relocate to another floor within the same building).

The report shall indicate which floors are designed for the full evacuation of occupants and on which

floors the occupants shall relocate to another floor.

. 907.8.8. In_;vpection, Testing, and Maintenance Personnel Qualifications.

Personnel inspecting, repairing, or testing any life safety equipment in San Francisco including,

but not limited to, fire alarms, elevator recall systems, and sprinkler monitoring systems, st possess

a valid current C-10 (electrical) contractor license issued by the California Contractors State License

Board (CA-CSLB). The SFFD does not approve or accept work of the types listed above conducted by

persons or companies known not to hold the required license. Employees: of companies hired to work

on life safety Systems are also required to maintain a valid current ElectricianvCe}’tificate (fire alarms)

issued by the CA Department of Industrial Relations (CA-DIR)

SECTION 912. — FIRE DEPARTMENT CONNECTIONS.

912.8. Number of connections required.

Sprinkler systems requiring a 4-inch (101.6 immm) or larger water service shall have two or more

inlet connections as necessary to meet hydraulic demand.

Mayor Breed ' ,
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ' ' ‘ Page 60

116



o N o o s W N

w

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17
- 18-

19
20
21
22
23
24
25

SECTION 913. — FIRE PUMPS.

913.2.3. Integrity of the fire pump room.

The integrity of the fire pump room shall not be compromised, All non-fire pump related

equipment, piping, drains, electrical equipment, and electrical services shall not be routed through or

located within the fire pump room. Examples include, but are not limited to:

1. Non-fire water system piping

2. Domestic water equipment and piping

3. Drain piping

4 HVAC ecouinment
. AL equlpmen.

5. Boilers or funaces, fuel equipment, and piping (unless feeding a diesel fire pump motor)

6. Electrical equipment and service {e.g. transformers and switchgear)

SECTION 914. — FIRE PROTECTION BASED ON SPECIAL DETAILED

REOUIREMENTS OF USE AND OCCUPANCY.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding Califorinia Fire

Code section:

914.3.1.1. [F 0}' SF] Number of Sprinkler System Risers and System Design.

-Each zone of any Sprinkler system shall connect fo at least two risers on each floor. Hydraulic -

calculations shall be based solely on the riser with the greatest hydraulic demand.

A 914.3.1.2.2. Fire pump drives.

The drive for each pump (including power sources, power supply lines, motors or engines, fuel

supplies, and controllers) shall be independent of the drive for any other pump.

91 4.3.] .3._ Fire Departiment Connections.

- Mayor Breed

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ’ Page 61

117




—

N —_ — — — —_ —te — — e —L '
g § (.NO % B o o ow ~ (o)] g W N - O 0 . N D o~ w N

R—

A Fire Department connection shall be located on each side of a building that fronts a street,

and shall provide four inlets for each connection.

914.3.2.1. Integrity of fire water storage tank.

The integrity of any fire water storage tank shall not be compromised. Any non-fire water

related system piping, electrical wiring, or drain piping shall not be routed through or located within a

fire water storage tank. Examples include, but are not limited to:

1. . Domestic water lines
2. Sanitary sewer lines
3. Electrical conduit

914.3.2.2. Tank overflow line and drain line routing.

Any tank overflow line or drain line shall be routed to a remote drain that is designed to handle

the maximum flow without flooding or damaging the fire pump room, its equipment, or any other room |.

in the building. The routing shall not be located in a fire pump room.

914.3.2.2.1. Drain ejector pumps (Sump Pumps).

Druain ejector pumps shall be permitted to manage fire water tank overflow. Ejector pumps are

only to be used when gravity drainage is not available (CPC 709.1). Where overflow lines route to a

drain-ejector pump, the following shall apply:

1. Redundant or backup drain ejector pump(s) shall be provided.

2. All drain ejector pumps shall be installed in a remote location approved by the Fire

Department and shall not be located inside or near a fire pump room.

3. All drain ejector pumps shall be sized and rated for the maximum fill ﬂbw rate of the

water tank,

4. Al drain ejector pumps shall be provided with approved emergency/standby power.

S, All drain ejector pumps shall discharge to a safe location that will not subject any portion

of the building to flooding.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : Page 62

118



——h

o m ~N O ;A W N

R

914.12, Piers.

Group A and F occupancies located on piers of combustible construction shall be protected by

approved automatic sprinkler systems.

CHAPTER 10. - MEANS OF EGRESS.
SECTION 1010. DOORS, GATES AND TURNSTILES.

The following part of the San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding part of

the California Fire Code section:

1010.1.2. [For SF] Door Swing.

* 3k k %k

Exception 6:

In other than Group A, E, H, I, R, and high-rise building occupancies, special purpose

‘ horizontal sliding, accordion, or folding door assemblies complying with Section 1010.1.4.3.

* ok ok ok

The following part of the San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding part of

the California Fire Code section:

1010.1.4.3. [For SF] Special Purpose Horizontal Sliding Door,Accordioﬁ, or Folding Doors.

In other than Group A, E, H, I, R, and high-rise building occupancies, special purpose

horizontal sliding, accordion, or folding door assemblies permitted fo be a component of a means of

egress in accordance with Exception 6 of Section 1010.1.2 shall comply with all of the following
criteria:

¥ ok % ok

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ) Page 63

119




© o ~N O o A~ oW N =

SECTION 1013. — EXIT SIGNS.

The following part of the San Francisco Fire Code section adds to the corresponding California

Fire Code section.

1013.1. [For SF] Where required.

%k sk %k ok

Exceptions:

* % ok 3k

6. Doorways or other openings leading to a fire escape, except within individual dwelling

upits, shall be provided 'with a sign reading “FIRE ESCAPE? in Zettérs not less than 6 inches (152 mm)

high, in high contrast with the background.

SECTION 1030. - EMERGENCY ESCAPE AND RESCUE.

1030.1.2. Direct Access to Public Way.

When buildings are constructed on lot lines, an emergency escape and rescue egress may pass

through the building via an exit passageway {per SFFC Section 1024 ) with approval from the AH]J,

" The exit passageway shall be an independent exit access path 1o the public way from the building units.

SECTION 1031. - MAINTENANCE OF THE MEANS OF EGRESS.
1031.2.3. Fire Escape Obstructions.

Fire escapes and related balconies, ladders, landings, and operating devices shall not be

obstructed in any manner. No object shall be stored on or attached to a fire escape without the

approval of the fire code official. Fire escapes shall not be located beyond a locked door or room that

restricts immediate access to the fire escape from the corridor.

Mayor Breed - v
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS _ Page 64

120



o ~N o o A~ W N

o

10
11
12
13
14
15

16 .

17

- 18

19
20

22
23
24
25

Exception.: These restrictions shall not apply to a building in which every dwelling or

commercial space within the building has immediate access to a fire escape without exiting the

dwelling or space and entering the corridor.

CHAPTER 11. — CONSTRUCTION REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS.
SECTION 1101. ~ [DELETED].

Section 1101 of the International Fire Code is deleted. v

Section 1102 of the International Fire Code is deleted,

SECTION 1103. - FIRE SAFETY REQUIREMENTS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS.

Se_ctibns 1103.1 through 1103.1.1 of the International Fire Code are deleted.

Sections 1103.3 through 1103.4.10 of the International Fire Code are deleted.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

1103.5. [For SF] Sprinkler Systems.

An automatic sprinkler system shall be provided and maintained in accordance with Sections

1103.5.1, 1103.5.2, and 1103.5.3.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section.

1103.5.1. [For SF] Automatic Sprinkler System for Existing SRO Hotel Buildin,qs: .

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS v Page 65

121




b

N NN = = e el et A A
B RBEBRERBEB TSI R e 0 =

o © o N o o A~ »w N

oz
E—

Every residential hotel building existing on October 16, 2001, that contains twenty (20) or more

guest rooms, as defined.in the California Building Code, shall provide and maintain an automatic

éprinkler system installed to comply with San Francisco Ordinance 170-02 throughout the residential

occupancy, including accessory areas. For purposes of this section, “Residential Hotel” means each

and every hotel for which a Certificate of Use for any residential units has been issued pursuant to San

Francisco Administrative Code Chapter 41. Any Residential Hotel that does not maintain an installed

automatic sprinkler system throughout the residential occupancy is out of compliance and subject to

immediate code enforcement action. The owner shall maintain the sprinkler system in accordance with

Title 19 of the California Code of Regulations.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

1103.5.2. [For SF] Automatic Sprinkler System for Existing High-Rise Buildings.

All existing high-rise buildings shall maintain an automatic sprinkler systems installed to

comply with San Francisco Ordinance 377-93.

Exceptions:
1. | Oualified historical buildings as defined in the California Health and Safety Code Section
18950.,

2. Apartment houses, condominiums, or other R-2 Occupancies.

3. A mixed-use occupancy building containing an R-2 Occupancy.

Any existing high-rise not exempted from this section that does not provide an automatic

sprinkler system throughout the residential occuparncy is out of compliance and subject to immediate

code enforcement action. The owner shall maintain the sprinkler system in accordance with Title 19 of

the California Code of Regulations.

Mayor Breed - o
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ] ‘ - Page 68

122




o]

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

o N o0 o s W N

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

1103.5.3. [For SF] Automatic Sprinkler System for Exis‘ting Hotels.

All hotels described in San Francisco Ordinance 319-86 shall maintain an automatic sprinkler

system installed to comply with San Francisco Ordinance 319-86 throughout all common areas of the

hotel. Any existing hotel that does not provide an aufomatic sprinkler system in accordance with the

ordinance is out of compliance and subject to immediate code enforcement action. The owner shall

maintain the sprinkler system in accordance with Title 19 of the California Code of Regulations.

Section 1103.7.1 and 1103.7.2 of the International Fire Code are deleted.

Sections 1103.7.4 through 1103.7.5.2.1 of the International Fire Code are deleted.

1103.7.6.1. Sleeping Area Requirements.

For all buildings that are required to have a fire alarm system under this Code Section

1103.7.6, beﬂaining to Group R-2 occupancies, the Building Code, the Housing Code, or any other

law, the building owner shall upgrade the fire qlarm  system, if necessary, to comply with the sound

level requirement for sleeping areas set forth in Section 18.4.5.1 of NFPA 72 (2013 edition), as

amended from time to time, upon either (a) completion of work under a building permit with g cost of

construction of $50,000 or more, (b) July 1, 2021, or (c) for buildings sold or transferred after

September 1. 2017, twelve months after the sale of the property, whichever occurs first.

- Exceptions. Division 1103. 7. 6.1 (a) shall not apply to mandatory seismic strengthening

alterations being performed pursuant 1o Chapter 4D of the Existing Building Code. This subsection

1103.7.6.1 applies only to Group R-2 occupancies.

1103.7.1 0._ Certificated Fire Alarm Systems for Existing Buildings.

Mayor Breed .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . ' ' Page 67

123




O ©® ® ~N o o b @ N

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25

-

The fire code official may require owners to obtain a certificate for existing fire alarm systems

based on severity of life safety hazards or problems identified with a system. Occupancies required to

install certificated fire alarm systems are as follows:

1. Tourist and residential hotels with twenty (20) or more guest rooms or three. (3} or more

stories in height,

2. Apartment houses with sixteen (16) or more units.

3. Public assembly occupancies with an occupant load of 300 or more persons.

4. _Day care facilities with fifty (50) or more occupants.

SECTION 1104. — MEANS OF EGRESS FOR EXISTING BUILDINGS

Sections 1104 through 1104.15 and 11 04 17 through 1104.25 of the International Fire Code are

| . deleted.

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding International Fire

Code section:

1104.16.5. [For SF] Materials and Strength.

Cbmponents of fire escape Stairways shall be constructed of non-combustible materials. Fire

escape stairways and balconies shall support the dead load plus a live load as per design when

installed. If the original structural design calculations are unavailable, then a registered design

professional shall determine the structural adequacy of existing fire escape stairways and balconies.

The following. San Francisco Fire Code section replaées the corresponding International Fire

Code section.

1104.16.5.1. [For SF] Examination.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 68

124




o ~N oo oo BN

10.

11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21

- 22

23
24

25

All fire escape stairways and balconies shall be examined for structural adequacy and safety in

accordance with Section 1104.16.5 by a registered design professional or others acceptable to the fire

code official every 5 years, or more frequently as requested by the fire code official. The inspection

report shall be maintained on site and shall be made immediately available for review upon request by

the fire code official.

SECTION 1105. - [DELETED/].

Section 1105 of the International Fire Code is deleted. ‘

SECTION 1106. — [DELETED].

Section 1106 of the International Fire Code is deleted.

CHAPTER 35. — HOT WORK.

SECTION 3511. - HOT WORK ON PIERS.

3511.1. Scope.

Buming or hot work conducted on marine terminals, piers, and wharvés or moored vessels

shall be in accordance with this section.

3511.2. Repairs 0}1 Ves;els.

An applicant for a permit to perform hot work on a vessel shall provide a copy of a Marine’

Chemist’s Certificate authorizing hot work with the permit application. If a permit is issuedl the permit

18 holder shall post a copy of the Certificate in a conspicuous place near the gangway of the vessel

under repair, The permit holder shall perform all work in accordance with NFPA 306, Control of Gas

Huazards on Vessels. Hot work is prohibited while a vessel is fueling, loading or unloading hazardous

materials, or when Class “A” or “B” explosives are on board or within 100 feet (30 480 mm) of the

vessel.

Mayor Breed '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS - Page 69

125




——h

N N N - -t —_ — — — — -— -t —k

o © oo N o o R~ WwN

f—

3511.3. Repairs on Plers.

Hot work is prohibited at marine terminals and on piers, wharves, or moored vessels under any

of the following conditions:

1. During gas freeing operations;

2, Within 100 feet (30 480 mm) of bulk cargo operations involving the loading or unloading of

flammable or combustible materials;

3. Within 100 feet {30 480 mni) of fueling (bunkering) operations; and

4. Within 100 feet (30 480 mm) of explosives o1 50 feet-(15 240 mm) bf othé,rlliazafdoits '
materials. A ' |

3511.4. Requirements for Hot Work.

’ Any person performing hot work shall perform the work in compliance with this code and the

regulations of the U.S. Department of Transportation, U.S. Department of Labor, and U.S. Coast

Guard.

CHAPTER 56. —~ EXPLOSIVES AND FIREWORKS.
SECTION 5601. - GENERAL.

The following San Francisco Fire.Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section.

5601.2. [For SF | Permit Required for Explosives, Explosive Materials, Fireworks, and

Pyrotechnics.

No person may manufacture, assemble, test, use, possess, handle, store, or sell explosives,

explosive materials, fireworks, and pyrotechnic materials within the City and County unless the person

has obtained a permit from the fire code official.

Mayor Breed ‘
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : Page 70

126 .



o ~ O o Bk W N

(<

10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
20
23
24
o5

Ea—
e

The following San Francisco Fire Code section replaces the corresponding California Fire

Code section:

5601.2.4. [For SF] Financial Responsibility and Insurance.

Before a permit is issued to use explosives, explosive materials, fireworks, or pyrotechnic

special effects, the applicant shall submit to the fire code official a certificate evidencing Commercial

General Liability insurance with limits not less than $1,000,000 each occurrence, $2,000,000 general

aggregate, combined single limit for bodily injury and pfoperty damage, including coverage for

Contractual Liability, independent contractors, Explosion, Collapse, and Underground (XCU),

Personal Injury, Broadform Property Damage, producis, and compleied operations, ulong with un

additional insured endorsement naming the City and County of San Francisco, its officers, agents and

emplovyees as an additional insured, The insurance policy and endorsement shall be from an insurer

approved by the City’s Risk Manager and in a form approved by the Risk Manager. In consultation

with the Risk Manager, the fire code official may specify a greater or lesser amount for the policy

when, in the fire code official’s opinion, conditions at the location of use indicate a greater or lesser

amount is required.

Exception: Government entities are exempt from this requirement.

CHAPTER 80. - REFERENCED STANDARDS.

NFPA 72-16: National Fire Alarm and Signaling Code, as amended.

Revise Section 18.4.2.1 as follows:

18.4.2.1. To meet the requirements of Section 10,10, the alaym audible signal paitern used to

notify building occupants of the need to evacuate (leave the building) shall be the standard alarm

evacuation signal consisting of a three-pulse temporal pattern in accordance with Figure 18.4.2.1,The

audible signal pattern used to notify building occupants of the need to relocate (from one area to

Mayor. Breed _ ’ s
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : ' Page 71

127




—

© .o N o o A~ N

N N N — - — — — —_ -t —_

another) shall be a I-second to 3-second alert tone followed by a message (or messages where multi-

channel capability is used) per Section 24.4.8.3.

Delete Sections 18.11 and 21.5.3.

Revise Section 24.4.8.3.1 as follows: -

24.4.8.3.1. The sequence [ Zhé alert tone followed by the message(s)] shall be repeated

continuously to inform and direct occupants in the signaling zone where the alarm initiation originated,

as well as other signaling zones in accordance with the building fire safety plan.

CHAPIER 81. — PARKING LOTS AND GARAGES.

" This Chapter does not exist in the California Fire Code or International Fire Code.

SECTION 8101. - SCOPE.

Premises used for parking of motor vehicles and classified as Group S, Division 2 occupancies

or as a parking lot shall be in accordance with Chapter 81. See the Building Code for construction

requirements. Garages used to service or repair motor vehicles shall comply with Chapter 23.

- SECTION 8102. — DEFINITIONS.

PARKING LOTS AND GARAGES are lots and garages where the operator charges a fee for

the storage of motor vehicles. Parking lots shall include those premises that are open to the sky.

" SECTION 8103. — GENERAL REQUIREMENTS.

8103.1. Aisles.

Mayor Breed .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 72

128




o ~N o U b~ W N =

w

10
11
12
13
14
15
16

17

18

19

20

21
22
23
24
25

A parking lot or garage shall include at least one aisle with a minimum width of 30 inches (762

mm) and arranged to provide access to all portions of the parking lot or garage.

© 8103.2. Exit Width.

Vehicle exits and entrances shall be at least 1 5 feet (4572 mm) wide.

8103.3. Vehicle Barriers.

The operator Qf a parking lot or garage shall install approved vehicle barriers to prevent

encroachment on any public right of way and to prevent damage to adjoining property.

8103.4. Hlumination.

7 - . Lo e det o T e T 1 2F2 ) P SRS N SR PSS S Ly S I U ST S oS P
The operator of @ parking lot shall illuminate the entire lot with light having intensity of not less

than 1 foot-candle (10.76 Ix) at the pavement.

- 8103.5. Sign.

The operator of any unattended. parking lot shall post a sign in a conspicuous location, stating

the name and telephone number of the operator.

8103.6. Vehicle Servicing.

Service or repair of motor vehicles is prohibited in parking lots.

APPENDIX D. — FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS. .

Section D105.2 of the International Fire Code is deleted.

Section 5. Effective and Operative Dates.
(a) This ordinance shall become effective 30 days after enactment. Enactment occurs
when the Mayor signs the ordinance, the Mayor returns the ordinance unsigned or does not

sign the ordinance within ten days of receiving it, or the Board of Supervisors overrides the

Mayor's veto of the ordinance.

Mayor Breed
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . : - Page 73

129




O w [o¢] ~l D al B w N -

@) N w no -~ o (<o) oo ~l (0)] ot I w A] -

RR—

(b) - The operative date of Section 4 of this ordinance shall be January 1, 2020,

consistent with the operative date of the 2019 California Fire Code.

Section 6. Transmittal to State Authorities.
- Upon enactment of this ordinance, the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors is hereby
directed to transmit this ordinance, including Exhibit A, to the Caiifomia Building Standards
Commission and the State Fire Marshal for filing, pursuant to thev applicable provisions of

California law.

APPROVED AS TO FORM: =

. DENNIS J. HERRERA, City Attorney

By: {
SARAH A. CROWLEY/'

Deputy City Attorney

n:\legana\as2019\2000085\01394602.docx

Mayor Breed . ‘
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ’ Page 74

130




s EXHIBIT A
STANDARD FINDINGS FOR
SAN FRANCISCO FIRE CODE AMENDMENTS:

1. Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk for earthquake-induced
structural failure and consequent fire due to local hazardous microzones, slide areas, and local
liquefaction hazards. (Geology)

2. Certain buildings/bccupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk of fire due to high density
of buildings on very small lots, with many buildings built up to the property lines. (Topography)

3. Topography of San Francisco has led to development of a high density of buildings on small
lots, necessitating special provisions for exiting, fire separation, or ﬁre resistive construction.

(Topography)

4. Many buildings are built on steep hills and narrow streets, requiring special safety
considerations. (Topography) ‘

5. Additional fire, structural and other protection is required due to high building density and
crowded occupancy. (Topography)

6. The City is experiencing a surge in high-rise and super-high-rise development requiring
special safety considerations. (Topography)

7. Not a building standard; no local findings required.

131



FR

Section # | Finding #

Chapter 1- Division I

7

7

JUY U P
ot | ot | et
COIDD | rma

721
33 7

Chapter 1- Division II

101 (deleted)

102.3.1

102.6 (deleted)

102.7 (deleted)

102.8 (deleted)

102.10 (deleted)

102.11 (deleted)

102.12 (deleted)

103.1 (deleted)

103.2 (deleted)

103.3 (deleted)

104.1.1

104.1.2

104.6.2.1

104.10.2

- 104.10.3

105.1.1

105.1.3

105.2.3

105.2.5

105.3.1.

105.3.9

105.4.1

105.4.6

105.6.23

105.6.27

105.6.33

105.6.36

105.6.52

105.6.53

105.6.54

105.7.26

106.1

106.2

106.2.1

106.2.2

106.2.3

106.3

106.4

106.5

106.6

106.7

106.8

ORI D] B NG G NG B TR TG BT SR BN BN I BRI ES I ESE BN | BT BN 1B DR TEN SRR IENTERIEN IR IERIENIER AN ER R RN TR RN IR TR TR AR TR

106.8.1

Chart of Findings for San Francisco Fire Code Amendments (Exhibit A)

132



Section # Finding #
106.9
106.10
106.11
106.12
106.13
106.14
1106.15
106.16
106.21
109 (dejeted)
110.1
110.2
110.3
110.4
110.4.1
1104.2
110.4.3
110.4.3.1
110.4.3.2
110.4.3.3
110434
110.4.4
110.4.4.1
110.4.5
110.5
110.5.1
110.5.2
110.5.3
110.6
110.6.1
110.7
110.8
110.9
1124
113.1
114.1
114.1.1
114.1.2
114.1.3

3] 3 P T N ) ) A A 3 N Y

Chapter 2

202

~l

Chapter 3

308.1.3
308.1.6.2
308.2 (deleted)
316.3.1

316.7

S [ TN T ]

Chapter 4
| 403.1 (deleted) 1

~J

Chart of Findings for San Francisco Fire Code Amendments (Exhibit A)

133



Section # , Finding #

403.2 (deleted)

403.3 (deleted)

403.4 (deleted)

403.5 (deleted)

403.6 (deleted)

403.7 (deleted)

403.8 (deleted)

403.9 (deleted)

403.10 (deleted)

403.11 (deleted)

404.1

404.2

404.3

404.4 (deleted)

404.4.1 (deleted)

405 (deleted)

406 (deleted)

409.1

409.2

409.3

4094

T RN R PN PO N PN S NG TN BGT BNGL BRY IN T NG G BN | PRGT BR BNR BNY B

-409.5

Chapter 5

503

504.2.1

504.3.1

504.5

506.2.1

507.4

507.5.3.1

T Y IS PN NG N A

507.5.5

507.6 1 12345

5077 7

508.1.2 T 23456
508.1.6.1 7

508.1.8 2.3.4.5.6

510.1.1 34,5 .

511.1 1,23.4,5,6

Chapter 6

606.9 ] 7

Chapter 9

901.8.3 7

902.1 ' 7

903.2.11.6 123,456

903.3.6.1

903.3.10

903.5.1

904.12.5.2

<l=al~a|~l=a

905.2.1

Chart of Findings for San Francisco Fire Code Amendments (Exhibit A)

134



Section # Finding #
905.3.4 2,345
905.3.12 2,345
905.4 (item 1) 2,3,4,5
905.4.3 2,345
907.1.6 T
907.2.9.1 2,345
907.2.10.9 7
907.5.2.2.6. 2,34,5.6
907.6.4.1.2 4,5,6
907.6.4.1.3 5
907.64.3 2,3,4,5,6
907.7.4 7
907.8.5 7
907.8.6 7
907.8.7 7
507.8.8 ' 7
912.8 2,5
913.2.3 2,56
914.3.1.1 2,5,6
914.3.1.2.2 2,5,6
914.3.1.3 2,5,6
914.3.2.1 2,5,6
914.3.2.2 2,5,6
91432.2.1 2,5,6
914.12 2,345
Chapter 10
1010.1.2 2,3,4,5,6
1010.1.4.3 2,345.6
1013.1 34,5
1030.1.2 , 2,345
1031.2.3 7
Chapter 11
1101 (deleted) 7
1102 (deleted) ' 7
1103.1 (deleted) 7
1103.1.1 (deleted) ' 7
1103.3 (deleted) 7
1103.4 (deleted) 7
1103.5 2,345
1103.5.1 2,3.4,5
1103.5.2 2,345
1103.5.3 2,3.4.5
1103.7.1 (deleted) 7
1103.7.2 (deleted) 7
1103.7.4 (deleted) 7
1103.7.5 (deleted) 7
1103.7.6 (deleted) 7
1103.7.6.1 2,34,
1103.7.10 7
1104.1 (deleted) 7

Chart.of Findings for San Francisco Fire Code Amendments (Exhibit A)

135



Section # Finding #

1104.2 (deleted)

1104.3 (deleted)

1104.4 (deleted)

1104.5(deleted)

1104.6 (deleted)

1104.7 (deleted)

1104.8 (deleted)

1104.9 (deleted)

1104.10 (deleted)

1104.11 (deleted)

1104.12 (deleted)

1104.13 (deleted)

1104.14 (deleted)

R TN IER TR RN TR TR TR R A e R TN F |

1104.15 (deleted)

1104.16.5

1104.16.5.1

1104.17 (deleted)

1104.18 (deleted)

1104.19 (deleted)

1104.20 (deleted).

1104.21 (deleted)

1104.22 (deleted)

1104.23 (deleted)

1104.24 (deleted)

1104.25 (deleted)

1105 (deleted)

1106 (deleted)

Chapter 35

3511.1

3511.2

35113

RN TR A

35114

Chapter 56

5601.2

5601.4.4

RS EN

Chapter 80
NFPA 72 18.4.2.1 .

~3i~3

NFPA 72 24.8.3.1

Chapter 81
8101 v

8102

RN ENIEN]

8103

Appendix D

D105 | 7

Chart of Findings for San Francisco Fire Code Amendments (Exhibit A)

136



FILE NO. 190866

LEGISLATIVE DIGEST

[Fire Code - Repealing 2016 Code, Adopting 2019 Code]

Ordinance repealing the existing San Francisco Fire Code in its entirety and enacting a
new San Francisco Fire Code consisting of the 2019 California Fire Code and portions
of the 2018 International Fire Code, together with amendments specific to San
Francisco with an operative date of January 1, 2020; adopting findings of local
conditions pursuant to California Health and Safety Code, Section 17958.7; directing
the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward San Francisco’s amendments to the
California Building Standards Commission and State Fire Marshal; and making
environmental findings. :

Existing Law

The San Francisco Fire Code is designed to safeguard life and property from fire and
explosions hazards arising from the storage, handling and use of hazardous substances,
materials and devices, and from conditions hazardous to life or property in the occupancy of
buildings and premises; and to provide for the issuance of permits, inspections and other Fire
Department services, and the assessment and collection of fees for those permits, inspections
and services. The current San Francisco Fire Code (the “2016 San Francisco Fire Code”)
incorporates by reference the 2016 California Fire Code (Title 24, California Code of
Regulations, Part 9), those portions of the 2015 International Fire Code not incorporated in the
2016 California Fire Code, and local amendments adopted by San Francisco.

Amendments to Current L aw

The 2019 San Francisco Fire Code enacted by this ordinance (the “2019 San Francisco Fire
Code”) incorporates by reference the 2019 California Fire Code (Title 24, California Code of
Regulations, Part 9) (the “2019 California Fire Code”), including appendices adopted by the
State, except as expressly deleted, modified, or amended. In addition, the 2019 San
Francisco Fire Code incorporates by reference those portions of the 2018 International Fire
Code that were not adopted by the California Building Standards Commission in the 2019
California Fire Code. It also includes local provisions specific to San Francisco.

In general, the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code carries forward the 2016 San Francisco Fire

Code with some modifications. Significant changes and new requirements are described
below. , _

Section 106 of the 2019 San Frahcisco Fire Code revises only the section number referenced
for various fees charged in connection with permits, plan review, overtime, and onsite

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 1

137



FILE NO. 190866

inspections, among other activities. These provisions were Iocated in Section 113 of prewous
fire.codes.

- Section 110.4.2 provides that when a fire code official issues a notice of violation and sets a
date for re-inspection to certify code compliance, the fire official shall charge a $260 violation
re-inspection fee for each re-inspection, required to be paid by the responsible person.

Section 110.4.3 speciﬁes that violations of Orders to Abate and Orders to Vacate are
punishable as either “infractions” or “misdemeanors.” In addition, Section 110.4.3 clarifies
that an Order of Compliance shall be filed with the Assessor-Recorder to remove an Order to
Abate or Vacate only after all associated fees, fines, and penalties have been satisfied.

Sections 110.4.3.1 through 110.4.3.3 set forth fees to be charged for activities during the
Administrative Hearing process. Section 110.4.3.1 specifies that a $130.00 fee shall be
charged for processing the referral request to upgrade the original Notice of Violation to an-
Administrative Hearing due to the inability to abate the violation. Section 110.4.3.2 specifies

. that a $390.00 fee shall be levied on the responsible party for each Administrative Hearing for
each address listed on.the agenda. - Section 110.4.3.3 specifies that a $130.00 fee shall be
charged for each site reinspection to abate the violation during the Administrative Hearing
process.

Sections 110.4.3.4, 110.4.4.1,110:5.3, and 110.6.1 state that fees and fines levied shall be
paid to the Fire Department, and that all revenue from those fees and fines shall be placed in
a designated Bureau of Fire Prevention account to support community outreach, inspector
personnel training, and other fire safety and prevention programs.

Section 110.6 updates the fees listed for an infraction under California Government Code
Section 36900. 'Specifically, the Government Code fines shall not exceed $130.00 for the first
violation, $700.00 for a second violation, and $1,300.00 for each additional V|olat|on within
one year, or $2500.00 for each additional v1olatlon within two years.

Section 508 of the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code requires increased safety measures for the
construction and operation of the Fire Command Center. Section 508.1.2 increases the fire
command center construction fire rating from 1 hour to 2 hours in order to maintain the same
fire rating that applies to shafts connecting the rest of the building with the command center.
Section 508.1.6.1 adds a new requirement for high-rise buildings to post their existing fire
alarm operational matrix to assist fire personnel in determining a building’s occupant
-evacuation protocol. Section 508.1.8 requires the command center to be constructed as
watertight to prevent water intrusion from a sprinkler discharge or firefighting water from floors
above the command center.

Section 903 adds specific qualifications for contractors and personnel installing, testing, and
- maintaining sprinkler systems, standpipes, and other automatic extinguishing systems.
Section 903.3.10 requires that contractors, personnel, and companies installing automatic

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ‘ o Page 2

138



FILE NO. 190866

extinguishing systems possess a C-16 (fire protection) contractor’s license issued by the
California Contractors State License Board (CA-CSLB). In addition, this Section requires that
employees of C-16 licensed companies working on the installation maintain a valid Fire
Sprinkler Fitter Certificate issued by the California Office of the State Fire Marshal (CAL-

- OSFM). Section 903.5.1 requires that contractors, personnel, and companies testing and
maintaining automatic extinguishing systems must possess a C-16 (fire protection)
contractor’s license issued by the California Contractors State License Board (CA-CSLB).
This Section further requires that employees of C-16 licensed companies testing and
maintaining automatic extinguishing systems hold a valid Fire Sprinkler Fitter Certificate
issued by the California Office of the State Fire Marshal (CAL-OSFM).

Section 907 adds specific qualifications for contractors and personnel installing, inspecting, -
testing, and maintaining life safety equipment including, but not limited to, fire alarms, elevator
recall systems, and sprinkler monitoring systems. Section 907.1.6 requires that contractors,
personnel, and companies installing fire alarms and detection systems possess a C-10
(electrical) contractor’s license issued by the California Contractors State License Board (CA-
CSLB). This Section further requires that employees of C-10 (electrical) licensed companies
working on the installation of fire alarm and detection systems maintain a valid Electrician
Certificate (fire alarms) issued by the California Department of Industrial Relations (CA-DIR).
Section 907.8.7 requires that fire alarm inspection and testing reports for high-rise buildings
state clearly how the fire alarm system’s matrix was designed and approved to operate.
Section 907.8.8 requires that contractors, personnel, and companies inspecting, testing and
maintaining fire alarms and detection systems possess a C-10 (electrical) contractor’s license
issued by the California Contractors State License Board (CA-CSLB). This section further
requires that employees of C-10 (electrical) licensed companies inspecting, testing and
maintaining fire alarms and detection systems maintain a valid Electrician Certificate (fire
alarms) issued by the California Department of Industrial Relations (CA-DIR). Section
907.8.5(c) adds service and contractor information to the existing service sticker placed on the
exterior of the fire alarm control panel.

Section 1031.2.3 clarifies that all fire escapes shall be immediately accessible and not located
behind a locked door that restricts access. There is an exception provided for buildings in
which each unit has direct access to its own fire escape, not by way of the corridor.

. Section 1104 adds requirements for materials used to construct existing fire escapes and the
required examination for structural adequacy and safety of each. Section 1104.16.5
establishes that a design professional shall determine the structural adequacy of the fire
escape if the original design calculations are unavailable for review. Section 1104.16.5.1-
adds requirements that all fire escapes shall be examined every 5 years, or more frequently
as requested by the fire code official, and the inspection report shall be maintained on-site
and available for review.

Chapter 80 (Referenced Standards) of the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code modifies sections of
2016 NFPA 72 to assist with conflicting language for fire alarm sounding signals. Section

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ' Page 3

139



j
v
—

FILE NO. 190866

18.4.2.1 of NFPA 72 clarifies that the three-pulse temporal audible signal pattern for occupant
evacuation shall not be used in those areas of buildings where occupants are required to
relocate within the same building, while Section 24.4.8.3.1 clarifies that the relocation signal .
shall be repeated continuously and not discontinued after only three rounds.

Background Information

The State of California adopts a new California Fire Code every three years. The California
Building Standards Commission recently issued the 2019 California Fire Code, which is based '
on the 2018 International Fire Code, and which will go into effect on January 1, 2020. -

Local jurisdictions are required to enforce the California Fire Code, but may enact more -
restrictive building standards than those set in the California Fire Code where those more
restrictive standards are reasonably necessary due to local conditions caused by climate,
geology, or topography. The Board of Supervisors must make express findings regarding the
local conditions to support the adoption of more restrictive building standards. Local

~ amendments to building standards are not effective until the required findings are adopted
and sent to the California Building Standards Commission. ‘

As in past three-year code cycles, this ordinance repeals the 2016 San Francisco -Fire Code
- and enacts the 2019 San Francisco Fire Code. The San Francisco amendments are not
integrated into the text of the California Fire Code but rather are separately printed.
Therefore, the user must consult both the 2019 California Fire Code and the 2019 San
_Francisco Fire Code to determine the complete code requirements.

n:\legana\as2019\2000085\01394252.docx

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : : Page 4

140



City Hall .
Dr. Cariton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244

BOARD of SUPERVISORS San Francisco 94102-4689
Tel. No. 554-5184
Fax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227
October 1, 2019
File No. 190866
Lisa Gibson

Environmental Review Officer
Planning Department

1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400
San Francisco, CA 94103

Dear Ms. Gibson:
On September 24, 2019, Mayor Breed submitted the proposed legislation:

File No. 190866

Ordinance repealing the existing San Francisco Fire Code in its entirety
and enacting a new San Francisco Fire Code consisting of the 2019
California Fire Code and portions of the 2018 International Fire Code,
together with amendments specific o San Francisco with an operative date
of January 1, 2020; adopting findings of local conditions pursuant to
California Health and Safety Code, Section 17958.7; directing the Clerk of
the Board of Supervisors to forward San Francisco’s amendments to the
California Building Standards Commission and State Fire Marshal; and
making environmental findings.

This legislation is being transmitted to you for environmental review.
Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board
g

By: Erica Major, Assistant Clerk
Land Use and Transportation Committee

Attachment

¢ Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning
Don Lewis, Environmental Planning
. Not defined as a project under CEQA Guidelines Sections

15378 and 15060 (c) {2) because it would not result in a

direct or indirect physical change in the environment.

141



City Hall
Dr. Carlton B, Goodlett Place, Room 244

BOARD of SUPERVISORS . San Francisco 94102~4689
Tel, No. 554-5184
Fax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227
October 1, 2019
File No. 190866
Lisa Gibson

Environmental Review Officer
Planning Department

1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400
San Francisco, CA 94103

Dear Ms. Gibson:
On September 24, 2019, Mayor Breed submitted the proposed legislation:
File No. 190866

Ordinance repealing the existing San Francisco Fire Code in its entirety
and enacting a new San Francisco Fire Code consisting of the 2019
California Fire Code and portions of the 2018 ‘International Fire Code,
together with amendments specific to San Francisco with an operative date
of January 1, 2020; adopting findings of local conditions pursuant to
California Health and Safety Code, Section 17958.7; directing the Clerk of
the Board of Supervisors to forward San Francisco’s amendments to the
California Building Standards Commission and State Fire Marshal; and
making environmental findings. -

This legislation is being transmitted to you for environmental review.
Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board
By: Erica Major, Assistant Clerk
Land Use and Transportation Committee
Attachment

c.  Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning
Don Lewis, Environm.ental Planning

142



City Hall
i Dr. Cariton B. Goodlett Piace, Room 244
San Francisco 94102-4689
Tel. No. 554-5184
Fax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227

BOARD of SUPERVISORS

NOTICE OF PUBLIC HEARING
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF THE CITY AND COUNTY OF SAN FRANCISCO
LAND USE AND TRANSPORTATION COMMITTEE

'NOTICE IS HEREBY GIVEN THAT the Land Use and Transportation Committee will
hold a public hearing to consider the following proposal and said public hearing will be held
as follows, at which time all interested parties may attend and be heard:

Date: Monday, October 28, 2019
Time: 1:30 p.m.

Location: Legislative Chamber, Room 250, located at City Hall
1 Dr. Garlton B, Goodlett Place, San Francisco, CA

Subjects:  File No. 180866. Ordinance repealing the existing San Francisco Fire

Code in its entirety and enacting a new San Francisco Fire Code
consisting of the 2019 California Fire Code and portions of the 2018
International Fire Code, together with amendments specific to San
Francisco with an operative date of January 1, 2020; adopting findings of
local conditions pursuant to California Health and Safety Code, Section
17958.7; directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward San
Francisco’s amendments to the California Building Standards

-Commission and State Fire Marshal; and making environmental findings.

If this legislation passes, the Fire Department shall assess fees in accordance with the
provisions of Fire Code, Sections 110.4.3.1 through 110.4.3.3. for person(s) found
responsible in violation of the provisions of the Fire Code that have not demonstrated
compliance with the posted Fire Life Safety Notice and Order within the posted time frames.

When the owner of a building, occupancy, premises, system or vehicle fails to abate a
violation by the compliance date and the fire code official refers the matter for hearing, the
Fire Department shall charge an administrative hearing referral fee of $130, under Fire Code,
Section 110.4.3.1. When the fire code official issues a notice of violation and sets a date for
compliance and re-inspection to certify compliance under Fire Code, Section 110.4.2, the fire
code official shall charge a fee of $260 for violation for each re-inspection: When the owner of
a building, occupancy, premise, or vehicle fails to abate a violation by the compliance date
and the fire code official refers the matter for hearing and sets a date for the violation to be
heard before a hearing officer, the fire code official shall charge a $390 administrative hearing
fee for each hearing where the violation is heard, under Fire Code, Section 110.4.3.2. When
the hearing officer sets a date for violations to be corrected and verify compliance with code
requirements, the fire code official shall charge $130 for each site re-inspection to abate the
violation during the administrative hearing process, under Fire Code, Section 110.4.3.3.

143



Board of Superv;sors

' October 18 20‘19
Page2

.matters and sh
comment, h0u

gela Calvillo; Clerk.of the: Board

e DATED/POSTED October18 2019

PUBLISHED October 18 and 23,2019 .

144



Meétmber, Board of Supeérvisors ‘City'and County of San Francisco

District:3
AARON PESKIN
{ifra: Ha2HE
DATE: October 21, 2019
TO: Angela Calvillo.
Clerk of the Board of Supervisors
FROM; Supervisor Aafon Peskin, Chair, Land Use and Transportation Committee
REr . Land Use and Transportation Committée

'LOMMI TEE RI:PUH TS

the followmg matters are of an urgent nature and request they be. oonsrdered by the full Board on
Tuesday, October 29, 2019, as Committeg Reports

180866 Fire Code - Repealing 2016 Code, Adopting 2019 Code

. Ordinance Tepealing the-éxisting San Francisco Fire Code iy its ehtirety and énacting a new San
Francisco Fire Code consisting of the 2018. California, Fire Code and portions.of the 2018
International Fire Code, fogether with amendments- specrﬂc to San Francisco with an operative
date of January 1, 2020; adopting findings of local condifions pursiant to Calrforma Health and
Safety Code, Sectron 17958.7; directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward San.
Francisco's amendments to the California‘Building Standards Commission andState Fire
Marshal; and making énvironmental findings,.

190964 : Green Building Code:~ Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of. 2019
‘Edition:

Ordinance repeallng the 2016 Green Bux!dmg Code inits entirety: and enacting.a 2019 'Green
Building Code consisting of the2019 California Green Building Standards:Code as ‘amended by:
San Francisco; adopting environmental. ﬂndmgs and findings of local conditions under the: '
Califorpia Health: and Safety Code; provrdmg for arn. operative ¢ date of January 1,2020:and
directing the-Clerk of the Board of Superv_sors to forward the legislation to the’ Calrfornla E uﬂdrng
Standards Comrission. as required by State law.

These matters will be heard in the Land Use and Transportatron Commrttee ata Regular Meetlng on,
Monday; October 282019, at 1:30. pm:.

City Hall = 1 Dr. Carlion B. Goodlelt Place » Room 244 « San Francisco, California 94102-4689 ¢ (415) 554-7450
Fax (415) 554-7454 = TDD/TTY (415) %5&6227 * E-mail: Aaron.Peskin@sfzov.org




OFFIGE OF THE MAYOR

LONDON N BREED
SAN FRANCISCO o

MAYOR

Shuldyu he any qunnplaettsma mﬂat41555461 53.

ok

1 DR. CARLTON B.. GOODLErr PLACE Room 200 |
SAN FRANEISCO, CALIFORNIA 94102-4681
TELEPHONE: (415) 554-6141

146



