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M E M O R A N D U M 
 

LAND USE AND TRANSPORTATION COMMITTEE 
 

SAN FRANCISCO BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
 
 
TO:  Supervisor Malia Cohen, Chair 
  Land Use and Transportation Committee 
 
FROM:  Andrea Ausberry, Assistant Clerk 
 
DATE:  March 9, 2015 
 
SUBJECT: COMMITTEE REPORT, BOARD MEETING 
  Tuesday, March 10, 2015 
 
 
The following file should be presented as a COMMITTEE REPORT at the Board meeting, 
Tuesday, March 10, 2015.  This item was acted upon at the Committee Meeting on March 9, 
2015, at 1:30 p.m., by the votes indicated. 
 
Item No. 19  File No. 150192 
 
Resolution imposing interim zoning controls for an 18-month period for parcels in the RH-1, RH-
2, and RH-3 zoning districts within a perimeter established by Market Street, Clayton Street, 
Ashbury Street, Clifford Terrace, Roosevelt Way, Museum Way, the eastern property line of 
Assessor’s Parcel Block No. 2620, Lot No. 063, the eastern property line of Assessor’s Parcel 
Block No. 2619, Lot No. 001A, and Douglass Street, requiring Conditional Use authorization for 
any residential development on a vacant parcel that will result in total residential square footage 
exceeding 3,000 gross square feet; requiring Conditional Use authorization for any new 
residential development on a developed parcel that will increase the existing gross square 
footage in excess of 3,000 square feet and by more than 75% without increasing the existing 
legal unit count, or more than 100% if increasing the existing legal unit count; requiring 
Conditional Use authorization for residential development that results in greater than 55% total 
lot coverage; and making environmental findings, including findings of consistency with the 
General Plan, and the eight priority policies of Planning Code, Section 101.1. 
 
 
AMENDED on Page 2, Lines 22 - 25, by adding ‘(1) any residential development that will result 
in total residential square footage exceeding 3,000 gross square feet on a parcel if the 
residential development will occur on a vacant parcel; (2) any residential development that will 
increase the total existing gross square footage on a developed parcel in excess of 3,000 
square feet and by (a) more than 75%’; Page 3, Lines 1 - 3, by adding ‘without increasing the 
existing legal unit count or (b) more than 100% if increasing the existing legal unit count; and (3) 
any residential development, either as an addition to an existing building or as a new building, 
that results in greater than 55% lot coverage,’, Lines 3 - 6, by deleting ‘residential development 
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exceeding 3,000 gross square feet where the development increases existing development by 
more than 75% without adding one or more units or more than 100% if adding one or more units 
and for extensions of buildings beyond 55% total lot coverage,’, and Line 24, by adding ‘total’; 
Page 4, Lines 3 - 4, by adding ‘, either as an addition to an existing building or as a new 
building,’, Line 7, by adding ‘that’, Line 8, by adding ‘total’, Lines 8 - 10, by adding ‘, or, in the 
case of the addition of a residential unit, that such addition would be infeasible without 
exceeding 55% total lot coverage;’ Lines 11 - 15, by adding ‘FURTHER RESOLVED, That the 
Planning Commission, in considering a Conditional Use authorization in a situation where an 
additional new residential unit is proposed on a through lot on which there is already an existing 
building on the opposite street frontage, shall only grant such authorization upon finding that it 
would be infeasible to add a unit to the already developed street frontage of the lot; and, be it’, 
and Line 21, by adding ‘site or’. 

Vote: Supervisor Malia Cohen - Aye 
 Supervisor Scott Wiener - Aye 
 Supervisor Jane Kim - Aye 

 
RECOMMENDED AS AMENDED AS A COMMITTEE REPORT 

Vote: Supervisor Malia Cohen - Aye 
 Supervisor Scott Wiener - Aye 
 Supervisor Jane Kim - Aye 

 
 
 
 
c: Board of Supervisors  
 Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board 
 Rick Caldeira, Deputy Legislative Clerk 
 Jon Givner, Deputy City Attorney 
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