File No.

190963 Committee Item No. 5

Board ltem No. 22

COMMITTEE/BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
AGENDA PACKET CONTENTS LIST

Committee: Land Use and Transpbrtation Committee Date October 28, 2019

Board of Supervisors Meeting
Cmte Board

]

OO OO OO0 ORIX

O
et
=
T
A

CIOOCCIRIXIRIRXIXX]

OO R

8 0

Date \Q\\\\W 6 ¢) %\”\

Motion

Resolution

Ordinance

Legislative Digest

Budget and Legislative Analyst Report
Youth Commission Report
Introduction Form

Department/Agency Cover Letter and/or Report
MOU _

Grant Information Form

Grant Budget -

Subcontract Budget
Contract/Agreement

Form 126 — Ethics Commission

Award Letter

Application

Public Correspondence

(Use back side if additional épace is needed)

DRAFT 2019 SFPC

Exhibit A Findings

[2019 CPC |<-- ** CLICK HERE TO VIEW
BIC Ltr 081219 '
DBI Ltr 092019

Referral CEQA 100819

CEQA Determination 101519

Completed by: Erica Maijor Date__October 24, 2019

Completed by:___ Erica Major . Date___ ]3] |2014

**PATH NAME:

https:// sfgov.legistar.com/VieW.ashX?MzF&ID=7729742&GUID=8663671A~14AA—464F—
B908-39BE11486432 k

1759


https://sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=7729742&GUID=8663671A-14AA-464FB908-

—

G O G )

N
o

21
22
23
24

25

FILE NO. 190963 Y ORDINANCE""~v-1}O

[Plumbing Code - Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of 2019 Edition]

Ordinance repealing the 201.6 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a 2019
Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as amended by San
Franc:scp, adop,tmg,enwronmental findings and fmdlngs of local conditions under the
Callforma Health a?*:d Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020 and

directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the

California Building Standards Commission as required by State law.

NOTE: Unchanged Code text and uncodified text are in plain Arial font
‘ Additions to Codes are in szn;zle underlzne ztalzcs Times New Roman font.

Deletions to Codes are in :

Board amendment addltlons are in double-underlined Arial font.
Board amendment deletions are in strikethrough-Asdal-font.
Asterisks (* * * *)indicate the omission of unchanged Code
subsections or parts of tables.

Be it ordained by the People of the City and County of San Francisco:

Section 1. Environmental Findings. The Planning Department has determined that the

-actions contemplated in this ordinance comply with the California Environmental Quality Act

(California Public Resources Code Sections 21000 et seq.). Said determination is on file with
the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors in File No. 190963 and is mcorporated herem by

reference The Board affirms this determination. .

s

(“ " .

(@)  The California Building Standards Code is contained in Title 24 of the California

Section 2. General Findings.

Code of 'Regulations. It consists of 12 Parts, which are based upon model codes that are
amended by the State agencies with jurisdiction over the subject matter. The California

Plumbing Code is Part 5 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations.

° L) i
M "7" o
0 !

Building Inspection Commission
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 1

1760




(e} «© @] ~ [o2] (G2 BN W N —

N - — —_ — i s — LN —

_(b)  The State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code every
three years (“triennial CBSC”) with supplemental amendments published in intervening years.
The triennial CBSC goes into effect throughout the State of California 180 days after its
publication by the California Building Standards Commission or at a iater date established by
the Commission. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go into effect on January 1, 2020.

(c)  Localjurisdictions must enforce the California Building Standards Code but they
may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of
local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions. Local amendments may be made both to
the tfiennial CBSC and to lté individual Parts during the intervening years; however, local
amendments previously adopted are not automatically applicable to a triennial CBSC. Rather,
they must be re-enacted with the required findings of local élimate, geologic, or topographical
conditions, expressly made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with an operative date
no earlier than the effective date of the triennial CBSC.

(d) As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, by this ordinance the Board of
Supewisors repeals the 2016 San Francisco Plumbing Code in its entirety, enacts the 2019
San Francisco Plumbing Code; and re-enacts the existing local amendments to make them
applicable to the 2019 California Plumbing Code.

(e)  Pursuant to Charter Section D3.750-5, the Building Inspection Commission
'cohsidered and approved San Francisco’s amendments to the 2019 California Plumbing Code

at a duly noticed public hearing that was held on July 17, 2019.

Section 3. Findings regarding Local Conditions. ‘
(a) California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 provide that
before making any changes or modifications to the California Plumbing Code and any other

applicable provisions published by the California Building Standards Commission, the

Building Inspection Commission . ‘
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ’ Page 2

1761




©c © ©® N o o A w N -

[6) BN w N - 'O © (o] ~ (o] o BN w N -

e’
v

governing body must make an expfess finding that each such change or'mo_diﬁcation is

~ reasonably necessary because of specified local conditions. The local amendments together

with the required findings must be filed with the California Building Standards Commission
before the local changes or modifications can go into effect.

(b) The City and County of San Francisco is unique among California communities
with respect to local climate, geologic, topographical, and other conditions. A specific list of
findings that support San Francisco's modifications to the 2019 California Plumbing Code, .
with a section-by-section correlation of each modification with a spe'cific numbered finding, are
contained in Exhibit A entitled "Standard Findings for San Francisco Building Standards Code
Amendments." | . | '

(c)  Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5,
thebBoard of Supervisors finds and determines that the local conditions déscribed in Exhibit A
constitute a general summary of the most significant local conditions ‘giving rise to the need
for nﬁodiﬁcation of the 2019 California Plumbing Code prov.isions published by the California
Building Standards Commission. The Board of Supervisors fur%her finds énd determines that
the proposed modifications are reasonably necessary based upon the local conditions sét

forth in Exhibit A.

Sectfon 4. Repeal of the 2016 San Francisco Plumbing Code and Enactment of the
2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code. '

() The 2016 Sén Francisco Plumbing Code is hereby répealed in its entirety. The
San Francisco Plumbing Code being repealed was enacted on November 22, 2016, by
Ordinance No. 231'—16, with an operative date of January 1, 2017. It was amended by |
Ordinance Nos. 0096-18, 0065-19, and 0087-19. These ordinances are available on the

Board. of Supervisors’ website.

Building Inspection Commission '
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS _ N Page 3

1762




—_—

RN — — =N - — . - - - '

(b)  The 2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code is hereby enacted. It consists of the
2019 California Plumbing Code and San Francisco’s existing local amendments, which are re-
enacted and expressly made applicable to the 2019 California Plumbing Code. .Copies of the
2019 California Plumbing Code and the stand-alone San Francisco amendments are declared
to belpa'rt of Boatd File No. 190963 ana are incorporated into this ordinance by reference as
‘though fully set forth. Existing San Francisco amendments that are being made applicable to
the 2019 California-Plumbing Code are shown in unformatted (“plain”) text and may include
bold-and/or italicized formatting; new San Francisco amendments are underlined; and deleted

San Francisco amendments are in strikeout text.

Section 5. Continuance of Actions Under Prior Code. Nothing con‘tained in this
ordinance shall be construed as abating any action now pending under or by virtue of any
ordinahbe of the City and County of San Francisco hereby repealed, nor shall this ordinance
be construed as discontinuing, abating, modifying or alltering any penalties accruing, or to

accrue, or as waiving any.r'ight of the City under any such ordinance.

Seétion 6. Severébility. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this
ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the
remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Supewisors hereby declares that it would
have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrése of this

ordinance, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,

. clauses, or phrases be declared invalid.

Section 7. Effective and Operative Dates. This ordinance shall become effecﬁve 30

days after enactment. Enactment occurs when the Mayor signs the ordinance, the Mayor

Building Inspection Commission
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 4

1763




-—

N N N N N N P — [ U § Y PR G § —
(@3] N w N - o © o ~ o3} (&3 RSN w N - [@w]

W 00 N o g s W N

returns the ordinance unsigned or does not sign the ordinance within ten days of receiving it,
or the Board of Supervisors overrides the Mayor’s veto of the ordinance. This ordinance shall
take effect and be in full force on and after either January 1, 2020 or its effective date if the

effécﬁve date is later.

Section 8. Directions to Clerk. Upon final passage of this ordinance, the Clerk of the
Board of Supervisors is hereby directed to transmit to to the California Building Standards
Commission pursuant to the applicable provisions of State law 1) this ordinance, 2) the Exhibit

A attachment, and 3) the San Francisco amendments to the 2019 California Plumbing Code.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
DENNISY. HERRERA, City Attorney

By: ) W%“Z?W%/W
DITH A. BOYAJIAN / v
bbuty City Attorney

n:\legana\as2019\1900415\01391085.docx

Building Inspection Commission
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . - Pageb

1764




e

~ FILE NO. 190963

LEGISLATIVE DIGEST

. [Plumbing Code - Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of 2019 Edition]

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a 2019
Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as amended by San
Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the
California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and
directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the
California Building Standards Commission as required by State law.

Existing Law

The Plumbing Code regulates the installation and maintenance of plumbing systems and
fixtures, water heaters, water supply and distribution, sanitation and ventilation systems,
drainage, fuel piping, and medical and gas vacuum systems. The current San Francisco
Plumbing Code consists of the 2016 California Plumbing Code (which incorporates the 2015
Uniform Plumbing Code) and San Francisco's local amendments to the 2019 California

+ Plumbing Code (“San Francisco Amendments”).

Amendments to Current Law

Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code
(*triennial CBSC”), which amends the California Plumbing Code and the other state codes that
constitute the CBSC. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go into effect throughout the State on
January 1, 2020. As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, San Francisco will repeal its
existing Plumbing Code in its entirety and adopt a new Plumbing Code that applies San
Francisco’s existing local amendments to the new California Plumbing Code. Except for non-
substantive or technical modifications required by amendments to the state code, there are no
changes to the existing San Francisco Plumbing Code amendments being carried forward.

Background Information

‘Local jurisdictions are required to enforce the California Building Standards Code but they
may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of
local climate, geology, or topography. Local amendments may be made to a triennial CBSC
-and also throughout the intervening years. However, local amendments previously adopted
are not automatically transferred to a new triennial CBSC. Rather, they must be re-enacted
with the required findings of local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions, expressly
made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with an operative date no earlier than the
effective date of the new State Code.

n:\leganalas2019\1900415\01384329.doc

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

1765



A
e 4

City Hall
Dr. Carlion B. Goodlett Place, Room 244
San Francisco 94102-4689
Tel. No. 554-5184
¥ax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227 .

October 8, 2019

File No. 190959-190964 .

Lisa Gibson

Environmental Review Officer
Planning Department

1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400
San Francisco, CA 94103

‘ Dear Ms. Gibson:
On October 1, 2019, the.BdiIding Inspection Commission submitted the proposed legislation:
File No. 190959 |

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Building Code in its entirety and enacting a
2019 Building Code consisting of the 2019 California Building Code and the
2019 California Residential Code, as amended by San Francisco; adopting
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date -of

“January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of.the Board to forward the
legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by
State law.

File No. 190960

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Existing Building Code in its entirety and
enacting a 2019 Existing Building Code consisting of the 2019 California
Existing Building Code as amenided by San Francisco; adopting
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of

" January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board to forward the
legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by
State law.

File No. 190961

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Electrical Code in ifs entirety and enacting a
2019 Electrical Code consisting of the 2019 California Electrical Code as
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing
an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board
of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building
Standards Commission as required by State law.

1766



File No. 190962

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Mechanical Code in its entirety and enacting -
a 2019 NMechanical Code consisting of the 2019 California Mechanical Code

as amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and -
findings of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code;
providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of

the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California
Building Standards Commission as required by State law.

File No. 190963

‘Ordinance repealing the 2016 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a
2019 Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing
an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board -
of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building
Standards Commission as required by State law.

File No. 190964

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Green Building Code in its entirety and
enacting a 2019 Green Building Code consisting of the 2019 California
Green Building Standards Code as amended by San Francisco; adopting
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under ‘the
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of
January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to
forward the legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as
required by State law. - '

The abovelegisiation are being transmitted {o you for environmental review.

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board

By: Erica Major, Assistant Clerk
Land Use and Transportation Committee

Attachment

Not defined as a project under CEQA Guidelines
Sections 15378 and 15060(c)(2) because it would not
result in a direct or indirect physical change in the
environment. :

'c:‘ Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning
Don Lewis, Environmental Planning

Joy Navarrete 10/15/2019

1767



2019

San Francisco Plumbing Code

Amendments to the

2019 California Plumbing Code .

Operative date: January 1, 2020

1768



Text Format

Ifalrcz./,ed formattmg
Repealed San Francisco amérndments appear plain-
~ New San Fran01sco amendments appear underhn T

No San Francisco PlumbingCc e An

]03 ] qulace the ﬂm a’ paragr aph withihe followmgs

‘The Authority Havmg Jurisdiction, when Hecessary 'y, may call’ upon the Police Department and other Cdy and

County of Sari F1an<nsco agencies foraid or: asslstance in carrying out or enforcmg any of the provisions of
this code. :

1034 Revise the Sirst parag aph of this section as fol!ows
103.4 Right of Enfry.
»othel codes or ordinances

1769



103.5 Add the following section:
103.5 Rules and Regulations. The Authority Having Jmlsdm’uo
. interpretations of this code and to adopt and enforce rules and suf
app11cat10n of its pr ov151ons Such 1nterpretat10ns rules and I

“Administrative Bulletins” supplemental to this code,
Inspection Commission and signed by the Authority;

Having T urisdiction shall arrange for a sub
which is to be borne by the subscribers.
103.6 Add the following section:
103.6 Code Revisions. The Ay
Commission, at intervals not,

interested pe1 sons.
6. Investigations of
- building performance.
7. Penodlc changes to thy
code
8. Administrative Bulletins and"Code Rulings currently in effect.
9. Violations of the code found on inspections or investigations.
103.7 Add the following section:

103.7 Modifications. When there are practical difficulties involved in carrying out the provisions of this
code, the Authority Having Jurisdiction may grant modifications for individual cases. The Authority Having
Jurisdiction shall first find that a special individual reason makes the strict letter of this code impractical and
that the modification is in conformance with the intent and purpose of this code and that such modification
does not lessen the standard of this code to safeguard life or limb, health, property, or public welfare. The
details of any action granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the files of the Department of

1770



Building Inspection.

1 04 1 Add the following as the second paragraph of this section:

Emergency work for the protection of life or limb, health, property and public welfare shall have a permit
obtained within one day of commencing such work, excluding Saturdays, Sundays and legal holidays.
104.1.1 Add the following section:

104.1.1 Homeowner’s Permit. A permit for plumbing work in, on or about a smgle family dwelling may
be issued by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, provided said work is done by the owner or a family member
who has demonstrated, to the satisfaction of the administrative auth s his or her qualifications to
satisfactorily perform the plumbing work in the dwelling which is; or1s intended to be, occupied by the
owner. If the plumbing work performed under the homeowne i

actor under a separate permit.
it issuance fee as set forth in
n Fees - of the Building

Reports - of the Building Code shall appl
104.1.2 Add the following section:
.104.1.2 Amending Applications. Aftera

made, the scope of the permit
additional work as set forth i

(6) Removal of drainage;
lines have been disconnected:
(7) ‘Work involved in setting:
supply or drainage lines, in a sal

st display of plumbing fixtures or appliances, when not cornected to any
tablishment.

(8) Replacement of water conservation devices not requiring cutting into or removal of piping.
(9) Work performed in buildings or structures owned and occupied by the State and Federal governments.
104.3 Replace this section as follows:

Permit apphcants shall ﬁle Wlth the Department of Building Inspection an
application on a form furnished for that purpose.

A permit for inspection of the proposed plumbing work set forth in the application will be issued to State-
licensed contragtors or to homeowners subject to the requirements of Section 104.1.1. A separate permit shall
be obtained for each separate building, structure or property.

1771



Replace this section as follows:

Inspections Not Covered by Permit Fees.
104.3.2.1 Off Hours of Inspection. Off-hour inspection may be performed outside normal inspection
hours by prior arrangement and prepayment of fees as set forth in Section 110A, Table 1A-G - Inspections,
Surveys and Reports - of the Building Code.

- 104.3.2.2 Reinspections. A reinspection fee shall be assessed for each inspection or relnspection made
necessary by any of the following conditions: , .

(1) When the portion of the work for which the inspection is requested is not complete or code complying.
(2) When previously identified deficiencies in the work are not properly corrected.

(3) When the approved construction documents are not available to;the inspector.

(4) When access is not provided on the date and time of the 1nsp‘ n appointment.

(5) When work deviates from the approved construction d
The first reinspection for failure to comply with code requiy

Al esiald

all not be assessed a reinspection fee.

approval until the required reinspection fees are paid. Seg
and Reports - of the Building Code for applicable fees."

. umbing inspector’s‘assistance is desired
to establish code compliance of existing orp S i ; requirements. See Section 110A,

104.4 Add a new second paragraph
An issued permit entitles the
does not constitute approv:
.3 Replace this section a

erein. The issuance of a permit
its shall not be transferable.

104.4.3.1
be obtained to underta
more than one year ha
reduced fees. See Sectio
Code for applicable fees.
If a refund has been granted
set forth in Section 110A, Table
104.4.3.2 Add the following section: ‘
104.4.3.2 Recommencement of Work on Permit Expired Due to Work Not Completed. The applicant
shall obtain a new permit for the work not completed. The permit fee shall be based on work remaining to be
done. Fees shall be as set forth in Section 1104, Table 1A-C - Plumblng/Mechanlcal Permit Issuance and
Inspection Fees of the Building Code.
tion as follows:
. Before any perrmt is issued, the applicant shall pay to the Central Permit Bureau the
fees as set forth in Section 110A , Table 1A-C - Plumbing/ Mechanical Permit Issuance and Inspection Fees -

expiration of the original permit, the apphcant is eligible f01
-B - Other Building Permit and Plan Review Fees - of the Building

on 104.4.3, the applicant shall not be eligible for the reduced fees as
B - Other Building Permit and Plan Review Fees - of the Building Code.

4

1772 .



of the Building Code. The replacement of a plumbing fixture or a gas appliance without ac change in drainage,
piping or venting shall not require the payment of permit issuance fee. A separate permit issuance fee shall be
paid for each class of work, i.e., sewers and drainage, gas and water.

Final mspectlon Wﬂl not be made unless all outstanding fees related to the permit work have been paid.

ee Section 110A , Table 1A-C - ﬁ&mbmg/l\ie&lamcal Permit
K- Penalties, Hearings, Code Enforcement Assessments - of the

Section 110A, Table 1A-C - Plumbing/Mechanical Permit Iss
Code for work that was constructed prior to the current buildi
was done prior to January 1, 1967, if the owner files with th
documents substantiating such dates of work.

Appeals of investigation fees may be filed with th

Inspection Fees - of the Building
hip or for work without permit which

Board of Appeals. The Board of Appeals, in reviewing’
Jess than two times the permit fee as set forth in Section 1TQA,
Issuance and Inspection Fees - of the Buil
104.5.3 Replace this section as follows:

ection 1104, Table 1A-G

- Inspections,

r the owner’s authorized agent, who violates, disobeys, omits,

sts or opposes the execution of any of the provisions of this code,
exceed $500 for each day such violation is committed or permitted to
continue, which penalty shall b sed and recovered in a civil action brought in the name of the people of
the City and County of San Fran by the City Attorney in any court of competent jurisdiction. Any
penalty assessed and recovered in an action brought pursuant to this paragraph shall be paid to the City
Treasurer and credited to the Department of Building Inspection’s Special Fund.

Any person, the owner or the owner’s authorized agent, who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects or refuses
to comply with, or who resists or opposes the execution of any of the provisions of this code, shall be guilty
of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof shall be punished by a fine not exceeding $500 or by
imprisonment not exceeding six months, or by both such fine and imprisonment, unless otherwise provided
in this code, and shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for every day such violation, disobedience,
omission, neglect or refusal shall continue. Any person who shall do any work in violation of any of the
provisions of this code, and any person having charge of such work who shall permit it to be done, shall be

1773



}OS,LO 107. 0 Board of Examlners. Appllcatidn may be'miac

a1d'of Examiners for approval of
,altemate matenals methods and types of constmc'aon anid fol

from the piovisions of this-code. See-

02160 of this -
ing Cods, including; . -

placmg defective buﬂd:mg seWers. The special revolvmg j'ﬁ
under the proceeding heteinaffer provided for; eithier upon voli 7 payments « L] €58
property after dehnquenoy, ot otherwise. Balances 1ema1mng in thé Plumbmg Bmldmg Sewer Revolvmg
Fund 4t the close of any: fiscal year shall be carried forward in such fimd. ’

1104 109 4 Assessmeiit for Costs. ‘The Authonty Having Junsdmuon shall take action to have the costs of

B

1774



e L_ n]ﬂ I\‘F‘

all ' work doneé or caused to be done pursuant to this Section 109.0 assessed agaﬂ ist Lh\/ parccl ot parcels of
larid upon which said building is served by the building sewer per Section 102A of the Building Code. Such
costs shall include, in addition to all costs telated to repairing or 1eplacu1g the buiilding sewer or demohshmg
and clearing the site, the City and County of San Francisco’s costs in administering the required work. See:
Section 110A, Table 1A-K - Penalties, Healmgs, Code Enforcement Assessments of the Buﬂdmg Code for-
the applicable fee. ,

201 ] Aa’d lhe followzng 1o the end of rhe f irst sexitéitce;
Where words, terms and phrases are not deﬁned they shall:
context with which they ate used.

ary accepted meaning within the

(5) Inadequ_
(6) Plumbing ¢
pemnt

and plumbmg ﬁ‘dures

1775



22 1 0 Add the followmg definitioni
Stoz:y Tha,t pOl’tl of g bulldmg mcluded between the uppel surface of any ﬂo Uy

constmcﬂon that prov1des Ot ot e drmklng fountams shall
rancisco. Ernvironidént:Code’ Sec’uon 2304

‘floor of g1ade sha]l be prov1ded W1th a pennanent pIaifonn oapable of suppm’cmg a ‘ceste1 ot mamtenance
person.- : :

1776



SECTION{, 03;., NECT
603.1 Add athird paragr apl to ﬂvls section as foi]ows
Structures with altemate Wwater piping shall have a Reduced-Préssure Principle Backflow: Prevention
Assémbly installed on the domestic supply as close as practical to. the metel '
603.3 Add asecond paiagr aph 10 this section as follows: .
Referto SFPUC?s Rules & Regs: Section “A and/or G Cross connect
the CPC. The moré stringent shall apply.
603.5.6.4 Add the following section
603.5.6.4 All such 111stallat10ns shaﬂ be apploved in Wu‘tm'
mstallanon )

| Control”, Table 1 and Table 603.2 of

an Franciseo Water Department prior to

6! 04 1 Add ﬂze fol[owmg Senterce to the end of the second para,

Conneotlons between coppe1 Watel plpmg and fenous ) liglectric or insulated:

A common area. mthm The bulld
606 3 Rewse ﬂ’IIS section as fol[ow.v

606 3.1 Add thé fo}lovhng section: -
606.3.1 Any apartment / unit / dwellmg or condommlum where a remodel is perfonned shall miget the

requirernents of sections 606.2, 606.3 and 606 5

606.5 Revise thzs sectron as follows

1777



and cold water: supply and
fixtures.
606 9 Aa'd ﬂzejbllowmgsecﬂon,

compmiercial o

70] 7( 7) A dd the fol[owmgsec

| .mtegnty of coppel tubing;

:J In bmldmgs more than three stones in helght any fixture

10

1778



within 10 feet (304 mm) of the commection of the vertical to horizontal s euqngc shall entes the horizontal
drainage line at least 10 feet (304 mm) downstream ﬁom the chatige or may. connect into the next vertxcal

downstleam hne

7] 0 1.1 Addthe Sfollowing section:
710.1.1 Dralnage of Fixtures Located Below the Fresh Air Inlet. Where 4 fixture is. mstaﬂed w1th the
ﬂood 1im level equal to or 1owe1 than the elevatlon of the fresh air ml’ t serving’ the house tlap, the p1pmg

install‘e’d Wlth theﬂood r'im: 1€Ve1h1gher than the elevotioﬁ of th
fixture shall not discharge through such backwater valve,

SEcﬁomofo GENERA

‘drainage stack at or i
‘ 907 3 Addthe 2 following secz‘lon
907:3 Vent Stacks and Relief Vents. Bver Y buﬂdmg in which; plumbmg is installed shall have at.Jeast one
smainistack which shall run iindiminished in size dnd as divectly as- poss1b1e from each buﬂdmg drain servmg

said buiilding thiotigh to the open air above the roof:
For the purposes-of this section, the main stack shall be defined as the Ialgest size. stack that is connected to
a bulldmg drain or sewer..
A vent stack shall be installed with & soil or ‘waste stack whenever relief vents or other branch vents are
1equned in two.or more branch intervals. A vent stack shall be installed in accordance with Section 706.1:
The size of the soil stack shall be determined by the total fixture units on that stack as per Table 703.2.

11

1779



1001.:3" Add the f&lbﬁz’ng section;
1001.3. Placement and Mini
a buﬂdlng t1ap placed_ ases

Tmum Size of Buﬂdmg T1 ap
‘s posmble to the curb Tine. 0

fres
mm), dlameter plpe The mlet sk
(10 323, mm:’“) Perforatlons S

trap shall be mstalled
Table703.2;

Catch basins or: sumps to
,requuements

pievent mosqu1to g
(3) “Each: catch basin shall be served with its own trap: and cleanout and shall: connect to the storiior
sanitary system independently.
(4), If inlet is Iocated below the buﬂdmg sewer:or drain; a: sump pump minimim of 1-1/2" (38 1 mm)
~ outlet may be used. The bottom of: sump shall mainfain a e (304 8 mm) distarice fiom the inlet, cmatmg a
1'- 0" (3048 rrim) sand frap, - |
(5) Ifthe depth of the sump is over 5% 0" (1.52.m)a 1arge1 catch basm shall be requited with a permanent.
laddel secutely bolted to the inferior to plOVIdE access for mainteriance, A. minimun clear space of 30" x 30"

:]_2

1780



(/04 mim. X /64 mm) shall be provided.
(6) A listed and approved plastic catch basin may be installéd in ateas of residential buildings that are not
subjected to any vehicular traffic and shall be installed on a concrete base to prevent settling, pmwded all

other code 1equnements of this sec’uon and the listing and installafion 1eqm1ements of such catch basin are
met..

1 ] 01 2 1 Add the fbllowmgseclzon :
1101.2.1 Leaders, Connection to Drain. All storm wate
hghtwells cour tya1 ds or sumlar areas Whlch total mow*th"

{0 an approved altemate
drainage shall not be’ dnectedto flow .

same 1equ1rements as. Sectmn 1103. 0of the Cahtouua &
1101.2.2 Add'the following section:.
_ 110122 Temporary Provisions. Whe
drainage system may. dlscharge into the ses
‘poss1ble

1101.2.3 Addthe following sectiop: -

© 1101.2.3 Temporary Provisions-Drain Tr: h visions of Section 1101.2.2 the

building stormwater drainage system discharges to‘the sewer, a tr Hall be placed in that d1 ain ata pomt
near where-it branches into the’sewer: The-tr

. as a hose bibb or trap primier.

Gas plpmg in extérior 100at
steel, with galvamzed fittings.

No San Francisco Plunibing Code Amendmehz‘s R

1781



FIRE ST OP PROTECTION

No.San Francisco Plimbing Code Amendmem‘s

No SmTEanciSCO P Z“mbmg COdeAmendmem‘S | -

12

1782



| , Appendlx [
INSTALLATION STANDARD FOR PEX TUBING
SYSTEMS FOR HOT- AND COLD-WATER

DISTRIBUTION
No San Francisco PZumbmg Code Amendments.
Appendlx J , |
COMBINATION OF INDO()R OUTDOOR
COMBUSTION AND VENTILAT OPENING DESIGN

No San Francisco Plumbzng Code Amendmem‘s ;

" Tellegana\asZ019\1900415\01391480.docx.

15

1783



9.

EXHIBIT A

STANDARD FINDINGS FOR SAN FRANCISCO
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AMENDMENTS

. Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk for

earthquake-induced failure and consequent fire due to local hazardous
microzones, slide areas, and local liquefaction hazards.
(Geology)

Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk of
fire due to high density of buildings on very small lots, with many buildings
built up to the property lines. (Topography)

Topography of San Francisco has let to development of a high density of
buildings on small lots, necessitating special provisions for exiting, fire
separation, or fire-resistive construction. (Topography)

. Many buildings are built on steep hills and narrow streets, requmng

special safety consideration. (Topography)

Additional fire, structural and other protection is required due to high
building density and crowded occupancy. (Topography)

San Francisco has narrow, crowded sidewalks due to building and
population density and unusual topography. (Topography)

All rain water in San Francisco drains to the building drains and sewer;
unusual geology, occasional extremely high local rainfall amounts, and
the configuration of the City as a peninsula restrict the installation of

‘separate storm water and sewer systems. (Topography, Climate,

Geology)

Moist, corrosive atmosphere of salt-laden fog in San Francisco
necessitates additional requirements. (Climate)

Not a building standard; nb local findings required.

10. Soil conditions in this region induce adverse reactions with some

materials, leading to premature failures and subsequent unsanitary
conditions. (Climate)

11. The region is subject to fluctuating rainfall due to changes in climatic
conditions. (Climate)

1784



12.San Francisco is a peninsula surrounded on three sides by water at sea
level; mitigation of climate change impacts, including sea level rise, is’
critical to the long term protection of the local built environment and local
infrastructure. (Topography)

13.Climate and potential climate change impacts San Francisco’s water
resources, including reservoirs and distribution facilities. (Climate)

14.Organic material in San Francisco’s waste breaks down into methane gas
which is a significant contributor to climate change. (Climate)

15.San Francisco is topographically constrained and its built environment
occupies most available land, requiring minimization of debris and solid
waste. (Topography)

16. Prevailing winds, coastal mountain ranges, and periodic seasonal high
temperatures contribute to photochemical reactions that produce smog
and ozone; limiting the emission of smog’s chemical precursors - volatile
organic chemicals and oxides of nitrogen - is necessary to health and
safety. (Climate, Topography)

17.The aquifers underlying San Francisco are small relative to local

population, necessitating ongoing water imports and special provisions to
ensure efficient use of water in local buildings. (Geology)

1785



2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code Findings

Section #, | Finding # “Section # Finding #
CHAPTER 1 104.4.3 9
1011 9 104.4,3.1 9
103.1 9 104.4.3.2 ] 9
103.4 9 1045 9
103.5 9 10452 9
103.6 B 104.5.3 9
1103.7 9 105.2.6 9
104.1 9 106.3 | 9
104.1.1 9 106.5 9
104.1.2 9 107.0 | 9
1042 9 108.0 | 9
1043 | 9 109.0 | 9
1104.3.2 9 109.1 .9
104.3.2.1 9 109.2 - 9
104.3.2.2 9 109.3 | ' 9
104.3.2.3 9 1 109.4 9
104.4 9 |

1786




Section# |  Finding # Section # |  Finding #
CHAPTER 2 CHAPTER 3
201.1 , 9 313.9 - 1
204.0 9 - |3139.1 1
208.0 9 313.9;2 1
216.0 _' 9
218.0 9
2210 9
CHAPTER 4 ,' CHAPTER 5
405.4 7,10 504.1 4,9
415.2.1 13
CHAPTER 6 CHAPTER 7

6031 4 701.2(2)(a) 5,10
603.3 9 | 701.2(3) 1
603.5.6.4 9 701.2(7) 5
604.1 5 706.4 5,7
606.2 | 4 710.1.1 | 5,7
606.3 4 _ |

- ' CHAPTER 8 ,
606.3.1 4,9 No San Francisco Amendments
606.5 4 ~ CHAPTER 9 |
606.9 5,7 901.1 ; 5,7
609.102 | 4 907.1 2,4,14,16

1787




P—

[—

609.10.3

4.9 907.3 2,4,14,16
Section # | Finding # Section # Finding #
CHAPTER 10
1001.3 3,7
1008.1 4,7
1016.3.1 4,7
CHAPTER 11 CHAPTER 12
1101.2.1 12,13,15 1208.5.1 16
CHAPTER 13 ,
1101.2.2 12,13,15 No San Francisco Amendments
' , _ CHAPTER 14
1101.2.3 12,13,15 | No San Francisco Amendments
CHAPTER 15 CHAPTER 16 & 16A
No San Francisco Amendments | No San Francisco Amendments
CHAPTER 17 Appendix A, B, D, H, |, J
No San Francisco Amendments | No San Francisco Amendments

n:\legana\as2019\1900415\01393209.doc

1788




\F

P

E\!w

BUILDING INSPEGTION commssmN (BIC). Y e saug

--Px I

. LondnnN Bree&
Mayor’

CONRISSION
BhgusMeCarihy
‘P‘n‘e’sident'
Debra Walker

Ketin Ci’ncﬁ '
John Konstine
.Frank Lee

Sam Mass
-James Warshell

E aonya Hargs
Secrefary

ShldeyWDng

~Assmtant Secxeﬁuy

TomE; Hui
5
¢80, Diestor

’f’)Ul CR

Department of Building Inspection  Voice (41&6)‘\5537 81645 ¥8d4415) 558-6509
1660 Mission Street, San Francisco, Cahfornla 941 03-2 '51 AM Ot 58

Sz.(l o : .,...;.t’;_.-g-aw'.wr-j_:"?

August 12, 2019

Ms. Angela Calvillo
Clerk of the Board
Board of Supervisors, City Hall

1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244

San Francisco, CA 94102-4694

* RE: Code afnendments to the 2019 California Building Sfandards Code, .

including the Building, Existing Building, Residential, Mechanical,

. Plumbing, Electrical, and Green Building Codes and recommend approval

to the Board of Supervxsors

- Dear Ms. Calvillo:

~ On July 17, 2019 the Building Inspection Commission held a public

hearing.on-the proposed Code amendments referenced above.

The Commission voted unanimously (6-0) to recommend that the Board of
Supervisors approve the amendments.

The Commissioners voted as follows:

Vice-President Walker Yes
Commissioner Konstin Excused
Commissioner Moss Yes

President McCarthy - Yes
Commissioner Clinch  Yes
Commissioner Lee Yes
Commissioner Warshell Yes

Enclosed please find the Code Advisory Committee’s recommendation to the .

BIC. Under separate cover, copies of the proposed amendments will follow
from the Technical Services Division of the Department of Building Inspection.

Should you have any questions, p‘lease do not hesitate to_call me at 558-6164.

Sincerely,

Lo

Sonya Harris
Commission Secretary

17889



CG:

Tom C. Hui, S.E., C.B.O., Director
Mayor London N. Breed
Supervisor Vallie Brown
Supervisor Sandra Lee Fewer
Supervisor Matt Haney
Supervisor Rafael Mandelman
Supervisor Gordon Mar
Supervisor Aaron Peskin
Supervisor Hillary Ronen
Supervisor Ahsha Safai
Supervisor Catherine Stefani
Supervisor Shamann Walton
Supervisor Norman Yee

Deputy City Attorney Robb Kapla

1790

Q—



President, l_).ist_jri'ét?
BOARD of SUPERVISORS

4 .}FaxNo 554-’7674
TDD/TTY Nn 544 6546,

"-»,Aurv""i‘,}g—"*‘

* Norman Yee

© PRESIDENTIAL ACTION

Date?

To: - Angeh Calvillo, Clerk of the Board of Supervisms

Madam Clexk,
Pursuant to Boald Rules l am heteby:

X Walvmg, SO‘Day Rule.Board Rule No. 3.23)

‘Department
* (Ptimaty Sponsor)

o gy -0 (ommike.
Duranon Pamal o v - O Full Meeting

D Start Time

B :4 :x.' e >
Norman Yee, President
Board of Supetvisors

1791



City and County of San Francisco
Department of Building Inspection

London N. Breed
¢ Qi C. Hui, S.E,, C.B.O., Director

" September 20, 2019

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board

. Board of Supervisors
#1 Dr, Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244
San Francisco, CA 94102-4689 -

Dear Ms. Calvillo:

Attached please find an original and two copies (1 electronic CD) of seven proposed ordinances
(approved by the.Building Inspection-Commission on July 17, 2019) for the Board of Supervisors
approval, which repeal the San Francisco amendments to the 2016 California Building Standards
Codes and adopt replacement amendments to the new 2019 California Building Standards Codes
effective January 1, 2019. (One copy of these 2019 California Building Standards Codes are
hereby provnded for your reference.)

" The following is a list of accompanying documents:

1) Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission

2) San Francisco Building Code and Residential Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest), EXhlblt
A Standard Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text (Building)

3) 'San Francisco Existing Building Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard

- Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text. (Existing Building)

4) San Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Flndmgs

Findings, proposed amendment text (Electrical) -
. B) 8an Francisco Mechanical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard

Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text (Mechanical)

6) -San Francisco Plumbing Code QOrdinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Findings,
Findings, proposed amendmehnt text (Plumbing)

*7) San Francisco Green Building Code Ordinance, Legisiative Digest, Exhibit A Standard
Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text. (Green), Cost effectiveness study.

In order for the San Francisco code amendments to coordinate with the California codes, which have
‘an effective date of January 1, 2019, the timeline for approval and adoption requires that the codes be
submitted to the Board of Supervisors on or before September 23, 2019 for introduction and
assignment to the Land Use Committee (on October 1, 2019). We will be requesting a waiver to the
thirty-day rule prior to hearing at the Land Use Committee such that the Codes may be heard by the
Land Use Committee on October 7, 2019. When approved, it is proposed that the Board of Supervisor
agendize Readings on October 15, 2019 and October 22, 2019. Upon their approval, the ordinances
will be forwarded to the Mayor for signature within 10 days, followed by a 30-day wait period (ending
approximately December 9, 2019) before filing with the California Building Standards Commission to
become effective for an implementation date of January 1, 2020.

Technical Services Division
1660 Mission Street ~ San Francisco GA 94103
Office (415) 558-6205—- FAX (415) 558-6401 — www.sfdbi.org

1792



TN Y
} | )

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board : Page 2 of 2 September 20, 2019

The following person may be coﬁtacted regarding this matter:

Michelle Yu, Manager

Technical Services Division
Department of Building Inspection
Phone: (415) 558-6059

- Attachments: As stated

Technical Services Division
1660 Mission Street — San Francisco CA 94103
Office (415) 575-6205-~ FAX (415) 558-6401 — www.sfdbi.org

1793



o

S

Table of Content

General

a. Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission
Building Code and Residential Building Requirements

a. Legislativé Digest
San Francisco Building Code Ordinance including Residential Building Requirements
Exhibit A — Standard Flndlngs
Findings .
San Francisco Building Code Amendments

f. Residential Building Requirements — See Chapter 36 of the San Francisco Building Code
Existing Building Code

a. Legislative Digest

~b. - San Francisco Exnstmg Building Code Ordlnance

c. Exhibit A—Standard Findings

d. Findings

e. San Francisco Existing Building Code Amendments
Electrical Code '

a. Legislativé Digest

b. San Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance

c. Exhibit A —Standard Findings

d. Findings

e. San Francisco Electrical Code Amendments
Mechanical Code ' '

a. Legislative Digest

b. SanFrancisco Mechanical Code Ordmance

c. Exhibit A —Standard Findings

d. Findings

e. San Francisco Mechanical Code Amendments
Plumbing Code

a. Legislative Dlgest

'b. San Francisco Plumbing Code Ordinance-

¢. Exhibit A —Standard Findings

d. . Findings-

e. San Francisco Plumblng Code Amendments
Green Building Code

a. Legislative Digest
San Francisco Green Building Code Ordinance
Exhibit A —Standard Findings
Findings
San Francisco‘Green Building Code Amendments
Nonresidential New Construction Reach Code Cost Effectiveness Study
Cost-effectiveness Study: Low-Rise Residential New Construction

P apn o

@ e o0 o

1794



