File No.

Board of Supervisors Meeting

160947 ~ Committee Item No.

Committee: Land Use and Transportation

Board Item No.

| COMMITTEE/BOARD OF SUPERVISORS

- AGENDA PACKET CONTENTS LIST

Date .October 31,2016

- Cmte Board

X1
X0

X

N >

¢

1

@)
-
I
1)}
A

Completed by: ___Alisa Somera
Completed by: __ Aliso Somem

OOOOOSKIRXX

DDDDDE&mmm

Motion

Resolution

Ordinance

Legislative Digest

Budget and Legislative Analyst Report
Youth Commission Report
Introduction Form

Department/Agency Cover Letter and/or Report
Memorandum of Understanding (MOU)
Grant Information Form

Grant Budget -

Subcontract Budget
Contract/Agreement

Form 126 - Ethics Commission

Award Letter

Application

Form 700

Vacancy Notice

Information Sheet

Public Correspondence

(Use back side if additional space is needed)

OEQA Determinadion

Date November 52010

Findinas

Comections Ust

201lp Colifornia Code

Wi intemahional Code

Date October 27; 2016

5 "~ Date _November 1,206



—

FILE NO. 160947 | ORDINANCE 2.

[Existing Building Code - Enactment of New Code]

Ordinance enacting a 2016 San Francisco Exfsting Building Code consisting of the
2016 California Existing Building Code with San Francisco amendments; adopting

environmental findings.and findings of local conditions under the California Health and

‘ Safety Code; providing for an operative date of January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk

of the Board to forward the leglslatlon to the Callfornla Building Standards

Commission as required by State law.

NOTE: Unchanged Code text and uncodified text are in plain Arla}“font
Additions to Codes are in single-underline italics Times New Roman font.
Deletions to Codes are in strikethrough-itaties-TimesNew-Roman-font.
Board amendment additions are in d double-underlined Arial fon
Board amendment deletions are in
Asterisks (* ** *)indicate the omission of unchanged Code
subsections or parts of tables.

Be it ordained by the People of the City and County of San Francisco:

Be it Qrd'ained by the Peopl’e of the City and County of San Francisco:
Section'1 . Environmental Findings. The Planning Department has determihed thatthe
actions contemplated in this ordinanée comply with the California Environmental Quality Act |
(California Public Resources Code Sections 21000 et seq.)..' Said determination is on file with

the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors in File No. 160947 and is incorporated herein by

reference. The Board affirms this determination. - e
|
Section 2. General Fmdlngs : o fi’

(@)  The State of California adopts anew Cahforma Bundmg Standards Code every

three years (the “triennial State Code”) with supplements published in mtervenmg years. The

Building Inspection Commission .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS L Page 1

4188




© o ~N o ¢ A W N -

N N N N N N - -3 — - —_ —_ - —_ —_
[6 BN N w N - o «© . N O o1 BN w N - O

triennial State Code goes into effect throughout the State of California 180 days after its -

publication by the California Building Standards Commission or at a later date established by

‘the Commission.

(b)  The California Building Standards Code is contained in Title 24 of the California
Code of Regulations. It consists of 12 Parts based upon model codes that are amended by

the State agencies with jurisdiction over the subject matter. The California Existing Building‘

"Code is Part 10 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations. The 2016 California Existing

Building Code will go into effect throughout California on January 1, 2017,

()  Localjurisdictions must enforce ;che California Building Standards Codé but they
may also enact more restrictive building étandards that are reasonably necessary because of
local conditions caused by climate, geology, or topography. Local amendments may be made

to a triennial State Code and also throughout the intervéning years. However, local

;i amendments previously adopted are not automatically applicable to a new friennial State

Code. Rather, they. must be re-enacted with the required findings of local conditions,
expressly made applicablé to the new triennial State Cdde, and with an operative date no
earlier than the effective date of the new State Code.

(d)  San Francisco's existing bﬁilding réquirements curl;ently are contained in
Chapter 34 of the Building Code._ |

()  Pursuant to Charter Section D3.750-5, the Building Inspection Commission
considered and ap'proved San Francisco’s amendments to the 2016 California Existing

Building Code at a duly noticed public hearing that was held on August 17, 2016.

Section 3. Findings regarding Local Conditions.
(a)  California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 provide that

before making any changes or modifications to the California Existing Building Code and any

 Building Inspection Commission :
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS . Page 2

4189




—

N N M N N N 4S8 - aa o v = e = v

|| other applicable provisions published by the California Building Standards Commission, the:

governing body must make an express finding that each such change or modification is
reasonably necessary because of specified local conditions. The local amendménts together -
with the required findings must be filed with the California Building Standards Commission
before the local changes or modifications can go into effect.

(b) | The City and County of San Francisco is unique among California communities
with respect to local climatic, _geological, topographical, and other conditions. A specific list of

findings that support San Francisco's modifications to the 2016 California Existing Building

!l Code, with a section-by-section correlation of each modification with a specific numbered:

| finding, are contained in Exhibit A entitled "Standard Findings for San Francisco Building

Standards Code Amendments.” ,
-(c) Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5,'

the Board of Supervisors finds and determines that the local conditions described in Exhibit A

. constitute a general summary of the most significant local conditions giving rise to the need

for modification of the 2016 California Existing Building Code provisions published by the

‘California Building Standards Commission. The Board of Supervisors further finds and

determines that the proposed modifications are reasonably necessary based upon the local

conditions set forth in Exhibit A.

Section 4. Enactment of 2016 San Francisco Existing Building Code. The 2016 San
Francisco Existing Building Code is hereby enacted. It consists of the 2016 California Existing
Building Code as amended by San Francisco. San Francisco’s existing building requirements,
which are contained in Chapter 34 of the 2013 San Francisco Building Code, are re-enacted
and expressly made applicable to the 2016 California Existing Building Qod_e. Copies of the - -

2016 California Existing Building Code and the stand-alone San Francisco amendments are

Building Inspection Commission )
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS : . - Page3

4190




—_

B |
N - O

14
15
16
17
18
19
20

21 -

22
23
24
25

© o N o g R W N

declared to be part of Board File No. 160947 and are incorporated into this ordinance by
reference as though fully set forth. Additions to the 2016 California Existing Building Code are

shown in bold underlined type; deletions are shown with bold strikethrough type.

Section 5. Continuance of Actions Under Prior Code. Nothing contained in this
ordinance shall be construed as abating any action now pending under or by virtue of any
ordinance of the City and County of San Francisco hereby repealed, nor shall this ordinance

be construed as discontinuing, abating, modifying or altering any penalties accruing, or to

| accrue, or as waiving any right of the City under any such ordinance.

Section 6. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or-phrase of this

ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the

i1 remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would

have passed this ordinance, and each éection, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this

Ordinance, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences,

clauses, or phrases be declared invalid.

Section 7. Effective and Operative Dates. This ordinance shall become effective 30
days after' enactment. Enactment occurs when the Mayoréigns the ordinance, the Mayor
returns the ordinance unsigned 6r does not sign the ordinance within ten days of receivingit,
or the Board of Supervisors overrides the Mayor’s veto of the ordinance. This ordinance shall
take éffect and be in full force on and after either January 1, 2017 or its effective date if the

effective date is later.

Building Inspection Commission .
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 4

4191




—

© o ~N O o A W N

N N S O N UL U A G O G §

Section 8. Directions to Clerk. Upon final passage of thié ordinance, the Clerk of the
Board of Supervisors is hereby directed to transmit this ordinance with the Exhibit A
attachment and the San Francisco hnodiﬁcations to the 2016 California Existing Building Code
to the California Building Standards Commission pursuant to the applicable provisions of

State léw.

APPROVED AS TO FORM:
DENNIS J. HERRERA, City Attorney

L4N
By: wAiK L & “G gy o1V
. ITHA.BOYAJIAN ¢ 7
puty City Attorney '
n:land\as2016\1600669\01130885.docx

Building Inspection Commission

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 5

4192




FILE NO. 160947

LEGISLATIVE DIGEST

[Existing Building Code - Enactment of New Code]

Ordinance enacting a 2016 San Francisco Existing Building Code consisting of the
2016 California Existing Building Code with San Francisco amendments; adopting
‘environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the California Health and
Safety Code; providing for an operative date of January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk
of the Board to forward the legislation to the California Building Standards
Commission as required by State law. '

Existing Law
The California Existing Building Code regulates additibns alterations, or repairs to existing .
buildings, structures, and property. In San Francisco, the requirements for exnstlng buildings
currently are contained in Chapter 34 of the Bunldmg Code.

Amendments to Current Law

On January 1, 2017, a 2016 California Existing Building Code will go into effect throughout the

State. In this State Code adoption cycle, San Francisco will enact a new San Francisco :
Existing Building Code and incorporate into it the requirements of Chapter 34 of the 2013 San
Francisco Building Code as amendments to the 2016 California Existing Building Code (“San

Francisco Amendments”).

The San Francisco Amendments are not integrated into the text of the California Codes but
rather are separately printed in a stand-alone document. Therefore, the user must consult
both texts in order to determine the complete code requirement. In the San Francisco

Amendments, additions to the 2016 California Existing Building Code are shown in bold type;
- deletions are shown with strikethrough.

Background Information

The State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code every three years
(the “triennial State Code”) with supplements published in intervening years. The triennial
State Code goes into effect throughout the State 180 days after its publication by the
California Building Standards Commission or at a later date established by the Commission.
In the current triennial State Code adoption cycle, the California Building Standards Code will
go into effect on January 1, 2017. The California Building Standards Code is contained in Title
24 of the California Code of Regulations, and consists of several parts that are based upon
model codes with amendments made by the State agencies with jurisdiction over the subject
matter. The California Existing Bu1ld|ng Code is Part 10 of Title 24 of the California Code of
Regulations.

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS ' . Page1
4193




FILE NO. 160947

Local jurisdictions must enforce the California Building Standards Code but they may also
enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of local
conditions caused by climate, geology, or topography. Local amendments may be made to a
triennial State Code and also throughout the intervening years. However, local amendments
previously adopted are not automatically applicable to a new triennial State Code. Rather,
they must be re-enacted with the required findings of local conditions, expressly made
applicable to the new friennial State Code, and with an operative date no earlier than the
effective date of the new State Code.

n:\legana\as2016\1600669\01131593.doc

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS i Page'2
4194



City Hall
Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett P!ace, Room 244

BOARD of SUPERVISORS San Francisco 94102-4689
‘ Tel. No. 554-5184
- Fax No. 554-5163
TDD/TTY No. 554-5227
QOctober 6; 2016
. Lisa Gibson

Acting Environmental Review Officer
Planning Department :
1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400

San Francisco, CA 94103

‘Dear Ms. Gibson:

On September 6, 2016, Building Inspection Commission untroduced the following
proposed leg!slatlons

File No. 160944

Ordinance repealing the 2013 Buﬂdmg Code in its entlrety and enacting a 2016
Building Code consisting of the 2016 California Building -Code and the 2016
California Residenfial Code, as amended by San Francisco; adopting
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the California
Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of January 1, 2017; and
directing the Clerk of the Board to forward the legislation fo the California
Building Standards Commission as required by State [aw.

File No. 160945 '

Ordinance adding the provnslons of the 2016 Cahforma Residential Code with
local amendments into various chapiers of the 2016 San Francisco Building -
Code, and adding Chapter 36 to the Building Code 1o serve-as a directory of
where such provisions may be found; adopting -environmental findings and
findings of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code;
providing for an operative date of January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk of the
Board to forward the legislation to the Cahforma Building Standards Commission
as reqwred by State law. .

File No. 160946 T

Ordinance repealing the 2013 Electrical Code in its entirety and enacting a 2016
Electrical Code consisting of the 2018 California Electrical Code as amended by
San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings of local conditions
under the California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of
January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward
the legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as requ;red by
State law. .

4195




File No. 160947 A .
Ordinance enacting a 2016 San Francisco Existing Building Code consisting of
the 2016 California Existing Building. Code with San Francisco amendments;
adopting environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of January 1,
2017; and directing the Clerk of the Board to forward the legislation to the
Califernia Building Standards Commission as required by State law.

File No. 160948 . : ‘

Ordinance repealing the 2013 Green Building Code in its entirety and enacting a
2016 Green Building Code consisting of the 2016 California Green Building
Standards Code as amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings
and findings of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code;
providing for an operative date of January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk of the
Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building
Standards Commission as required by State law. '

File No. 160949 , : .

 Ordinance repealing the 2013 Mechanical Code in its entirety and enacting a
2016 Mechanical Code consisting of the 2016 California Mechanical Code as
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings of local
conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative
date of January 1, 2017, and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to
forward the legislation to the California Building Standaids Commission as
required by State law. ' '

File No. 160950

Ordinance repealing the 2013 Plumbing Code in its.entirety and enacting a 2016
Plumbing Code consisting of the 2016 California Plumbing Code as amended by
San Francisco; adopting. environmental findings and findings of local conditions
under the California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of
January 1, 2017; and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward
the legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by
State law. :

This legislation is being transmitted to you for environmental review.

- Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board
O&' By: Jli(t/g;mera, Legislative Deputy Director
Land Use and Transportation Commitiee

Net defined as a project under CEQA Guidelines

o Sections 15378 and 15060(c) (2) because they do not
Attachment

result in a physical change in the environment.
c: . Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning Joy e
~rm . . P H X emall=joy navarretegsigav.org,
Jeanie Poling, Environmental Planning Navarrete S

2

4196




Proposed 2016 San Francisco Building/Existing
Building/Electrical/Plumbing/Mechanical/Green Building

- Code Amendment Correction List

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO BUILDING CODE AlV_[ENDMENTS

CORRECTIONS
Section No. Correction

102A.3.1 Duplicated text and section number have been deleted.
202 Story, First in Section 202 has been deleted.
406.3 Section number of 406.3 and a typo in the text have been corrected
1012.2 Exception number in Section 1012.2 has been corrected.
1016.2 Item number has been corrected.
1207 Section numbers in 1207 has been corrected.

Finding Table Correction
_ Section No. :
102A.4.1 Section 102A.4.1 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
102A.4.2 Section 102A.4.2 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
102A.7.1 - Section 102A.7.1 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
102A.7.2 Section 102A.7.2 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
102A.7.3 Section 102A.7.3 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
102A.10 ‘Section 102A.10 has been deleted in the Finding Table.
103A.5 Section 103A.5 has been added to the Finding Table.
106A.1.14 Section 106A.1.14 has been added to the Finding Table.
106A.3.1 Section 106A.3.1 has been added to the Finding Table.
1011.5.5.1 Section 1011A.5.5.1 has been added to the Finding Table.
Chapter 11D Chapter 11D has been added to the Finding Table.
1207 Section 1207 has been corrected in the Finding Table.
1312A.1 A typo in Section 1312A.1 has been corrected.
1510.10 Section 1510.10 has been corrected.
1705.1.1 Section 1705.1.1has been added to the Finding Table

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO EXISTING BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS

CORRECTIONS

Section No. Correction
301.2.1 The reference in this section has been corrected to Section 403.
407.4.1 Section 407.4.1 has been corrected.

Finding Table Correction

Section No.
326.4.1 Section 326.4.1 has been added to the Finding Table. .
326.4.2 Section 326.4.2 has been added to the Finding Table.
404D.2.1 Section 404D.2.1 has been added to the Finding Table.
Table 4D-A

Table 4D-A has been added to the Finding Table.

4197




Table 403E

Table 403E has been added to the Finding Table.

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO PLUMBING CODE AMENDMENTS

CORRECTIONS
Section No. Correction
1101.2.3 The reference has been corrected to 1101.2.2
Finding Table Correction
Section No.
603.3 Section 603.3 has been added in the Finding Table.

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO ELECTRICAL CODE AMENDMENTS

CORRECTIONS

Section No. Correction
89.117. (A) A parenthesis on the left side has been added. .
230.43 Section 230.43 has been corrected by deletmg the word “general” in the

State language
230.71 Section 230.71 has been corrected by deleting the old San Francisco
amendment. '
330.12 Section 330.12 has been corrected by changing “Rev1se Item (1)”
411.5 A comma has been added in the text.
700.16 Change to “Revise the first paragraph of this section as follows
760.46 Editor’s Note has been deleted.
Finding Table Correction

Section No. L
210.5(C)(1)(a) Section 210.5(C)(1)(a) has been corrected in the Finding Table.
215.12(C)(a) Section 215.12(C)(a) has been corrected in the Finding Table.
330.12 Section 330.12 has been added in the Finding Table.
355.10(A) Section 355.10(A) has been corrected in the Fmdmg Table.

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS
CORRECTIONS '
Finding Table Correction

Section No.

101.2 Section 101.2 has been deleted in the Finding Table.

PROPOSED 2016 SAN FRANCISCO GREEN BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS

CORRECTIONS
___Section No. Correction
Chapter 4 The title of Chapter 4 has been corrected.
Chapter 5 The title of Chapter 5 has been corrected.
Finding Table Correction
Section No.

4198




4.201.1

Section 4.201.1 in the Finding Table has been deleted.

5.101.1

Section 5.101.1in the Finding Table has been deleted.

5.201.1.2

Section 5.201.1.2 has been added to the Finding Table.

4199




160947 -

- 2013 San Francisco Existing Building Code
Findings |

CHAPTER1

NO S.F. AMENDMENTS

CHAPTER 2
Section # Finding # Section # Finding # Section # Finding #
202 | 9

CHAPTER 3
Section # Finding# | Section # Finding # | Section # Finding #
301.1.4.2 1,9 327 9 327.7 9
301.2 1,9 | 327.1 9 327.8 9
301.2.1° 1,9 327.1.1 9 327.8.1 9
301.2.2 1,9 327.1.1.1 9 327.8.1.1 9
301.2.3 - 1,9 327.1.1.2 9 327.8.2. 9

1314 1,5 327113 9 327.8.2.1. 9 ‘

314.27 1,5 327.1.1.31 9 327.8.2.1.1 9
.3,14.27.1 1,5 | 327.1.1.3.2 9 327.9 9
314.27.2 1,5 327.2 9 327.9.1 9
314.27.2.1 1,5 327.3 9 327.9.1.1 9
314.27.2.2 1,5 3274 9 327.9.1.2 9
314.27.2.3 1,5 327.4.1 9 327.9.1.3 9

4200




160947

31427204 15 32742 327.9.2
314.27.2.5 15  |327.4.2.1 327.9.3
314.27.2.6 15 |327.4.2.2 327.9.4
31427.3 15 | 32743 327.9.4.1
314.27.4 15  |327.4.4 327.9.5
314.27.5 15 | 327.4.4.1 327.9.6
314.27.5.1 15 |327.4.4.2 327.9.6.1
314.27.6 15  |3275 327.9.7
314.27.7 15  |327.5.4 327.10
314.27.8 15  |327.5.1.1 327.10.1
314.27.8.1 15  |32754.2 327.10.2
314.27.8.2 15 |327513 327.11
314.27.8.3 15  |32751.4 327.11.1
314.27.8.4 15  |3275.1.5 327.11.2
326 9 327516 327.12
326.1 o  |3275.17 328
326.2 o |3275.1.8 328.1
326.2.1 9 327.5.1.9 328.2
326.2.2 9 |3275.1.10 328.2.1
326.3 9 |32752 328.2.2
326.3.1 9 |32753 328.3
326.3.1.1 o |32754 328.3.1

1326312 9 308.3.2

327.5.5

4201




160947

326.3.1.3 9 327.5.6 9 328.3.2.1 9
326.3.2 9 '327.5'.6.1 9 328.3.3 9
326.32.1 9 327.5.7 9 329 9
326.3.2.2 9 327.5.8 9 329.1 9
326.3.2.3 9 327.6 9 329.1.1 9
326.3.3 9 327.6.1 9 329.2 9
326.3.3.1 9 327.6.2 9 329.3 9
326.3.3.2 9 327.6.3 9  |3204 9
326.3.3.3 9 327.6.3.1 9 329.5 9
32634 9  |3276.32 9 329.6 9
326.3.4.1 9 327.6.3.3 9 329.7 9
326.3.4.2 9 327.6.3.4 9 329.8 9
326.3.4.3 9 327.6.3.5 9

| 326.4 9 327.6.3.6 9
326.4.1 9 327.6.3.7 9
326.4.2 9 327.6.4 9
326.5 . 9

| CHAPTER 4

Section # Finding # Section # Finding # Section # Finding #
401 9 403.12 9 404.4 1

1 401.1.2 9 403.12.1 9 404.4.1 1

4202




- 160947

401.6 2,35 [403.12.2 9 404.4.2 1
401.7 1 " 403.13 9 407 1,5
401.8 2,4 404 9 407.4.1 1,5
4019 24 |404.1.1 1 |409 5
402 o |40421 1 409.2 5
402.6 9
402.7 1
403 1

CHAPTER 4A .
Section # Finding # | Section # Finding # | Section # Finding #
401A. 1,9 |404A.22.2 1,9 | 405A4 1,9
402A . 1,9 |404A2.3 1,9 | 405A5 1,9
403A 1,é 404A.2.4 1,9 | 405A.6 1,9
404A 1,9 | 404A25 1‘,9 405A.7 1,9
404A.1 1,9 | 404A2.6 1,9 | 405A8 1,9

1 404A.2 1,9 | 405A 1,9 | 406A 1,9

404A.2.1 1,9 | 405A.1 1,9 | 407A. 1,9
' FIGURE
404A.2.2 1,9 |405A2 1,9 | 4A1 1,9
| TABLE 4A-
404A.2.2.1. 1,9 |405A3 1,9 |A 1,9
CHAPTER 4B
Section # thmg# Section # Finding # | Section # Finding #
4018 1;9 408B.5 1 | 412B.2.2.3 1
'| 402B 1,9 408B.6 1 412B.2.3 1

4203




160947

402B.1 1.9 408B.7 412B.3
402B.2 1,9 409B 412B.4
402B.3 1,9 409B.1 412B.4.1
402B.4 1,9 409B.2 412B.4.2
402B.5 1,9 410B 412B.5
402B.6 1,9 | 410B.1 ‘»4138_
402B.6.1 1,9 410B.2 413B.1
402B.6.2 1,9 410B.3 413B.1.1
403B 9 410B.4 413B.1.2
404B 9 |411B 413B.1.3
404B1 9 411B.1 413B.1.4
405B 9 411B.2 413B.1.5
405B.1 9 411B.3 413B.1.6
405B.2 9 411B.3.1 '4135.2
405B.3 9- 411B 3.2 413B.3
406B - 1 411B 3.3 413B.4
406B.1 1 411B 3.4 413B.5

.| 406B.2 1 411B 3.5 413B.5.1
406B.3 1 411B4 413B.5.2
406B.3.1 1 '411B.4.1 413B.5.3
406B.3.2 1 411B.4.2 413B.6
406B.3.2.1 1 411B.4.3 413B.7

4204




160947

406B.3.2.2 411B.4.4 413B.7.1
406B.3.3 411B.4.5 413B.7.2
406B.3.3.1 411B.4.5.1 413B.8
406B.3.3.2  411B.4.5.2 413B.9
406B.3.3.3 411B.4.5.3 413B.10
4068B.3.3.4 411B.5 414B
406B.3.3.5 411B.6 414B.1
406B.3.3.6 411B.6.1 414B.2
406B.3.3.7 411B.6.2 414B.3
4078 411B.6.3 4158
407B.1 411864 415B.1
407B.2 1411B7 415B.2
407B.3 411B.7.1 415B.3
407B.4 411B.7.2 415B.4
408B 411B.8 415B.5
408B.1 412B 4168
408B.1.1 412B.1 416B.1
408B.1.2 412B.2 416B.2
408B.2 412B.2.1 416B.3
408B.3 4'125.2.2 416B.4
408B.4 412B.2.2.1

FIGURE

4B-1 412B.2.2.2

FIGURE TABLE

4B-2 4B-C

4205




160947

TABLE TABLE

4B-A 1 4B-D 1

TABLE ' TABLE

4B-B 1 4B-E 1

CHAPTER 4C

Section # Finding# | Section # Finding # | Section # Finding #
401C 1,9 403C 1,9

402C 1,9 404C Lé

CHAPTER4D . 2

Section # Finding # | Section # Finding # | Section # Finding #
401D 1,9 405D 1,9  |406D | 1,9
402D 1,9 405D.1 1,9 406D.1 1,9
403D 1,9 405D.2 1,9 406D.2 1,9
404D 1,9 405D.3 1,9 406D.3 1,9
404D 1 1,9 405D.4 1,9 406D.4 _ 1,9
404D.2 1,9 405D.4.1 1,9 406D.5 1,9
404D.2:1 1,9 405D.4.2 1,9 406D.6 1,9
404D.2.2 1,9 405D.4.3 1,9 Table.4D-A 1,9
404D.3 1,9 405D.5 | 21,9

404D.4 1,9 | 405D.6 1,9

404D.4.1 1,9 405D.6.1 1,9

404D.4.2 1,9

404D.4.3 1,9

404D.5 1,9

4206




160947

CHAPTER 4E

Section # Finding# | Section# Finding # | Section # Finding #
401E 9 403E.3 19 | 404E.4 9
402E 9 404E 9 |405E 9 “
403E 9 404E.1 o | 406E 9
403E.1 o |404E2 9 | Table 403E 9
403E.2 9 404E.3 9

4207




PROPOSED SAN FRANCISCO EXISTING

BUILDING CODE AMENDMENTS
-2016 Edition

Chapter 1 |
SCOPE AND ADMINISTRATION

No San Francisco Amendments.

SECTION 202 —
Add the following secti

DISPROPORTIONATE D

1. The 0.3-second spectral ac
States Geological Survey for

ation at the building site as estimated by the United
arthquake in guestion is not more than 0.40 g: and

2. In any story, the vertical elemenfs of the lateral force-resisting system have suffered
damage such that the lateral load-carrying capacity of the structure in any
horizontal direction has been reduced by more than 10 percent from its pre-damage

condition.
| Chapter 3
PROVISIONS FOR ALL COMPLIANCE
METHODS

4%08



301.1.4.2 Replace item 2 as follow:

301.1.4.2 Compliance with reduced International Building Code-level seismic forces.

2. Except where these requirements are triggered by Section 403.12, structures or
portions of structures that comply with the requirements of the applicable chapter
in Appendix A as specified in Items 2.1 through 2.5 and subject to the limitations of
the respective Appendix A chapters shall be deemed to comply with this section.

301.2 Add the following section:

301.2 Minimum Lateral Force for Existing Buildings.

the mass or reduce the seismic resistance
multiple building types apply, the later
building types apply, compliance shall be :
definitions are given in ASCE 41-13, Table

TABL NSTRATE BUILDING COMPLIANCE

Model Code (for

Building Type Date of Compliance reference)

Wood Frame, wood she 1/1/1984 UBC 1976

Wood Frame, wood shearpal 7/1/1999 UBC 1997

Floor areas sreater than 3,000:2 per level

Steel moment-resisting frame (Types S1 & Sl1a) 12/28/1995 UBC 1994
Stee] concentrically braced frame (Types S2 & Sza) ,7/1/1999 UBC 1997
Steel eccentrically l;raced frame (Types S2 & S2a) _ 1/1/1990 UBC 1988
Buckling-restrained braced frame (Types 52 &S2a) 1/1/2008 IBC 2006
Light metal frame (Type S3) : 1/1/2008 IBC 2006
Stee] frame w/ concrete sheér.walls (Type S4) ' 12/28/1995 UBC 1994

Steel plate shear wall (Type S6) 1/1/2008 IBC 2006

4209




Reinforced concrete moment-resisting frame (Type C1) 12/28/1995 UBC 1994

Reinforced concrete shear walls (Types C2 & C2a) 12/28/1995 UBC 1994

Tilt-up concrete (Types PC1 & PCla) ’ 7/1/1999 UBC 1997

Precast concrete frame (Types PC2 & PC2a) ‘ 1/1/2008° IBC 2006

Reinforced méson;g (Type RM1) ‘ 7/1/1999 UBC 1997
Flexible diaphragms .

Reinforced masonry (Type RM2) ' ' 12/28/1995 UBC 1994

Stiff diap‘hragms

Seismic isolation or passive dissipation 7/1/1992 UBC 1991

301.2.2 Wind forces. Buildings and struc

shall be capable of resisting wind forces
as prescribed in San Francisco Building Code ‘

nl

301.2.3 Seismic forces. Buildings and structures sh mply with the reduced

5 The building separation limitations
-3 need do not be considered apply.

resisting systems for the stren Swuch forces may be applied to the floor level

immediately above the topmost strengthened floor and distributed in that floor in a

SECTION 314 ~EXISTING HIGH-RISE BUILDINGS [SFM]
314.27 Replace this section with the following seétiqns.' |
314.27 Automatic Sprinkler System — Existing High—risevBuildings

314.27.1 General. Regardless of any other provisions of this code, every existing high-rise
building as defined in San Francisco Building Code Section 403.1.1 shall be provided with
an approved automatic fire sprinkler system conforming to NFPA 13.

4310



Existing high-rise buildings that are also gualified historical buildings as defined in
California Health and Safety Code Section 18950 shall be provided with an approved
automatic fire sprinkler system when and as required by the State Historical Bulldmg
Code.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. An apartment house, condominium or other building used as a Group R, Division 2
Occupancy as defined in this code excluding tourist hotels as defined in Section
41.4(x) of the San Francisco Administrative Code.

2. A mixed-use occupancy building contammg a Group R, DlVlsmn 1 or Group R,
Division 2 Occupancv

314.27.2 Additional. The following zidditi. équirements shall also apply:

314.27.2.1 Valves and devices. A sprinkler ¢ ;’Tol Valv,_ ind a waterflow detecting device
shall be provided at the Jateral connection to the ris ach floor.

314.27.2.2  Signals. A separate and distinct supervis gnal shall be provided to indicate
a condition that will impair the satisfactory operation of the'sprinkler system. This shall =~
include, but not be limited to, monitoring control valves, fire.pump power supplies and
pump running condi upervisory signals shall be annunciated at a constantly
attended building securltv conitrol.center; when that location is not under constant
supervision by quahf d person he signals shall be transmitted to a remote monitoring -
station in accordance w1t i NFPA , . N

. existing standpipes whic ‘have been converted in accordance with Section 314.27.2.4 shall
be provided if they are necéssary to meet the requirements of NFPA 13. The installation of
additional flexible fittings in such risers is not required.

314.27.2.6 ‘Plpe material. Any type pipe which has been listed by an approved testing
agency for use in automatic sprinkler installations may be used when mstalled in
accordance with its listing limitations.

314.27.3 . Permissible omissions. The following features required in new high-rise
buildings are not required in systems installed under the provisions of this section:

1. Redundant fire pump;

4211




2. Secondary on-site supply of water:

3. More than one fire department connection:

4. Connection of the system to two risers on each floor, Hydraulic calculations may
consider all risers in service;

5. In a Group R, Division 1 or R-2 Occupancy building, sprmklers in bathrooms and
closets.

See San Francisco Building Code Section 903.3.1.1
sprinkler omissions.

dditional permissible

314.27.4 Effective date. The effective date of these requlremen
2008.

hall be January 01,

. 314.27.5 Notification. Not later than 60 days fbllowing the effective date of this oi'dinance, .

the Building Official shall notify in.writing by certified mail the owner of each bulldlng
within the scope of this section. The notice shall contain a copy of this section, a :
‘commentary on it and a notice of in im. The notice of intent shall be designed to elicit
information regarding proposed water upp nections, pumps, risers and existing

partlal sprmkler systems. The notlce 0 mtent [Einclude a tentative schedule for phasing

1. Consider alternati 6rotection based on nationally recognized standards, principles
~ and tests, and generally recognized and well-established methods of fire protection;

2. Waive specific individual requirements if it can be shown that such requirements
are not physically possible, require disproportionate effort or pose an undue

- hardship with little increase in life safetv and that a practlcal alternate cannot be
prov1ded and

3. Grant necessary extensions of time when it can be shown that the specific time
periods are not physically practical or pose an undue hardship. The granting of an
extension of time for compliance may be approved by the Building Official based on

4§12_



the showing of good cause and on approval of an acceptable, svstematxc, progressive
plan of correctlon

314.27.7 _Appeal of high-rise sprinkler requirements. Application may be made to the
Board of Examiners in accordance with San Francisco Building Code Section 105A.1 for
approval of alternate methods, materials or types of construction or for variances from the
provisions of this section.

314.27.8 Implementation. The requirements stated in Section 314.27.2 shall be
accomplished by the following steps. Failure to complete any step within the required time
frame is a violation of this code, and the Building Official shall have the power to abate the
building in accordance with San Francisco Building Code Section 102A.

314.27.8.1 Step 1. Notice of intent. The ow
Department- provided notice of intent to th
‘ after the effective date of this requirement,

shall submit a properly completed
Juilding Official not later than three years

EXCEPTION: No notice of intent is required
completed prior to the deadline above.

approved sprinkler system is

ystem riser, including
tic water supplv not later

314.27.8.2 Step 2. Water supply. The owner shall install
floor-control valves, and=shall connect it to the approved aut
than five vears after. the effectiy
automatic water supj
if required by hydrauli

Sist of a connection to the public water works system and,
stallation of a fire pump.

314.27.8.3 Step 3. Piping-an
including required electrical
this ordinance.

314.27.8.4 Installation. The install ) of all fire alarm equipment shall be in accordance
with the San Francisco Electrical Code and the California Fire Code.

SECTION 326 —EXISTING BUILDINGS OR OTHER STRUCTURES
LOCATED ON A MILITARY BASE SELECTED FOR CLOSURE

326 Add the following sections:

SECTION 326 -- EXISTING BUILDINGS OR OTHER STRUCTURES LOCATED ON A
MILITARY BASE SELECTED FOR CLOSURE

326.1 General. As authorized by California Health and Safety Code Section 18941.7, a
building or other structure that is located on a military base selected for closure by action
of the federal Defense Base Closure and Realignment Commission, including Naval Station
Treasure Island (including Yerba Buena Island) and Hunters Point Naval Shipyard, may

213 -



comply with the requirements of this code in a graduated manner over a period not to
exceed three vears, provided that:

1. The building or structure is in existence at the time the military base is selected for
closure by action of the federal Defense Basg Closure and Realignment Commission;

2. The building or structure will be safe for its intended use and occupancy;

3. The building or structure is under a lease from the federal government to either the
City and County of San Francisco or the Redevelopment Agency of the City and
County of San Francisco (the “Redevelopment Agency” );

y the City and County of San Francisco
vate party, to the City and County of San
‘ey:; and

4. The building or structure will be subles
~ or Redevelopment Agency to either a
Francisco or to the Redevelopment A

5. The building or structure meets the code ¢ e inspection and graduated

compliance plan requlrements set forth below.

326.2 Presubleasmg Code Compliance Inspections. Before the City and County of San
Francisco or the Redevelopment Agency enters into any subl of a building or structure,
the public entity proposing to enter into the sublease shall requi t the Building Official and
the San Francisco Fire Marshal (the “Fire Marshal” ) to inspect, or cause to be

inspected, the bmldmg or structure for compliance with applicable codes, in accordance
of this Sectlon 326 The Building Ofﬁc1al and the Fire Marshal shall

326.2.2 Notice to proposed subtenants. The Redevelopment Agency or the City and
County of San Francisco agency proposing to enter info a sublease shall notify the
proposed subtenant of the final compliance inspection reports for such building or
structure by (a) attaching a copy of the final reports of the Building Official and Fire
Marshal to the sublease; or (b) providing a copy of such reports to the subtenant and
referencing such delivery in the sublease.

326.3 Graduated Code Compliance Plan and Timetable.

326.3.1 Buildings with no change in occupancy or use and no anticipated alterations.

4714



326.3.1.1 Complying building or structure. If, after performing the inspections required
by Section 326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal concur that the building or
structure complies with the applicable codes and will not be hazardous to life safety, fire
safety, health or sanitation based on its intended use and occupancy, the Building Official,
with the approval of the Fire Marshal, will issue a Certificate of Final Completion and

Occupancy.

326.3.1.2 Remedial work required. If, after performing the inspection required by Section
326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal determine that remedial work is required
so that the intended use and occupancy of the building or:structure will not be hazardous
to life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation, such wo st be performed pursuant to

. building permits issued by the Department. All suchi¥:réIﬂédi7ﬁ1 work shall either comply
with current codes or be approved by the Building Official éiiif‘iii’the Fire Marshal as
providing equivalent public safety. The Building Official, with thé approval of the Fire
Marshal, shall determine that the building or structure is safe for o cupancy as evidenced
by the issuance of a Temporary Certificate of Occupancy or a Certificate of Final
Completion and Occupancy. Such issuance shall not be a precondition to the execution of
leases or subleases.

326.3.1.3 Graduated compliance p . duated plan of compliance with the
applicable codes may be approved upon: the concurrence of the Building Official and the
Fire Marshal, provided that:

that, in their respective opinions, the intéerided use and occupancy of the building or
structure will not be hazardous to life safetv, ﬁre safetv, health or samtatmn This

rk either complies with current codes or is approved by the
e Fire Marshal as providing equivalent public safety; and

4. A Temporary Certificate of Occupancy is issued by the Building Official, with the
approval of the Fire Marshal, setting forth the approved graduated compliance plan
and a timetable for full compliance with the applicable codes. The compliance plan

- may be amended only with the joint approval of the Building Official and the Fire
Marshal. In no event may the time allowed for full code compliance extend beyond
the three-year period.

326.3.2 Buildings with no change in occuﬁancy or use but with planned alterations.

®15



326.3.2.1 Complying building or structure. If, after performing the inspection required
by Section 326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal concur that the building or
structure meets current requirements for the new occupancy and will not be hazardous to
life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation based on its intended use and occupancy, the
Building Official, with the approval of the Fire Marshal, shall cause a Certificate of Final
Completion and Occupancy to be issued.

326.3.2.2 Remedial work required. If, after performing the inspection required by 326.2,
the Building Official and the Fire Marshal determine that remedial work is required so
that the intended use and occupancy of the building or structure will not be hazardous to
life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation, such work must be done in conjunction with any
planned alterations. A Temporary Certificate of Occupancy or a Certificate of Final = -
Completion and Occupancy shall be issued by uilding Official, with the approval of
the Fire Marshal. Such issuance shall not be a: ndition to the execution of leases or
subleases. '

326.3.2.3 Graduated compliance plan. A grﬁdﬁ%\ted plan:for compliance with the
applicable codes may be approved vyith the con¢ :
Fire Marshal, provided that:

3. All new work either compli ith current codes or is approved by the Building

Official and the Fire Marsha roviding equivalent public safety; and

4. A Temporary Certificate of Occupancy setting forth the approved graduated
compliance plan with a timetable for full compliance with the applicable codes is -
issued by the Building Official, with the approval of the Fire Marshal. The
compliance plan and timetable may be amended only with the joint approval of the
Building Official and the Fire Marshal. In no event may the time allowed for full
code compliance extend bevond the three-year period.

326.3.3 Building with a change in occupancy or use but no anticipated alterations.

326.3.3.1 Complying building or structure. If, after performing the inspection required
by Section 326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal concur that the building or
structure meets current requirements for the new occupancy and will not be hazardous to
life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation based on its intended use and occupancy, the
Building Official, with the approval of the Fire Marshal, shall cause a Certificate of Final
Completion and Occupancy to be issued.

4216



326.3.3.2 Remedial work required. If, after performing the inspection required by Section
326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal determine that remedial work is required
so that the intended use and occupancy of the building or structure will not be hazardous
to life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation, such work must be performed pursuant fo
building permits issued by the Department. All remedial work shall either comply with
current codes or be approved by the Building Official and the Fire Marshal as providing
equivalent public safety. The building or structure may not be occupied until the Building
Official, with the approval of the Fire Marshal, has caused the issuance of a Certificate of
Final Completion and Océupancﬁ

326.3.3.3 Graduated compliance plan. A graduated plan of co_mpliaﬁce with the
applicable codes may be approved with the concurrence of the Building Official and the
Fire Marshal, provided that:

1. The Building Official and the Fire Mdrshal have issued a written determination
that, in their respective opinions, thei ended use and occupancy of the building or
structure will not be hazardous to life saféty, fire safety, health or sanitation. This
determination may, in the discretion of the Building O fficial and the Fire Marshal,

*be issued jointly or separate

2. The time for full compliance"with‘”th applicable Q‘des does not exceed a period of
three years from the date that t _ d:County"i \;San Francisco or the
Redevelopment Agency enters in.t. a Jease )

Tent codes or is approved by the
providing equivalent public safety; and
4.

1e.Fire Marshal, setting forth:

‘and a timetab
timetable mav-be amended only with the joint approval of the Building Official

n no event may the time allowed for full code compliance
Lyear period. :

326.3.4.1 Complying buiilding or structure. If, after performing the inspection required
by Section 326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal concur that the building or
structure meets current requirements for the new occupancy and will not be hazardous to
life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation based on its intended use and occupancy, the
Building Official shall cause, with the approval of the Fire Marshal, the issuance of a
Certificate of Final Completion and Occupancy upon completion and approval of the
planned alteration work. : '

326.3.4.2 Remedial work required. If, after performing the inspection required by Section
326.2, the Building Official and the Fire Marshal concur that remedial work is required so
that the intended use and occupancy of the building or structure will not be hazardous to
life safety, fire safety, health or sanitation, that work must be done in conjunction with any
planned alterations. The building or structure must meet current code requirements for

4917




‘the new occupancy. All remedial work must either comply with current codes or be
approved by the Building Official and the Fire Marshal as providing equivalent public
safety. The building or structure may not be occupied until the Building Official, with the
approval of the Fire Marshal, has caused a Certificate of Final Completion and Occupancy
to be issued.

326.3.4.3 Graduated compliance plan. A sraduated plan of compliance with the
applicable codes may be approved with the concurrence of the Building Official and the
Fire Marshal, provided that:

h a written determinatibn
se nd occupancy of the building or

1. The Building Official and the Fire Marshal hav
that, in their respective opinions, the intended
structure will not be hazardous to life safety

determination may be issued jointly or separately, in th
Official and the Fire Marshal;

4.

applicable codes. The compliance plan
the joint approval of the Building Official ’
“time allowed for full code compliance

and timetable may be amended only wit
and the:Fixe Marshal. In no event may {l

edevelopment Agency or City and County of San
into a sublease a copy of any notice of violation or order
The manner of service shall be as otherwise required by

to abate served upo
law.

326.4.2 Revocation of certificate of final completion and occupancy. In the event that the
Building Official or Fire Marshal issues an order to abate code violations and the order is
not complied with during the time provided therein, the Building Official may, in wntmg,
revoke the Certificate of Final Completion and Occupancy.

326.5 Fees. The Department and the Fire Department may charge the Redevelopment .
Agency or other appropriate City and County of San Francisco agencies fees for actual
time and materials expended in responding to requests for inspection and performing other
tasks associated with the graduated compliance plan program. Fees for permits and other -

4blyg



* alterations, repairs, or demolitions are madi

services shall be as set forth in the San Francisco Building Code and San Franclsco Fire
Code,

SECTION 327 -WORK PRACTICES FOR LEAD-BASED PAINTON
PRE-1979 BUILDINGS AND STEEL STRUCTURES

327 Add the following new section:

. SECTION 327 — WORK PRACTICES FOR LEAD-BASED PAINT ON PRE-1979
BUILDINGS AND STEEL STRUCTURES

327.1 _General. Any buildings, structures, and properties on which the original
construction was completed on or before December 31, 1978, or any steel structures to
which lead-based paint disturbance or remdval, including surface preparation, additions,
shall comply with the requirements of this

section.

327.1.1 Purpose, intent and scope.

327.1.1.1 Purpose. The purpose of this section is to ensul
activities that result in the disturbance or removal of inter r exterior lead-based paint
on pre-1979 buildings, structures and properties and on steel Structures uses work
practices that minim eliminate the risk of lead contamination of the environment.

that any person undertaking

327.1.1.2 Intent.
activities resulting in thei
reasonable level of health a

section is fo encourage safe work practices for
‘ or removal of lead-based paint while providing a
safety or he occupants and the public at large.

327.1.1.3 | Scope.

327.1.1.3.1 Interior. The requiremier f this section apply to any activity resulting in the
disturbance or removal of lead-based paint in the interior of pre-1979 buildings, structures
and properties or portions thereof with one of the following occupancy classifications:
Group E for Day Care and Group R, Divisions 1, 2 and 3. The requirements of this section
with regard to the interior of a facility shall include, but are not limited to,
residential-based family child-care facilities licensed by the State of California.

327.1.1.3.2 Exterior. The requirements of this section apply to any activity resulting in the
disturbance or removal of lead-based paint on the exterior of any pre-1979 bulldmgs,
structures and properties and anv steel structures.

327.2 Definitions. Except as otherwise specified herein, the terms used in this section shall
have the same meanings as those set forth in San Francisco Building Code Chapter 2.

ACCREDITED LABORATORY means a laboratory that operates within the EPA
National Lead Laboratory -Accreditation Program.

4219



ADJACENT PROPERTTIES means properties that adjoin the regulated area, including
but not limited to properties next to and at the corners of lot lines.

CERTIFIED LEAD INSPECTOR/ASSESSOR means any person licensed or certified
by the California Department of Health Services (DHS), as authorized by the United States
Environmental Protection Agency (EPA), in accordance with 40 CFR Part 745, subparts L
or Q, to perform risk assessment and/or lead-based paint inspection.

CLEARANCE INSPECTION means an on-site limited investigation using visual
observation and sampling techniques performed by an independent certified lead
inspector/assessor to verify the absence of lead-based paint hazards, as specified in Title 17,
California Code of Regulations, Division 1, Chapter 8: Accreditation, Certification and
Work Practices for Lead-Based Paint and Lead Hazards. Any analytical festing of
sample(s) collected during such inspection shall be performed by an aceredited laboratory.

COMMON AREA means any interior part of a multi-unit residential building that is
accessible to all occupants, including but not limited to: corridor, hallways, lobbles,
laundry rooms, storage areas, stairwayvs, porches and interior play areas.

CONTAINMENT AND BARRIE
the migration of work debris beyon
disposable polyethylene plastic sheet
* mils thick) to protect the ground, floor
doors and ventilation openings.

SYSTEMS refers to various measures that prevent
Yesulated area, and usually includes the use of

CONTRACTOR means any person, w
contractor’s license, who undertakes to or offe o undertake to or purports to have the
es, by himself or herself or by or through

osen, penetrate, cut through or eliminate paint from that
demolition and surface preparation activities that are

‘outside of a building or steel structure and the areas around it
within the boundaries of the property, including without limitations the outside of any
detached structures, including but not limited to outside and common walls, stairways,
fences, light wells, breezeways, sheds, and garages.

HEPA means a high efficiency particulate air filter.

INTERIOR means the inside of a building, including but not limited to the inside of
any detached structures, inferior commeon walls, common areas, and overhangs

(projections).

LEAD means metallic lead and all inorganic compounds of lead.

4320



LEAD-BASED PAINT or LEAD PAINT means (1) any paint, varnish, shellac, or other
coating on surfaces with lead in excess of 1.0 mg/em? (milligram per square centimeter) as
measured by x-ray fluorescence (XRF) detector or laboratory analysis or in excess of 0.5
percent by weight, also expressed as 5,000 ppm (parts per million), 5,000 mg/g (micrograms
per gram), or 5,000 mg/kg (millicrams per Kilogram) as measured by laboratory analysis:
or (2) any paint, varnish, shellac, or other coating found in the interior or on the exterior of
pre-1979 buildings, structures, or properties or on the exterior of any steel structures,
unless such paint, varnish, shellac or other coating is shown, by a lead-based paint testing,
that it does not have the characteristics specified in (1).

LEAD-BASED PAINT TESTING means testing of ces, by laboratory analysis of
bulk sample or measurement using x-ray ﬂuorescenée'detector, to determine the presence
of lead-based paint performed by an independent certified Jéad: mspector/assessor Where
laboratory analysis is used as a method of testmg bulk paint sampl the laboratory shall
be an accredited laboratory.

PERSON shall have the same meaning as that defined in San Francisco Building Code
Chapter 2 and shall also include any department, agency, or 'commissioﬁ"of}%-fthe City and
County of San Francisco, and Stafe oi: federal agencies and departments to the extent
allowable by law. ;

PRE-1979 BUILDING means any-build

hose original construction was completed
on or before December 31, 1978.

PROHIBITED PRACTICES means a prac that disturbs or removes
lead-based paint using any of the following methods (1) open flame burning or torching;
(2) heat guns without contalnment and barrle stems, or operatmg above 1,100 degrees

structures or propertles with one of the following occupancy. classifications: Group E for
Day Cire and Group:R, Divis 1,2 and 3; or on the exterior of any pre-1979 buildings
_ or any steel structures whlch*work is being performed that disturbs or removes
lead-based paint, and ¢h access is restricted in order to prevent migration of work
debris. “Regulated area” shall also include any area contaminated with work debris as a
result of a breach or lack of containment and barrier system, which constitutes a violation
of the requirement set forth in Section 327.4.2. o

RESPONSIBLE PARTY means either (1) the owner of the property where the owner
or the owner’s employees or persons otherwise under the control of the owner are
performing the activities regulated under this section: or (2) the owner and the contractor
where the owner has entered into a contract with another to carry out the activities
rggulated under this section.

4221




STEEL STRUCTURE means any structure that is-not a building and which has
- exterior surfaces made of steel or other metal, such as bridges, billboards, Walkwavs, water
towers, steel tanks and roadway or railway overpasses.

WORK DEBRIS means any debris, including without limitations paint chips and dust,
resulting from any activity that disturbs or removes lead-based paint.

327.3 General Prohibitions. No person shall disturb or remove lead-based paint through
the use of prohibited practices, or in any other way that generates work debris during
demolition or work on the interior of Occupancy Group E for Day Care and Group R,
Divisions 1,2 and 3 or exterior of any pre-1979 buildings or any steel structure except in
accordance with the requirements of this section. 1

For purposes of this section, all paint on the.éxterior of any pre-1979 building or any
steel structure shall be presumed to be lead- ;i ‘paint. Any person seeking to rebut this
presumption shall establish through lead-based paint testing, or other means satisfactory to
the Director, that the paint on the building or steel structure in question is not lead-based

paint.

Exemption: Work that disturbs or removes lead- paint from the inferior of an
~ owner-occupied pre-1979 dwelling unit shall be exempted from the requirements for
demolition or work on the interior of Occupancy Group R; Divisions 1, 2 and 3, provided
that such unit is not a licensed childcare facility. Notwithstanding this exemption, the
responsible parties shall take all. reasonable measures to prevent the migration of work

{ er-occupied dwelling unit to the outside of such unit
, any interior common areas and the exterior of the
ork that disturbs or removes lead-based paint.’

3274 Performance Standar

327.4.1 Restrict access. Any person.performing work subject to this section shall restrict
access by third parties to the regulatéd rea, except as authorized by this section or until
the regulated area is cleaned in accordance with Section 327.4.4. This subsection shall not
apply to regulated areas that are required for access or egress during the course of the
work, such as common areas, and where no alternative exists for access or egress, in which
case dust generation and migration shall be controlled through the use of HEPA-attached
tools or other feasible containment and barrier systems that allow for access or egress.

327.4.2 Containment and barrier systems. Any person performing work subject to this
section shall establish containment and barrier systems that contains the work debris -
within the regulated area.

- 327.4.2.1 Protect ground. An