
File No. 190962 Committee Item No. 4 
--~~~~----------- ---~~~---

Board Item No. -------'--"-'----'4----

COMMITTEE/BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
· AGENDA PACKET CONTENTS LIST 

Committee~ Land Use and Transportation Committee Date October 28, 2019 
--

Board of Supervisors Meeting 
.. Cmte Board 

Date~~~b~~~~\Q\ . 

D D 
D i [S] 
[S] 
D 
n n 
LJ LJ 

D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D .D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 

Motion 
Resolution 
Ordinance 
Legislative Digest 
Budget and Legislative Analyst Report 
Youth·Commission Report 
Introduction Form 
Department/Agency Cover Letter and/or Report 
MOU 
Grant Information Form 
Grant Budget 
Subcontract Budget 
Contract/Agreement 
Form 126- Ethics Commission 
Award Letter 
Application 
Public Correspondence 

OTHER (Use back side if additional space is needed) 

[S] DRAFT 2019 SFMC 
[S] Exhibit A Findings 
[S] 2019 CMC <--***CLICK HERE TO VIEW 
[S] BIC Ltr 081219 
[S] OBI Ltr 092019 
[S] CEQA Determination 101519 
D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 

Completed by: Erica Major Date Oct<JP~.r 247-2019 
Completed by:_-=E.!..!..ric=a"-'M=a=j=or'--------Date \fif6~'\ 

***PATH NAME: 
https://sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=7729722&GUID=9349EEAF-DFFC-4D49-
BAC8-9344A65231 02 

335 

https://sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=7729722&GUID=9349EEAF-DFFC-4D49-BAC8-9344A6523102


FILE NO. 190962 ORDINANG )JO. 

1 [Mechanical Code-· Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of 2019 Edition] 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

10 

11 

12 

. 13• 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Mechanical Code in its entirety and enacting a 2019 

Mechanical Code consisting of the 2019 California Mechanical Code as amended by 

San F-r.oC\J,Wisco; .l"dppting ~nvironmental findings and findings of local conditions under 
f~i · .•. j~;:\ .-i<~ !) U::'Jy; ,: ;;.:" . 

the Califo'rliia Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; 

and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the 

California Building Standards Commission as required by State law. '· 
t .... 

,./ ... 
NOTE: Unchanged Code text and uncodified text are in plain Arial font. 

Additions to Codes are in single-underline italics Times New Roman font: 
Deletions to Codes are in sttikethrough italics Times ~Ve-...~· Roman font. 
Board amendment additions are in double-underlined Aria! font. 
Board amendment deletions are in strikethrough /\rial font. 
Asterisks (* * * *) indicate the omission of unchanged Code 
subsections or parts. of tables . 

Be it ordained by the People of the City and County of San Francisco: 

Section 1. Environmental Findings. The Planning Department has determined that the 

actions contemplated in this ordinance comply with the California Environmental Quality Act 

(California Public Resources Code Sections 21000 et seq.). Said determination is on file with 

the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors in File No. 190962 and is incorporated her1irt by 
,, . 
\••' 

I~~._. reference. The Board affirms this determination. 

Section 2. General Findings. 
.:' '. 

(a) The California Building Standards Code is contained in Title 24 of the California 

23 · Code of Regulations. It consists of 12 Parts, which are based upon model codes that are 

24 amended by the State agencies with·jurisdiction over the subject matter. The California 

25 Mechanical Code is Part 4 of Title .24 of the California Code of Regulations. 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

336 

Page 1 



1 (b) The State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code every 

2 three years (the "triennial CBSC") with supplemental amendments published in intervening 

3 years. The triennial CBSC goes into effect throughout the State of California 180 days after its 

4 publication by the California Building Standards Commission or at a later date established by 

5 the Commission. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go into effect on January 1, 2020. . ., 

6 (c) Local jurisdictions must enforce the California Building Standards Code but they 

7 may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of 

8 local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions. Local amendments may be made both to 

9 a triennial CBSC and to its individual Parts during the intervening years; however, local 

10 amendments previously adopted are not automatically applicable to a triennial CBSC. Rather, 

11 they must be re-enacted with the required findings of local climate, geologic, or topographical 

12 conditions, expressly made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with an operative date 

13 no earlier than the effective date of the triennial CBSC. 

14 (d) As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, by this ordinance the Board of 

15 Supervisors repeals the 2016 San Francisco Mechanical Code in its entirety, enacts the 2019 

16 San Francisco Mechanical Code, and re-enacts the existing local amendments to make them 

. 17 applicable to the 2019 California Mechanical Code. 

18 (e) Pursuant to Charter Section 03.750-5, the Building Inspection Commission 

19 considered and approved San Francisco's amendments to the 2019 California Mechanical 

20 Code at a duly noticed public hearing that was held on July 17, 2019. 

21 

Section 3. Findings regarding Local Conditions. 22 

23 (a) California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 provide that 

24 before making any changes or modifications to the California Mechanical Code and any other 

25 applicable provisions published by the California Building Standards Commission, the 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

337 

Page 2 



1 governing body must make an express finding that each such change or modification is 

2 reasonably necessary because of specified local conditions. The local amendments together 

3 with the required findings must be filed with the California Building Standards Commission 

4 before the local changes or modifications can go into effect. 

5 (b) The City and County of San Francisco is unique among California communities 

6 with respect to local climate, geologic, topographical, and other conditions. A specific list of . 

7 findings that support San Francisco's modifications to the 2019 California Mechanical Code, 

8 with a section-by-section correlation of each modification with a sp~cific numbered finding, are 

9 contained in Exhibit A entitled "Standard Findings for San Francisco Bui.lding Standards Code 

10· Amendments." 

11. (c) . Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5, 

12 the Board of Supervisors finds and determines that the local conditions described in Exhibit A 

13 constitute a general summary of the most significant local conditions giving rise to the need 

14 for modification of the 2019 California Mechanical Code provisions published by the California 

15 Building Standards Commission. The Board of Supervisors further finds and determines that 

16 the proposed modifications are reasonably necessary based upon the local conditions set 

17 forth in Exhibit A. 

18 

19 Section 4. Repeal of 2016 San Francisco Mechanical Code and Enactment of the 

20 2019 San Francisco Mechanical Code. 

21 (a) The 2016 San Francisco Mechanical Code is hereby repealed in its entirety. The 

22 San Francisco Mechanical Code being repealed was enacted on November 22, 2016, by 

23 · Ordinance No. 230-16, with an operative date of January 1, 2017. This ordinance is available 

24 on the Board of Supervisors' website. 

25 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page 3 

338 



........ -<-: 

) 

1 (b) The 2019 San Francisco Mechanical Code is hereby enacted. It consists of the 

2 2019 California Mechanical Code and San Francisco's existing local amendments, which are 

3 re-enacted and expressly made applicable to the 2019 California Mechanical Code. Copies of 

4 the 2019 California Mechanical Code and the stand-alone San Francisco amendments are 

5 declared to be part of Board File No. 190962 c:tnd are incorporated into this ordinance by 

6 · reference as though fully set forth. Existing San Francisco amendments that are being made 

7 applicable to the 2019 California Mechanical Code are shown in unformatted ("plain") text and 

8 may include bold and/or italicized formatting; new San Francisco amendments are underlined; 

9 and deleted San Francisco amendments are in strikeout text. 

10 

11 Section 5. Continuance of Actions Under Prior Code. Nothing contained in this 

12 ordinance shall be construed as abating any action now pending under or by virtue of any 

13 ordinance of the City ahd County of San Francisco hereby repealed, nor shall this ordinance 

14 be construed as discontinuing, abating, modifying or altering any penalties accruing, or to 

15 accrue, or as waiving any right of the City under any such ordinance. 

16 

17 Section 6. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this 

18 ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 

19 remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would 

20 have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase. of this 

21 Ordinance, irrespective of the. fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, 

22 clauses, or phrases be declared invalid. 

23 

24 Section 7. Effective and Operative Dates. This ordinance shall become effective 30 

25 days after enactment. Enactment occurs when the Mayor signs the ordinance, the Mayor 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

339 

Page4 



1 returns the ordinance unsigned or does not sign the ordinance within ten days of receiving it, 

2 or the Board of Supervisors overrides the Mayor's veto of the ordinance. This ordinance shall 

3 take effe~t and be in full force on and after either January 1, 2020 or its effective date if the 

4 effective date is later. 

5 

6 Section 8. Directions to Clerk. Upon final passage of this ordinance, the Clerk of the 

7 Board of Supervisors is hereby directed to transmit to the California Building Standards 

8 Commission pursuant to the applicable provisions of State law 1) this ordinance, 2) the Exhibit 

9 A attachment, and 3) the San Francisco amendments to the 2019 California Mechanical 

10 Co<:fe. 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

25 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
DENNIS t,HERR~RA, City Attorn~~ 

\ / . •' /,---/,",/ (! ~ . / I?Y,<J. f . J 
By. ...\· · -./A.£{6(1):' /:;( ()~\, ''1/1'>'1 

• _...r•,/ .// ~ 

/.JUDITH A. BOYAJIAN/ v 
Uieputy City Attorney 

n:\legana\as2019\1900415\01384333.docx 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

340 

Page 5 



FILE NO: 190962 

LEGISLATIVE DIGEST 

[Mechanical Code - Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of 2019 Edition] 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Mechanical Code in its entirety and enacting a 2019 
Mechanical Code consisting of the 2019 California Mechanical Code as amended by 
San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings of local conditions under 
the California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; 
and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the 
California Building Standards Commission as required by State law. 

Existing Law 

The Mechanical Code regulates heating, ventilating, air-conditioning, exhaust and duct 
systems, refrigeration, and miscellaneous heat-producing and energy-utilizing equipment. The 
current San Francisco Mechanical Code consists of the 2016 California Mechanicai Code 
(which incorporates the .2015 Uniform Mechanical Code) and San Francisco's local 
amendments to the 2019 California Mechanical Code ("San Francisco Amendments"). 

Amendments to Current Law 

. Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code 
("triennial CBSC"), which amends the California Mechanical Code and the other state codes 
that constitute the CBSC. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go Into effect throughout the State on 

. January 1, 2020. As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, San Francisco will repeal its. 
existing Mechanical Code in its entirety and adopt a new Mechanical Code that applies San 
Francisco's existing local amendments to the new California Mechanical Code. Except for 
non-substantive or technical modifications required by amendments to the state code, there 
are no changes to the existing San Francisco Mechanical Code amendments being carried 
forward. 

Background Information 

Local jurisdictions are required to enforce the California Building Standards Code but they 
may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of 
local climate, geology, or topography. Local amendl)lents may be made to a triennial CBSC 
and also throughout the inteNening years. However, local amendments previously adopted 
are not automatically transferred to a new triennial CBSC. Rather, they must be re-enacted 
with the required findings of local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions, expressly 
made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with an operative date no earlier than the 
effective date of the new State Code. 

n:\legana\as2019\ 1900415\01384335.doc 

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

341 



BOARD of SUPERVISORS 

Lisa Gibson 
Environmental Review Officer 
Planning Department 
1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400 
San Francisco, CA 941 03 

Dear Ms. Gibson: 

October 8, 2019 

City Hall 
Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 

San Francisco 94102-4689 
Tel. No. 554-5184 
Fax No. 554-5163 

TDDfrTY No. 554-5227 

File No. 190959-190964 

On October 1, 2019, the Building Inspection Commission submitted the proposed legislation: 

File No. 190959 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Building Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Building Code consisting of the 2019 California Building Code and the 
2019 California Residential Code, as amended by San Francisco; adopting 
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of 
January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of. the Board to forward the 
legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by 
State law. 

File No. 190960 · 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Existing Building Code in its entirety and 
. enacting a 2019 Existing Building Code consisting of the 2019 California 
Existing Building Code as amended by San Francisco; adopting 
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providrng for an operative date of 
January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board to forward the 
legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by 
State law. · 

File No. 190961 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Electrical Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Electrical Code consisting of the 2019 California Electrical Code as 
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings 
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing 
an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board 
of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building 
Standards Commission as required by State law. 

342 



File No. 190962 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Mechanical Code .in its entirety and enacting 
a 2019 Mechanical Code consisting of the 2019 California Mechanical Code 
as amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and 
findings of local conditions un.der the California H~alth and Safety Code; 
providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of 
the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California 
Building Standards Commission as required by State law. 

File No. 190963 

Ordinance repealing the. 2016 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as 
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings 
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing 
an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board 
of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building 
Standards Commission as required by State law. 

File No. 190964 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Green Building Code in its entirety and 
enacting a 2019 Green Building Code consisting of the 2019 California 
Green Building Standards Code as amended by San Francisco; adopting 
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative date of 
January 1, ·2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to 
forward the legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as 
required by State law. 

The above legislation are being transmitted to you for environmental review. 

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board 

cr~~ 
By: Erica Major, Assistant Clerk 

Land Use and Transportation Committee 

Attachment 

. c: Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning 
Don Lewis, Environmental Planning 

Not defined as a project under CEQA Guidelines 
Sections 15378 and 15060(c)(2) because it would 'not 
result in a direct or indirect physical change in the 

· environment. 

Joy Navarrete 10/15/2019 

2 

.343 



2019 

San Francisco Mechanical· Code 

Amendments to the 

2019 California Mechanical Code 

Operative date: January 1, 2020 . 

344 



Text Format: eo.";;~ 
Pn~hffilgedlangtiage_frow the2of9·c~1if~Eri:icodii~:;I;:~~-d: ~~ctilia:nii:~i~d.e bold auazot itqlicizedi 

f9lm~nffig~ ···~_·-~·-~--~-~-~ ·· · -- ·--- ------~--~- ~ -- -~-------~~~]Yflg~- ---- - ~-- · -~---~~. -- · ~-~ 
San Francisco amendnwnts are printed in 11nformatted (''pJ~3tWHcJ,!;;;,?nd may include bold iln<i/or 

italidzed fo1matting~ ~~-- ·'t~r' '·"'::~~~ 

Repeale.d SarrF~·andsco all).endine#s appeal: pJain <Ui"&:!trikeout. ~~~~-
_New San Francisco amendments appear underline~ct~?- ~~ 

-------·~'-~ ., __ ~:c,bapter .1L~~~~-,-~~--
ADlVIIN1:STRA.TION 

~--~.~~ \~Division 11.~ 

·r-'-'cAL~~~ -~-I~F--'----,O----".-RN~~-~• -~-. IA_AI>MOOsTRATIOl~ 
See Dfliision 11 Admi11istr6t{oit19~;;-- . ~;:-;;,~~Ts-;;;·Wjj£11-.· -c_ -rriaxli_iQtjmifiiib;tivTprovis1ons. 
N'o San Francisc;oJyfechmii'fl.al~Code· ·.m~t1jf11tei?ts -~!wJJi"-. · ~~i~- · . 

·~~~~~~- ~~ ·:~~-,. 

4~;~rtl~;;t~:'~~;~W~TION1 
'~~~§. __ ---'---,--"·."';,;~~- ~~ 

!~ECTION t~l_:~ ~JlTL~~c ~~~~;; 
101.1 Revise this sectiOI1 ailf2..llows: · . -;_;;~-.'; .. 

: ·~~-"·-~'-;.....--:-.·····-,-.;--· ·-:.~·-~--.~;.:..:.·1 .. '.. . . _ r~--..:-::---:-·_·~·. =--:--:--··--·L~-~:-'-·---:.--,-~.:.--· __ . : 

101.1 ~~Title. Thisdocumerif shall be 1-no:Wil as ·the,~ 2019. Sai1Francisco Me.chanical Code, 1ll.ay he. cit~d' 
~~_sgy)l> -~~-'Yill.l1eJ.·C\fe,;rre._d to h~t~~-~'~m~c;gQ.~!1 · · · ·· · · · · · ~~ ~ ~ - " 

- . 

!sECTION103.0-DUTIES'ANilP-OwERS.OFTHEAUTHORITYHAVINGJ j• .. ~ . --~--~~~~"---~ ~- .. - ~ ---------~---- ------ ~ ----~---.~-----~~-~~. -~~-------"~"- ~-------~<-- _,_ .• ..... ·-· -~---~· -~~----- __ , --~~·~-- ~-- -~1 

.GURISDIGTION 
1 • -· • ·----·~-"-·---r-__:~ 

103.1 Re;vise the ji1'St paragi'ciph as/ollows:: . . . . 
103.1 ~ Gen¢1'31. Th~ AutboritfHavingJudsdi~tion shill b~-theA,uthotitydulyappofut~dto ~nfon~ethi~ 
~ode~to:r.s¥£1±11W:I2Q_sy~~th~:A~thg:r!t"Jl<r~wg;l11J:i~c:li«.t!gp.,~Ji~lt_lt~Y~~llit1J:2~r£9.f9-J~~~Q±.:Q.r~~rp.~hJj 
office1;1. The Authority Having Jurisdiction; when nece~saty, ':itia.y Cl.illltpcirt the Police Deprut:tn.~nt and other 
city agencies for aid ol' assistancein carrying out or eliforcmg any of the provisions of this code. fThe~ 

~:!~~j1~~:4~:~!t~~~~~~~~~~t!~~~&:~l~~~~~~=:~!~:~:J!~~~~!eck!~:~~Jllt®d~ 

345 

1 



103.4 Revise the first paragraph as follows: 

!!q~Fli!fit!Ifilfijfffl When 
other codes or 

I 03.5 Add the following section: 

103.5 Authority Having Jurisdiction May 
Jurisdiction shall have tlie power to render nte:rpJ:et::LtiQtA$, 
supplemental regulations to clarify the application 
regulations shall be in confmmance with and 
commonly referred to as "Code Rulings" 
tal(e effect until approved by the Building 
Jurisdiction except in unusual circumstances 
an immediate need to protect health 
fmds that such · · 

\;tuJan~~e for a subscription service to 
subscribers . 

.. uvu~~*':~··........_ tninsmit to the Building Inspection 
~,\}~!mfife:ndatH)ns for changes to this code, based on 

from this code, and for approvals of alternate 
materials, amem.ate:,,;g~l§l!PlS 

2. Code changes·~· .,.,.Y:,vuu...,,,~ .... , ..... Examiners. 
3. Code changes''"'''"'!.~#~~--.. , ..... .... Code Advisory Committee or other bodies subordinate to the 

Building Inspection Comii~§:~!pJn. 

4. Results obtaine ... d~~an~~d;;;~~~~~~~~j;;{;~:;e~ from legal actions taken to correct code violations. 
5. Changes or pJ methods of construction or design and changes proposed by 

interested persons. 
6. Investigations of fire and structural damage to buildings, and of complaints of unsatisfactory 

mechanical system perfmmance. 
7. Periodic changes to the California Mechanical Code and other State regulations which may affect this 

code. 
8. Administrative Bulletins and Code Rulings currently in effect. 
9. Violations of this code found on inspections or investigations. 

346 

2 



104.2 Add item (6) as follows: 

(6) Replacement water heaters of not more than 100 gallons (378.54liters) capacity are exempt from 
building permits when a new flue is not installed, but shall require plumbing permits. 
104.3 Replace this section as follows: 

m~r~~wlf!fd:tl1i~1f_[ijj]E~ri] Applications for permits to perform regulated mechanical work shall 
conform to the applicable requirements as set fmth in Chapter 1A of the Building Code and Chapter 1, 
Division II of the Plumbing Code. 
104.4 Replace this section as follows: 

~~~:~i!~Mif~'lJf§fijJ[~ Permit processing and issuance for regulated mechanical work shall conform to the 
applicable requirements as set forth in Chapter 1 A of the Building .. and Chapter 1, Division II of the 
Plumbing Code. · 
104.4.3 Replace this section as follows: 

·li[qjt4!~~Permi~~j[ilf~{f~1 Mechanical permits expire 
Code. Permit fees may be pmtially refunded if a written ,'-'•.~<+!"'''-'H'"""'""' 

J.ur ........... .,. ofthe San Francisco Building 
is ·made to the Building Official 

prior to commencement of the permitted work and . permit issuance. See Section 
110A, Table IA-R Refunds of the Building Code tO;BJ.§!Undls. 
104.5 Replace this entire section including subsections with 

104.5 General. Fees. Fees for reguiated mechanicai 
Code and in Chapter 1, Division II of the Code. 

106.0 Add the following three 

106.7 Violations. Any violates, disobeys, omits, 
neglects or refuses to , any of the provisions of this code, 
shall be liable for a civil IJ'-'H'""Ln. day · violation is committed or permitted to 
continue, which penalty shall a civil action brought in the name of the people of 
the City and )~j~~~~i~~~,t<~~r!ancis,g.Q" .· >, .. any court of competent jurisdiction. Any 
penalty a ........ ,::;,..,,.,",.,:.,(, . to this paragraph shall be paid to the City 
Treasurer ="h~+-'"'·" 's Special Fund. 
106.8 Any"""'."""'·"" agent, who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects or 
refuses to execution of any of the provisions of this code, shall be 
guilty of a rm:sae,meaw?J shall be punished by a fme not exceeding $500 or by 
imprisoninent not P.Vf'PP.nln.u by both such fine and imprisonment, unless otherwise provided 
in this code, and shall be w. ·..,,·< •. " ~.~~ ,..,~'""'''y a separate offense for every day such violation, disobedience, 
omission, neglect or refusal·.,·l ~·~ ··~a~~gj~~~~~~ Any person who shall do any work in violation of any of the 
provisions of this code, and '" having chm·ge of such work who shall pennit it to be done, shall be 
liable for the penalty provided. 
106.9 It shall be unlawful for any person to interfere with the posting of any notice provided for in this code, 
or to tear down or mutilate any such notice so posted by the Department of Building Inspection. 

107.0 Replace this title and entire section as follows: 

~~Z{Q Board of Examiners. Applicants may appeal decisions made by the Depmtment of Building 
Inspection to the Board of Examiners regarding approval of alternate materials, methods and types of 
construction and for variances from the provisions of this code. See Building Code Section 105A.1. 

347 

3 



i lj 
-.. i· 

3~~~JII£1l~•lrl~~s:~\:taov~p~J 
· 302.2.2 .Fee~; ·. Se~ .13 vlltim~ Cqtley $~¢ttQ:I11l0A; . J'a '~i~.:-.r Ms<::yf1?J!eQll_$ r £&:· a:ppfi:qabte fee~·, 

·-~. ~~:~t~:-

/ ; . '~1~~,.~: /< ·....••.•. ··~ 
f.YENTIL~- ·· UN•-·&UR! 
1t;'l;~;;d~~ii~04; ·. • ·o''~:;?~~L 

-~~:. ~:ft~~; .;_,·; 

r- ~---~0· _"~;-:-::::::::-c-- ___ ·_·, _ . _,~~ '"'':"-"~~~4~=-~~:- -2·:-.-:-~,.. __ .. ------o-~ . ·<--_.;:,.":~· --:--· . :=:~--~,-
ISECTICJ1\F504.3?~ ·~~DQMESTI<B·RA.NuB". r. _-._:;.;..-"-'"--....:-:-...:::~~-~~=·~~if:~~--~".::-:..:~:::.~-:~-:~-"'-:-~: . -- - ~- ., _; . -·< - ·- ";,--~..:.2..: ... _.,._..::-_._;:. __ ,.~. ·., ~~. 

5043 Add a seconC/iflgJ:agraph a:rfoll 

Provide eihaustli5~d above. kitch '~tige~ E~ .:'~ust (lrict-s4~1I term.lhate to th~ ~xteti¢per C1;l11forniil . 
'· M¢chani~alco& s~6ti~lliso2:2J 

' . ~~~~-~~~~ 
.,.~.~~t~;~~-

, . 'coJi~\P~~~~MH 
r,_. _,.,_, ____ • .-:--.- .-:::-- -'-·...::-~ ... :J 

No San Francisco Mechanical Code Amendments. 

4 

348 



:chapter~ 

C1!!MNEYSAND VENTSl 

802.2. 6 Revise this secfi~n as follows: 

r~~!u}~~~;W£i%~l~KatJ~~~:fffl~Nlf~~~~~~~~~ffjf!:i~l~fi~~s,~SJ~~~~:!~~~!~tW!t~~~~ 
does not violate existing St11te or Local ordinance ::md does not cr.ia.t~1lrnuisance as defined within this. code 
and section 216,0 of the San Ftan~:lsco·Plurnbing Code. ~ci-~':~fJlf~~ . 

. :~J~~>~- -~=~o~~ 
--~ -;;;~y "'~,=.,-~ 

. §:gG'J:IQ}l8Q~.~ ... _c · GA~.~~NI~ · · .¥!if;· ~cr~~fit:~ .. 
802.6.1 Revise tl1e heading cmdfirst sentence of this section al;f6j[§;,;s: . . . . ~"NJi,1,h. 

· . · I. : :- ~-- t · · ..., • , -~- .. ·-.- · . .; · -·.; _. · --···-?.::~---: · -;........._----:-:~·-.. -· ___ ....;,;. ................ :'",;:"7.:-'.:.--:._.~-:-• ..,_-:-··:·-:-l _ .... - ··.. . 

802.6.2 ~S..Q~~§;fAddititnial f!~e!.!I!!!!a!!~!LB~q!l!.r~II!~!!ts.J. As ;A gas vent $hall.tenni1Jate,;at leastfopr ( 4) feet 
(1219 mm) from a ptopetty line, except a public way anCl~in ~(~cordillice~¥-dthj)ne oHh~LfQJ!2F!P-g.8 · 

. . .. .-:~~- . '·~~~~f~:;~l-. - -- -~:l~iLto~· - . · 

r--SE,...--C~T~I-Oc--N---c-,:-802-.8-, ,-T-.,_HR-' ,-~0-U-GH~tHE-w ALL;VENT TERMINATIONS 
.. -' -'-_. ~~--:--,. -- ~ . " -· .. - .<.. . ' · . .::_·· --~.:::=:: . ....:..;;_ ___ ~_:__~~ . · .. - ' ·".~::..... ... ·.' ... ' . . ·. . . -~ 

802,8 Revise thefl!'st sentence of this section and addTJJLexcdp'tit/ri11) to this sec[JgiJ.~ asfollows: 

;~~~f~mf;i~~!~~~~!£·~~;~~~~i~if~~:~~h~i®~"::~.~~~~ . 
~yfmced air fulet loGated within 10 :f'eet(3048.1llil;1). (~e~ Figitre. 80£:~ 
g-;{ceptions~L~c--c~·-- ·· '~'1'~t~~-~~,-~~ ·.. . -~-~¥' • __ · _ ·.. . . __ . -

{1) This provisioJ]. ;>hallnot apply tothe C.Ql11b11stion-airintakeof a sJire~t-vent appliruic@t , . _ _ · ' 
,J2) Thispro:visio11 l)hallnota_pply to the ~e_p~p~til:)!l.Q:f.!RrJnteg~~-9.'t:l!<ioe1.=-,~ inlet aqsl :flue g~$ discpax~_e] 
'q;Oi~t~i.QJ±td ~or aP..Yli~fy§::jNF1:4~~i1~;5[Jy---~-"'trt.:::;;,._ ~o¥ .. · .. _ . .. . ·.· . . 

.. (3) Direc ., ,,.,._ appliances1I}@conij)lX~TiithsectiorlS;-go2.2.4 ,802.2.6and 802.8:2 
~-"""· - "'·"':~~::.:--::--t .•. 

·ct~~r~t- . . . ~2~~~~ ~-;~Cb;pf~r.,.9 
INSTAiLATION-~OFSPECIFIC~APPLIANCESl . 
L. ,_:._.,....._.2_~____,_ ·-- ·- ·.:'-7'-"0-'-oii;:;:'f~·;';:-,":--<-;·~: --:''.··.~•}.::.;.,-=;::-':o-':: .• ::::.:.-.:-._~--,.:.'.\>. -'.'. • -~· 0::-:~-o::: .. .; .. ,~ .~c-=::·:~:.· .• ·:-:"' ••;" : .. : -· ) 

-~tt~ L~f:~~~-1 

-~~tSE~C~TJI~o~ .••• N~ .•...• ----92~5_..<.o~ ..• ~ __ lliQ~MIQR~:~.g~MATQ~§] 
.925. J Addtl1e following s.rmtenc¢ as. a s~c~ndpaJ'agMpb;· , 

The opeiatioxrarid inst~Uf:ltion or incinerator~ s]iail {.llso GOJJiply with the regplatioli~ oithe Hay Area Air 
Quality Management District .. . r~ ····---- .. ~. ~ ·~ ·--~----. 

-'~--~-·.·. ~-~· ·---~"~··~--_.Chapter 10 .. ~--~~---~··--~---· _ 
·BOltERS AND .PRESSURE VESSELS 

!---"'--=~-- --- -·-·- :-· .. :--'------'--•·-'-----~~'-·---:_._::._-:.~. ,.,___ ···-···"----=--~~·-~-'~"--- .. -. ---~---:.:- .. :·"'-·-·-_:_ ________ :..:--:.'.:·_~_:_--_j 

SECTION 1013:0 .:-...INSPECTIONS AND TESTS' 
·- ~· . . . _, ·---- __ - - . - - __ - ---- - - - . - .. --- -· -- . -

.349 

5 



JOi3.} R,ev/sei/iisseciion as/oi{ows.: 
joi3(i'J;;ri~~tlJXilc:in-"cst~a~IIa~J""'l9.,-:11-:".£c-:9r-,--_·:w-. -c'b1+7c9c-hc:-~il~'P-.e-rnu.,.,.••·""'t''r~FJJ~ifuiied:sha]Jb.<iti)~put_futo~sezyipe~~rititith~;s;b~~ 
cettified by a licensed Boiler contiictot or ii1spetted by an approved. insuring company iuspector arret an:. . 
oiJel'afitrg permit has beei:t:isstied, - . . . . . _ ·_ . . . · . . . . 

.·"~;:=.:~ 

1013.2 ReVis?ihisP.f!ctlO.i1 q,s.fql/Q.wt: ~~~:. 

~013-.2/~Vpe.imtiug·P·i:rmitJ ; ._ ~ .. ,,~fr_ . • 

~iSf;i~!~~i~fi!i~\fl{ii~ii~lll!~liPi 
~ertified as complying with state of cali~~TI'aiit . · etr. or&~iJJy a licerused boil~t:cotitract6x~: by 
eli:l]Jioyees of an apptoved irism1n company litiJ'iMPg 6 _ · · - 'oils :fft'>f~11he National Boatd' of Boiler arid 

fit!l~i~iiJ:e~~~~FP~i9W:~~~~~~~~~t~l~~~~~l, 
I 013.3 . .Revise this. sectip11 (JS jolla . . . . . . . . ... 

~~71 

... 

:o· . r--:----,-,-,·.,- ~--~,.,.,_,.·----:-·~":·,~-:1' ' 
1Cfia >- ~ter~\l1J _ 

~~J:~jjQ~. 
NQ Scm FrrrrzC:i'st.ClM?.cJwntcqJ Co.de AntendmeniS; 

350 



... -...... 
' ' 
I !' 

,. """"·--:=---:: -----~---~~,--.- .... ------"';1 

Chapter It, __ _ 
:HYllRONICS 

No SCm Frcmcisto Mec;hqnical Corte Amendment~;:- ---- - - ---- -- . 
' ' ,_,-----.· -~--------------------------1 

.. ;Cilapterl3; . 
~UEL GASPIPINQ 

No &rn Francisco Jviecha11ical Code Amendments. 
~~--~ 

~Dhapter~L4~tt~,· 
PROCESS PIPING 

No San Francisco Mechanical Coii.An~~~-;h;;~;;ts. . ~~-t1Kf!f;';-;'t7-lt:"'~ 
· · -. · · ·- . . --_ _ __ .-_- (31i~pter-i~--- ~~~~':}, 

:SOLAR ENERGY--SYSTEMS 
No San FranCisco Mec{lqJ~-i~~rcode:An~~;,?IJJ!T~t~~i=~~~~ ~- ~-1--~~~~ - ·-· -- '"~~~;;~:''"· 

-~----~~.--.---;~----····---~~----~_:(Jliapt,e~r .. ·l6,~-JZr1- __ . ~-. -'"~;~ct
·lSTATIONARY.P:owERPLANTs:;o·~· 

NoSanFrandscoMe~l1cl11tcal Code Ameiz'd/;;e;1!~-/i~~>- --. -=:~~~~-- --· -- ----- ---

· · · · ~-\'~~'~'·-.. ~thap_ter- t1L~~4~~~~''-·--~-------~ 
lREFERENCEDS~ANJ)ARDS 

No San Francisco .MechariieaTc7Ja; Ai/1ii~a~;;d;tt~. -C~--:';.""7 "'''' - ---- -
---~-=0. :;.:;;;::......:- -,.~§r=· 

~.:£~"- ~~ =~~~. 
'-.4~:=- -~£;t:;,.,_=-._ ~. -· . . 

-o-~:'.~:'S't~~~:.,_ '-l~~2~ 

, ___ ,,:t~,,~;,,:','~ft';, ~~ti;"~PP~ll(ti~ij .. , .· .. .· , .. , . . . . . c~· 
lPROCEDURES TO BE FOLLOWED-TO PLACE GAS 1 

. ;_· _c _ _, ___ : __ :______c _____ '±4;': ____ ,, ___ r :: :- ,·+,< --- •" '> ··-~':'- ·. · ,- ·, _-, __ ' ' ' ·' · __ -:_ - ,· - :_-__ ,:,""-----'--~---'-'"------ '---'-- · _j 

---I,t0:,~ -- EQUIPMENT: IN OPERATION 

, .. «o··S~tFran~co M~£~;~;:a1Cor;en~;;e,.d~ {) _ _- -,· ---···· ·- -··.·~-·.~- .... _
7 

~~STALLACJ2l9N1:ND.T1tSTJNG··-oF--()~;tt·--~JQJ-TIP}•-.-F~L~ 
c;'lFIREDEAUIPMENTi 

, "-'==~-"'"·----•---'-·"'==-~-__,, __ :,: . _,_:,~~~:_-=_.c ... , -.I 

No Sa11 FranCisco Mecha11ical. Code_ Amendments. 

n:\legana\as2019\J;9004l5\01391064:docx 

7 

351 



EXHIBIT A 

STANDARD FINDINGS FOR SAN FRANCISCO 
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AMENDMENTS 

1. Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk for 
earthquake-induced failure and consequent fire due to local hazardous 
microzones, slide areas, and local liquefaction hazards. 
(Geology) 

2. Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk of 
fire due to high density of buildings on very small lots, with many buildings 
built up to the property lines. (Topography) 

3. Topography of San Francisco has let to development of a high density of 
buildings on small lots', necessitating special provisions for exiting, fire 
separation, or fire-resistive construction. (Topography) 

4. Many buildings are built on steep hills and narrow streets, requiring 
special safety consideration. {Topography) 

5. Additional fire, structural and other protection is required due to high 
building density and crowded occupancy. {Topography). 

6. San Francisco has narrow, crowded sidewalks due to building and 
population density and unusual topography. {Topography) 

7. All rain water in San Francisco drains to the building drains and sewer; 
unusual geology, occasional extremely high local rainfall amounts, and the 
configuration of the City as a peninsula restrict the.installation of separate 
storm water and sewer systems. (Topography, Climate, Geology) 

8. Moist, corrosive atmosphere of salt-laden fog in San· Francisco 
necessitates additional requirements. (Climate) 

9. Not a building standard; no local findings required. 

10. Soil conditions in this region induce adverse reactions with some 
materials, leading to premature failures and subsequent unsanitary 
conditions. (Climate) 

11 . The region is subject to fluctuating rainfall due to changes in climatic 
conditions. (Climate) · 

12. San Francisco is a peninsula surrounded on three sides by water at sea 

352 



level; mitigation of climate change impacts, including sea level rise, is 
critical to the long term protection of the local built environment and local 
infrastructure. (Topography) 

13. Climate and potential climate change impacts San Francisco's water 
resources, including reservoirs and distribution facilities. (Climate) 

14. Organic material in San Francisco's waste breaks down into methane gas 
which is a significant contributor to climate change. (Climate) ~ 

15. San Francisco is topographically constrained and its built environment 
occupies most available land, requiring minimization of debris and solid 
waste. (Topograp~y) 

16. Prevailing winds, coastal mountain ranges, and periodic seasonal high 
temperatures contribute to photochemical reactions that produce smog 
and ozone; limiting the emission of smog's chemical precursors -volatile 
organic chemicals and oxides of nitrogen - is necessary to health and 
safety. (Climate, Topography) 

17. The aquifers underlying San Francisco are small relative to local 
population, necessitating ongoing water imports and special provisions to 
ensure efficient use of water in local buildings. (Geology) 

353 

2 



2019 San Francisco Mechanical Code Findings 

CHAPTER 1 
Section# Finding# 

101.1 9 
103.1 9 
103.4 9 
103.5 9 
103.6 9 
104.2 .9 
104.3 9 
104.4 9. 
104.4.3 9 
104.5 9 
106.7 9 
106.8 9 
106.9 9 
107.0 9 

· CHAPTER2 
NO SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS 

1302.2.2 

CHAPTER 3 
Section# Finding# 

9 

CHAPTER 4 
NO SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS 

CHAPTER 5 
Section# . I Finding# 

504.3 9 

3 

354 



CHAPTERS 6 and 7 
NO SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS 

CHAPTER 8 
Section# Finding# 

802.2.6 9 
802.6.1 5 

802.8 5 

925.1 
Section # I · Fin

5
ding # 

------------------~----------------------~ 

CHAPTER10 
Section# Finding# 

1013.1 9 
. 1013.2 9 

1013.3 9 
1013.7 9 

CHAPTERS 11, 12, 13, 14, 15,16 and 17 
NO SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS 

APPENDICES B and C 
NO SAN FRANCISCO MECHANICAL CODE AMENDMENTS 

n:\legana\as20 19\1900415\0 l393182.docx 

4 

355 



'cP¥Ml.ssiqtt · 
A'flliii~:Mcc~dhy 
-~~-~i~~ll( 

mmniWalker · 
vi~rcilfi:iEint 

}(eVin cfincft; . 
. JoJm:Koh'stin 
friu1k"tei:
·Sik.'M-o~ 
·James.wa~hell 

: . .sOhY,a:f!~njs· 
. -~re;1;ary 

Shi~eyW(ll)g 
Ai~i~tanr~ti ·.· . .. , -· ...... ·· ·:- .... q.: 
-Tom:~;Hui 
:5:E".,, .... ·. . 
·c~;q._1 , Q,ireJ;tor 

Ms. Angela Calvillo 
Clerk of the Board 
Board of Supervisors, City Hall . 

. 1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 
San Francisco, CA 941 02-4694 · 

-,1 ;., •• 

RE: Code amendments to the 2019 California Building Standards Code, 
including the Building, Existing Building, Residential, Mechanical, . 
Plumbing, Electrical, and Green Building Codes and recomme-nd approval 
to the Board of Supervisors . 

Dear Ms. Calvillo: 

On July 17, 2019 the Building Inspection Cornmission held a public 
hearing. on the proposed Code amendments referenced above. 

The Commission voted unanimously (6-0) to recommend that the Board of 
Supervisors approve the amendments. 

The Commissioners voted as ·follows: 

Pres·ident McCarthy · Yes 
Commissioner Clinch Yes 
Commk;;sioner Lee Yes 
Commissioner Warshell Yes 

Vice-President Walker 
Commissioner kon~tin 
Commissioner Moss 

Yes 
Excused 
Yes 

Enclosed please find the Code Advisory Committee's recommendation to the . 
BIC. Under separate cover, copies of the proposed amendments will follow 
fr~m the Technical Services Division of the Departm~nt of Building Inspection. 

Should you have any questions, please· do not hesitate to call me at 558-6164. 

Sincerely, 

·~o~~~ 
Sorwa Harris 
Commission Secretary 

356 



cc: Tom C. Hui, S.E., C.B.O., Director 
Mayor London N. Breed 
Supervisor Vallie Brown 
·supervisor Sandra Lee Fewer 
Supervisor Matt Haney 
Supervisor Rafael Mandelman 
Supervisor Gordon Mar 
Supervisor Aaron Peskin 
Supervisor Hillary Ronen 
Supervisor Ahsha Safai 
Supervisor Catherine Stefani 
Supervisor Shamann Walton 
Supervisor Norman Yee 
Deputy City Attorney Robb Kapla 

357 



, . _ Pre.s(rJinJ:t; Disttict 7 
no4IU) ~l$tJPJi;RYJ:SOJ}s. 

· ' · 'R .E, r- -~·iJ· 0 cc' ~ · • \_. v~ -r ~.....,.. 1 ... , .. 

'BOA RoD OF ~HJPERVISGRfL 
. SAN I":R AHC!SCO .... 

.. 1 ~1B:~ftl;n-n'2g~:lf.'I>hife.•no:~, Z44 
il F ilnti$£Q~ CA ?.419~~46~, 

t">Y-~e'-"':"·~~~~~r.r-.:;~~,.~,~ .. • o. . 
.. •, F~iNo.554~7~74 

TDD/rTY No. 544."~S4(i ,· 
-:--t.:· -~: _:<}.'·.-i:~·-·:.;·r: -..:· •. · .,s""~ .. .;r- :; ... ~: .. ;,,_._ 

,. ·========~========~===================~=====~~============================~==== 
.,·PRESlDEN'I'iAiAc'tioN 

P.~te: 

':fq: · Angela. c~~a1 ct~tt~of:fu¢~~9m:do£Si+p~r.visois 

,· Mad~trtCletk, . · · 
. P:ut~_qant to -:B.o~rd Rules, tam he~eby; 

l8i Wai¥10.~ 3Q~DayRu~e. q3oard Rule N9~ ~.23) 
,., ! 

. · ,.: 

. El.· 

Fil '1\.T . e.~,'lo . 

bm:tt:ion; 0 Partial · 

Osta.rt Thne _' --'-'---:,_,_,;=:;..:, 

· QUntil original LoJnrrum~e 

358 



City and County of San Francisco 
Department of Building Inspection 

September 20, 2019 

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board 
Board of Supervisors 
#1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 
San-Francisco, CA 94102-4689 · 

Dear Ms. Calvillo: 

__ "\V t.D' London N._ Breed 
it vt, H'>.E" vI <t. Xnr!J c. Hui, S.E.,, C.B.O., Director F Q~r Kl ~~~~ . 
. F'h". "-lr~\c:,c.{) '!'\ 1-'-i<'-' ~" 

.Attached please find an original and two copies (1 electronic CD) of seven proposed ordinances 
(approved by the Building Inspection Commission on July 17, 2019) for the Board of Supervisors 
approval, which repeal the San Francisco amendments to the 2016 California Building Standards 
Codes and adopt replacement amendments to the new 2019 California Building Standards Codes 
effective January 1, 2019. (One copy of these 2019 California Building Standards Codes. are 
hereby provided for your reference.) 

The following is a list of accompanying documents: 

1) Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission 
2) San Francisco Building Code and Residential Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest), Exhibit 

A Stand.ard Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text (Building) 
3) San Francisco Existing Building Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, propos~d amendment text. (Existing Building) 
4) San Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Findings, 

Findings, proposed amendment text (Electrical)· 
5) San Francisco Mechanical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text (Mechanical) 
6) San Francis~o Plumbing Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Findings, 

Findings, proposed amendment text (Plumbing) · · 
7) San Francisco Green Building Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text. (Green), Cost effectiveness study. 
. . 

In order for the San Francisco code amendments to coordinate with the California codes, which have 
·an effective date of January 1, 2019, the timeline for approval and adoption requires that the codes be 
submitted to the Board of Supervisors on or before Sept~mber 23, 2019 for introduction and 
assignment to the Land Use Committee (on October 1, 2019). We will be reque~;>ting a waiver to the 
thirty-day rule-prior to hearing at the Land Use Committee such that the Codes may be heard by the 
Land Use Committee on October 7, 2019. When approved, it is proposed that the Board of Supervisor 
agendize Readings on October 15, 2019 and October 22, 2019. Upon their approval, the ordinances 
will be fo!Warded to the Mayor for signature within 10 days, followed by a 30-day wait period (ending 
approximately December 9, 2019) before filing with the California Building Standards Commission to 
become effective for an implementation date of January 1, 2020. 

Technical Services Division 
1660 Mission Street- San Francisco GA 94103 

Office (415) 558-6205- FAX (415) 558-6401- www~sfdbi.org 

359 



...... ~·--~. 

) 

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board Page 2 of 2 

The following person may be contacted regarding this matter: 

Michelle Yu, Manager 
Technical Services Division 
Department of Building Inspection 
Phone: (415) 558-6059 

Attachments: As stated 

Technicai Services Division 

September 20, 2019 

1660 Mission Street- San Francisco CA 94103 
Office (415) 575-6205- FAX (415) 558-6401 - www.sfdbi.org 

360 



Table of Content 

1. General 
a. Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission 

2.. Building Code and Residential B.uilding Requirel!lents 
a. Legislative Dig!'!st 
b. San Francisco Building Code Ordi~ance including Residential Building Requirements 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d. Findings 
e. San Francisco Bui.lding CodeAmendments 
f. Residential Building Requirements- See Chapter 36 of the San Francisco Building Code 

3. Existing Building Code 
a. Legislative Digest 

. b. ·San Francisco Existing Building Code Ordinance 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d. Findings 
e. San Francisco Existing Building Code Amendments 

4. Electr.ical Code 
a. Legislative Digest 
b. Sari Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d. Findings 
e. San Francisco Electrical Code Amendments 

5. MechaniCal Code 
a. Legislative Digest 
b: San Francisco Mechanical Code Ordinance 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d. Findings 
e. San Francisco Mechanical Code Amendments 

6. Plumbing Code 
a. Legislative Digest· . · 
b. San Francisco Plumbing Code Ordinance· 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d .. Findings 
e. San Francisco Plumbing Code Amendments 

7. Green Building Code 
a. Legislative Digest 
b. San Francisco Green Building Co~e Ordinance 
c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 
d .. Findings 
e. San Francisco ~reen Building Code Amendments 
f. Nonresidential New Construction Reach Code Cost Effectiveness Study 
g. Cost-effectiveness Study: Low-Rise Residential New Construction 

361 



362 


