
File No. 190963 Committee Item No. 5 
--~~~------------- ---~--~---

Board Item No._____ S 

COMMITTEE/BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 
AGENDA PACKET CONTENTS LIST 

Committee: Land Use and Transportation Committee Date October 28, 2019 

Board of Supervisors Meeting 
Cmte Board 

Date ~~~~ 1;2.) ~\~ 
D D 
D D 
~ § ~ 
D 
n n 
L_J L-J 

D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 

Motion 
Resolution 
Ordinance 
Legislative Digest 
Budget and Legislative Analyst Report 
Youth Commission Report 
Introduction Form 
Department/Agency Cover Letter and/or Report 
MOU 
Grant Information Form 
Grant Budget · 
Subcontract Budget 
Contract/ Agreement 
Form 126 - Ethics Commission 
Award Letter 
Application 
Public Correspondence 

OTHER (Use back side if additional space is needed) 

~ DRAFT 2019 SFPC 
~ Exhibit A Findings 
~ 2019 CPC <--***CLICK HERE TO VIEW 
~ BIC Ltr 081219 
~· DBI Ltr 092019 
~ Referral CEQA 100819 
~· CEQA Determination 101519 
D 
D D 
D D 
D D 
D D 

Completed by: Erica Major Date Octob!\r 24~2019 
Completed by: __ E=r=ic=a_,_,M=a=jo'-'-r _____ Date UJ{~4~~ 

***PATH NAME: 
https:// sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=77297 42&GUID=8663671A-14AA -464F­
B908-39BE11486432 

363 

https://sfgov.legistar.com/View.ashx?M=F&ID=7729742&GUID=8663671A-14AA-464F-B908-39BE11486432


FILE NO. 190963 ORDINANCD--}0. 

1 [Plumbing Code- Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of2019 Edition] 

2 

3 

4 

5 

6 

7 

8 

9 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Plumbing Code .in its entirety and enacting a 2019 

Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as amended by San 

Franei~cp; aqopthJg 1eiJly!ronmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
', •.; ", "" '-~ ~:,<:'.'..,))'>,.. t'J'I·, ''' '\• I ~·,. 

California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and 

10 

11 

12 

13 

directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the 

California Building Standards Commission as required by State law. 
.. 

·; 

NOTE: Unchanged Code text and uncodified text are in plain Aria! font. 
Additions to Codes are in single-underline italics Tzmes New Roman font. 
Deletions to Codes are in strikethrough, italics Times }{ew Romanfont. 
Board amendment additions are in double-underlined Arial font. 
Board amendment deletions are in strikethrough Aria! font. 
Asterisks (* * * *) indicate the omission of unchanged Code 
subsections or parts of tables. 

14 Be it ordained by the People of the City and County of San Francisco: 

15 Section 1. Environmental Findings. The Planning Department has determined that the 

16 · actions contemplated in this ordinance comply with the California Environmental Quality Act 

17 (California Public Resources Code Sections 21000 et seq.). Said determination is on file with 

18 the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors in File No. 190963 and is incorporated herein by 

reference. The Board affirms this determination. '• . . t 

. ·: ~· 

Section 2. General Findings. 
( .. 

19 

20 

21 

22 (a) The California Building Standards Code is contained in Title 24 of the California 

23 Code of Regulations. It consists of 12 Parts, which are based upori model codes that are 

24 amended by the State agencies with jurisdiction over the subject matter. The California 

· 25 Plumbing Code is Part 5 of Title 24 of the California Code of Regulations. 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

364 

Page 1 



1 (b) The State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code every 

2 three years ("triennial CBSC") with supplemental amendments published in intervening years. 

3 The triennial CBSC goes into effect throughout the State of California 180 days after its 

4 publi,cation by the California Building Standards Comm·ission or at a later date established by 

5 the Commission. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go into effect on January 1, ?020. 

6 (c) Local jurisdictions must enforce the California Building Standards Code but they 

7 may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of 

8 local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions. Local amendments may be made both to 

9 the triennial CBSC and to its individual Parts during the intervening years; however, local 

10 amendments previously adopted are not automatically applicable to a triennial CBSC. Rather, 

11 they must be re-enacted with the required findings of local climate, geologic, or topographical 

12 conditions, expressly made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with ~n operative date 

13 no earlier than the effective date of the triennial CBSC~ 

14 (d) As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, by this ordinance the Board of 

15 Supervisors repeals the 2016 San Francisco Plumbing Code in its entirety, enacts the 2019 

16 San Francisco Plumbing Code, and re-enacts the existing local amendments to make them 

17 applicable to the 2019 California Plumbing Code. 

18 (e) Pursuant to Charter Section 03.750-5, the Building Inspection Commission 

19 considered and approved San Francisco's amendments to the 2019 California Plumbing Code 

20 at a duly noticed public hearing that was held on July 17, 2019. 

Section 3. Findings regarding Local Conditions. 

21 

22 

23 (a) California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5 provide that 

24 before making any changes or modifications to the California Plumbing Code and any other 

25 applicable provisions published by the California Building Standards Commission, the 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

365 

Page 2 



., 
i '. 

1 governing body must make an express finding that each such change or modification is 

2 reasonably necessary because of specified local conditions. The local amendments together 

3 with the required findings must be filed with the California Building Standards Commission 

4 before the local changes or modifications can go into effect. 

5 (b) The City and County of San Francisco is unique among California communities 

6 with respect to local climate, geologic, topographical, and other conditions. A specific list of 

7 findings that support San Francisco's modifications to the 2019 California Plumbing Code, 

8 with a section-by..:section correlation of each modification with a specific numbered finding, are 

9 contained in Exhibit A entitled "Standard Findings for San Francisco Building Standards Code 

10 Amendments." 

11 (c) Pursuant to California Health and Safety Code Sections 17958.7 and 18941.5, 
I 

12 the Board of Supervisors finds and determines that the local conditions described in Exhibit A · 

13 constitute a general summary of the most significant local conditions giving rise to the need 

14 for modification of the 2019 California Plumbing Code provisions published by the California 
I . . . 

15 Building Standards Commission. The Board of Supervisors further finds and determines that 

16 the proposed modifications are reasonably necessary based upon the local conditions set 

17 forth in Exhibit A. 

18 

19 Section 4. Repeal of the 2016 San Francisco Plumbing Code and Enactment of the 

20 2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code . 

21 . (a) The 2016 San Francisco Plumbing Code is hereby repealed in its entirety. The 

22 San Francisco Plumbing Code being repealed was enacted on November 22, 2016, by 

23 Ordinance No. 231-16, with an operative date of January 1, 2017. It was amended by 

24 Ordinance Nos. 0096-18, 0065-19, and 0087-19. These ordinances are available on the 

25 Board. of Supervisors' website. 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

366 

Page 3 



1 (b) The 2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code is hereby enacted. It consists of the 

2 2019 California Plumbing Code and San Francisco's existing local amendments, which are re-

3 enacted and expressly made applicable to the 2019 California Plumbing Code. Copies of the 

4 2019 California Pl'umbing Code and the stand-alone San Francisco amendments are declared 

5 to be part of Board File No. 190963 and are incorporated into this ordinance by reference as 

6 though fully set forth. Existing San Francisco amendments that are being made applicable to 

7 the 2019 California-Plumbing Code are shown in unformatted ("plain") text and may include 

8 bold and/or italicized formatting; new San Francisco amendments are underlined; and deleted 

9 San Francisco amendments are in strikeout text. 

10 

11 Section 5. Continuance of Actions Under Prior Code. Nothing contained in this 

12 ordinance shall be construed as abating any action now pending under or by virtue of any 

13 ordinance of the City and County of San Francisco hereby repealed, nor shall this ordinance 

14 be construed as discontinuing, abating, modifying or altering any penalties accruing, or to 

15 accrue, or as waiving any right of the City under any such ordinance. 

16 

17 Section 6. Severability. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this 

18 ordinance is, for any reason, held to be invalid, such decision shall not affect the validity of the 

19 remaining portions of this ordinance. The Board of Supervisors hereby declares that it would 

20 have passed this ordinance, and each section, subsection, sentence, clause, or phrase of this 

21. ordinance, irrespective of the fact that any one or more sections, subsections, sentences, 

22 clauses, or phrases be declared invalid. 

23 

24 Section 7. Effective and Operative Dates. This ordinance shall become effective 30 

25 days after enactment. Enactment occurs when the Mayor signs the ordinance, the Mayor 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

367 

Page 4 



J 

1 returns the ordinance unsigned or does not sign the ordinance wi~hin ten days of receiving it, 

2 or the Board of Supervisors overrides. the Mayor's veto of the ordinance. This ordinance shall 

3 take effect and be in full force on and after either January 1, 2020 or its effective date if the 

4 effective date is later. 

5 

6 Section 8. Directions to Clerk. Upon final passage of this ordinance, the Clerk of the 

7 Board of Supervisors is hereby directed to transmit to to the California Building Standards 

8 Commission pursuant to the applicable provisions of State law 1) this ordinance, 2) the Exhibit 

9 A attachment, and 3) the San Francisco amendments to the 2019 California Plumbing Code. 

10 

11 

12 

13 

14 

15 

16 

17 

18 

19 

20 

21 

22 

23 

24 

. 25 

APPROVED AS TO FORM: 
DENNIS . HERRERA, City Attorney 

By: 
. ITH A. BOYAJIAN 

1puty City Attorney 

n:\legana\as2019\ 1900415\01391 085.docx 

Building Inspection Commission 
BOARD OF SUPERVISORS Page5 

368 



FILE NO. 190963 

LEGISLATIVE DIGEST 

[Plumbing Code- Repeal of Existing 2016 Code and Enactment of 2019 Edition] 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a 2019 
Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 California Plumbing Code as amended by San 
Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and 
directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the 
California Building Standards Commission as required by State law. 

Existing Law 

The Plumbing Code regulates the installation and maintenance of plumbing systems and 
fixtures, water heaters, water supply and distribution, sanitation and ventilation systems, 
drainage, fuel piping, and medical and gas vacuum systems. The current San Francisco 
Plumbing Code consists of the 2016 California Plumbing Code (which incorporates the 2015 
Uniform Plumbing Code) and San Francisco's local amendments to the 2019 California 
Plumbing Code ("San Francisco Amendments"). 

Amendments to Current Law 

Every three years the State of California adopts a new California Building Standards Code 
("triennial CBSC"), which amends the California Plumbing Code and the other state codes that 
constitute the CBSC. The 2019 triennial CBSC will go into effect throughout the State on 
January 1, 2020. As in past triennial CBSC adoption cycles, San Francisco will repeal its 
existing Plumbing Code in its entirety and adopt a new Plumbing Code that applies San 
FranCisco's existing local amendments to the new California Plumbing Code. Except for non­
substantive or technical modifications required by amendments to the state code, there are no 
changes to the existing San Francisco Plumbing Code amendments being carried forward. 

Background Information 

Local jurisdictions are required to enforce the California Building Standards Code but they 
may also enact more restrictive building standards that are reasonably necessary because of 
local climate, geology, or topography. Local amendments may be made to a triennial CBSC 
and also throughout the intervening years. However, local amendments previously adopted 
are not automatically transferred to a new triennial CBSC. Rather, they must be re-enacted 
with the required findings of local climate, geologic, or topographical conditions, expressly 
made applicable to the new triennial CBSC, and with an operative date no earlier than the 
effective date of the new State Code. 

n:\legana\as2019\ 1900415\0 1384329.doc 

BOARD OF SUPERVISORS 

369 



BOARD of SUPERVISORS 

Lisa Gibson 
Environmental Review Officer 
Planning Department 
1650 Mission Street, Ste. 400 
San Francisco, CA 941 03 

Dear Ms. Gibson: 

October 8, 2019 

City Hall 
Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 

San Francisco 94102-4689 
Tel. No. 554-5184 
Fa)( No. 554-5163 

TDDfiTY No. 554-5227 

File No. 190959"190.964 

On October 1, 2019, the .Building Inspection Commission submitted the proposed legislation: 

File No. 190959 

Ordinance repealing the· 2016 Building Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Building Code consisting of the 2019 California Building Code and the 
2019 California Residential Code, as amended by San Francisco; adopting 
environmental findings and findings of local conditions . under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providing 'for. an operative ·date of 

· January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of. the Board to forward the 
legislation 'to the California Building Standards Commission as required by 
State law. 

File No. 190960 · · · 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Existing Building Code in its entirety and 
enacting a 2019 Existing Building Code ·consisting of the 2019 California 
Existing Building Code as amended by San Francisco; adopting 
environmental findings imd findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providfng for an operative date of 
January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board to fon.niard the 
legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as required by 
State law. 

File No. 190961 

Ordinance repealing the 201.6 Electrical Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Electrical Code consisting of the 2019 California Electrical Code as 
amended by San Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings 
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing 
an operative date of January 1 '· 2020; and directing the Clerk of the Bo(;lrd 
of Supervisors to forWard the legislation to ~he California Building 
Standards Commission as ~equired by State law. 

370 



File No. 190962 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 1\(lechanical Code in its entirety and enacting 
a 2019 Mechanical Code consisting of the 2019 California Mechanical Code 
as amended by San ·Francisco; · adopting environmental findings and 
findings of local conditions un.der the California Health and Safety' Code; 
providing an operative date of January 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of 
the Board of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California 
Building Standards Commission as required by State Jaw. 

File No. 190963 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Plumbing Code in its entirety and enacting a 
2019 Plumbing Code consisting of the 2019 Californi'a Plumbing Code as 
amended by s·an Francisco; adopting environmental findings and findings 
of local conditions under the California Health and Safety Code; providing 
an operative date of Januat~y 1, 2020; and directing the Clerk of t.he Board 
of Supervisors to forward the legislation to the California Building 
Standards Commission as required by State law. 

File No. 190964 

Ordinance repealing the 2016 Green Builclii:lg . Code in Its entirety and 
enacting a 2019 Green Building Code consisting of the 2019 California 
Green Building Standards Code as amended by San Fran~isco; adopting 
environmental findings and findings of local conditions under the 
California Health and Safety Code; providing for an operative d~de of 
January 1, ·2020; and directing the Clerk of the Board of Supervisors to 
forward the legislation to the California Building Standards Commission as 
required by State law. 

The above'legislation are being transmitted to you for environmental review. 

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board 

J~~~ 
By: Erica Major, Assistant Clerk 

La~d Use and Transportation Committee 

Attachment 

c: Joy Navarrete, Environmental Planning 
Don Lewis, Environmental Planning 

Not defined as a project under CEQA Guidelines 
Sections 15378 and 15060( c)(2) because it would not 
result in a direct or indirect physical change in the 
environment.· 

Joy Navarrete 10/15/2019 

2 

371 



2019 

San Francisco Plumbing Code 

Amendments to the 

2019 California Plumbing Code 

Operative date: January 1, 2020 

372 



-Text Format; . . . . . . .. . .. . .. .. . . . .. _:P.,~-F:'i 
·.' . ·. . . . ' _._-"7::-··: ·~----··-:-·-::~~-;;--~- ·--~-·- -~-~~~-_,·-:-~---_--_.,., __ .,, __ :·"'"""":"~---~--·--::--_-:--,-- '~------._ ,.-----:;--~--·-------. -.-:.-_ --. ··--.---------1 

_Un~li@gegJallgE<lg~from t!1eJ_9J9. C~lif()fl.ll~-~o~_i§ §JJ.~§~21 .al'l:2.l:R<lY_~~lude k~l<J _§,gW_psiJJilic_:)!~!lJ 
Iorrnattipg.j -_-_ _ -_ _ _ _ _ _ · _ _ _ _ ,/~~~- · _- . _ _ __ _ _ _ 

Sa1t Francisco amendments are pri:ntedin unformatted CUvlt\l~~rt~Z'J;:Jmd tnayJndude bold and/or 
italiciZed fotmiitting. · · __ ._ · ·· -:~:iii;:c> -·.::~i;i~=-- , 

Repealed Sati FranCiscO amendments appeal'phrin qild~ffrikeout. --H'~~- --· 
New S.<n1F.1·ancisco amendm~:n!s<tp}!e&r1lnderlin,~31~~-~'"- :,;;;;;~ 

. --~.§~~~=~-. ;~~f"-; 
io:.;_~;1_~:· 

_ .. --~---i~~JGh;pt¢~-1?#~~:· ___ . __ " 
rt\DMINISTRATION1 

' .. _.----------,~;Division ~~--,,;~1~;~ 

c.ALntoRNIA AnNrrNfsrRAfioN 
No &mFranciscOPlwrtbii~~tflPd;A;;ttlt§Ii;~nt; -~:;.}~f!!JffT~-;, ~--~- -- . - ..... 

r~ 

-,_,.-.. ,-~-

r---·---_ .--~"""'~~~------ .-:_-~-=-- .... - ~·-~~:.=.:~ 

~SECTIQtJ_-1 01.0 - GENERAL -~::-y:,c:;; 

-~:~;n1v~i~nn1 
···-::·--·-.·-~, 

~.ADMINISTRATION 
. L~...=c-·__:- --~·~::.....-· - -~----· -_,_'7---. -. -·. __ ..:....._..:... ___ ..::: __ ~~ 

. ;,~~--~~~f~:, 

i 01.1 Revi;e ti1is s~ctfoff!Js.lfplldl-;;--· ~~;, . '" 

1 Ol.J··. Title.-Thli doc~~~~t ~~aifE~okP:~~;-:a;ih~'7~®+620 19 San francisco Pl~bihfc-t;'d(;,"';;~a)rbe cite<!] 
• - . . . • . . ' ~ - • :1 - . ·~-~-~-·- -~------- ~~-···------

a:s SUCh, ai:J,d Will he Teferred tQ hei"eih flS HtllS Cpde:''· 
C ..... -.,--,--,.-, ....... ,.' .•••• , • ----.·• .----- ·~~---- , ... ·• -. •• -..-- .. ---- ',-.._ •·•·' 1 • 

·--~~:.~F· 

:SECTION 103.0 -DUTIES AND POWERS OF THE AUTHORITY HAVING 1 .iURJ:SDICTION! .-- ..... ----. --~---~-------- ----- . ---~----------· - -·· ~~-- --~--- - . 
103.1 Replace the third patilgrap/1 JNtli the follcr~;l!fhgs~ 

The Authodty Having Jurlsdfction, when iiecessary;. may calf upon the Poiice DepartmHlt and other. City and . 
Cqtihty of San Franqi'sco agencies fot ~idot assistance in eari'ying ci1+t ot emotcmg miy- of the provisions of 
~~~ . . . . . 

103.4 .Remse the first paragraph ofthissectiOii.as/ollorvs;' 

--~~~rc~!~}!!:~~-~~~1~!i~~ff~~1~l~~~iJ:ili~~~~~li:~!~f~~~~~~r~;~:~o~;~r;~:~1or · 
1 

373 



103.5 Add the following section: 

103.5 Rules and Regulations. The Authority Having Jurisdicti _ have the power to render 
_ interpretations of this code and to adopt and enforce rules and ~gp ''-'""' ntal regulations to clarify the 

application ofits provisions._ Such interpretations, rules and ~~ll:ltl:qJi§;,~hall be in conformance with the 
intent and purpose of this code. Such rules and regulations.coll:llnonfy~;'' rred to as "Code Rulings" and 
"Administrative Bulletins" supplemental to this code, 'ot take effec Jil approved by the Building 
Inspection Commission and signed by the Authority_;;: _.· g Jurisdiction e ~]tin unusual circumstances 
where the Authority Having Jurisdiction has dete -. at there is an imme'aljft~,p.eed to protect the public 
health and safety. When the Authority Having JurisdictlQ:P,lfinds th ·- ch circuni~tfiD-£es exist, the Authority 
Having Jurisdiction may order immediate of'ilF~'arti e or regulat1Qnk;;The Authority 
Having Jurisdiction shall arrange for a es and regulatiorl~ the entire cost of 
which is to be borne by the subscribers. 
103.6 Add the following section: 

103.6 Code Revisions. The 
Commission, at intervals 
studies ofthe following: 

1. Requests of the 
materials, alternate designs 

2. Code 
3. Code 

Building 
4. Results v. u.o.:uu~"u. 

5. Changes 
interested persons. 

6. Investigations 
building performance. 

7. Periodic changes to 
code. 

_"_,:tto the Building Inspection 
fdt1~hanges to this code, based on 

and for approvals of alternate 

in legal actions taken to conect code violations. 
of construction or design, and changes proposed by 

8. Administrative Bulletins Rulings cunently in effect 
9. Violations of the code found on inspections or investigations. 

I 03. 7 Add the following section: 

103.7 Modifications. When there are practical difficulties involved in can·ying outthe provisions ofthis 
code, the Authority Having Jurisdiction may grant modifications for individual cases. The Authority Having 
Jurisdiction shall first find that a special individual reason makes the strict letter of this code impractical and 
that the modification is in conformance with the intent and purpose of this code and that such modification 
does not lessen the standard of this code to safeguard life or limb, health, prope1iy, or public welfare.- The 
details of any action granting modifications shall be recorded and entered in the files of the Department of 

374 

2 



) 

Building Inspection. 

]1I~ 
104.1 Add the following as the second paragraph of this section: 

Emergency work for the protection of life or limb, health, prope1ty and public welfare shall have a permit 
obtained within one day of commencing such work, excluding Saturdays, Sundays and legal holidays. 
I 04.1.1 Add the following section: 

104.1.1 Homeowner's Permit. A permit for p1Ull1bing work in, on or about a single-family dwelling may 
be issued by the Authority Having Jurisdiction, provided said work is""gone by the owner or a family member 
who has demonstrated, to the satisfaction of the administrative auth £;":''"'1 his or her qualifications to 
satisfactorily perform the plumbing work in the dwelling which · intended to be, occupied by the 
owner. If the plumbing work performed under the homeown > ''""'c'' does not comply with the 
requirements of this code and if the corrections are not m~ff ·~· 'equfi!~'' :. . the Department of Building 
Inspection, then the work shall be corrected by a State-li¢~Tised plumbiri: ~.ortractor under a separate permit. 

Such State-licensed plumbing contractor shall be r. .· d to pay only th~l[~gpit issuance fee as set forth in 
Section 11 OA, Table 1 A -C - Plumbing/Mechanical P '"'"''' Issuance and Inspettt¢,!1 Fees - of the Building 
Code. If additional inspection is required, the approprl.'ar'·s ees as set,f()rth in SecHQ"J1,,Jl OA, Table lA-C -
Plumbing/ Mechanical Permit Issuance and · Fee ~}lA-G- Insp~dti2J1, Surveys and 
Repmts - of the Building Code shall '"~';'"' 
104.1.2 Add the following section: 

. 104.1.2 Amending Applications. After a · 
made, the scope of the permit be altered 
additional work as set forth . , · . ·, -C - nl .... c·"'''" 

Table lA-G -Inspections, .. · ' · 
104.2 

piping. 
(3) 

cutting into or rento.Yal 
(4) 
(5) Replacement 

,:J! <:tn inspection of the work has been 
p6tmitapplication and paying fees for any 

· .•. Perrillt~Issuance and Inspection Fees and 
· Code. 

cutting into or removal of traps or 

, ~gle stops, hose hibbs or roof drain not requiring 

th altemate water piping. 

( 6) Removal of arama.ge};;i'Y;f<tter .. piping from a building when th.e water supply, gas and drainage 
lines have been . aril'\'i':n,,,.rl manner under a permit. 

(7) Workinvolved in of plumbing fixtures or appliances, when not connected to any 
supply or drainage lines, in a 

(8) Replacement of water conservation devices not requiring cutting into or removal of piping. 
(9) Work performed in buildings or structures owned and occupied by the State and Federal govemments. 

104.3 Replace this section as follows: 

m'Q~~~iil!~UTl!i]l!~t~] Permit applic~nts shall file with the Depmtment of Building Inspection an 
application on a form fmnished for that purpose. 

A permit for inspection of the proposed plumbing work set forth in the application will be issued to State­
licensed contra~tors or to homeowners subject to the requirements of Section 1 04.1.1. A separate permit shall 
be obtained for each separate building, structure or prope1ty. 

3 

375 



104.3.2 Replace this section as follows: 

[[.~~~ Inspections Not Covered by Permit Fees. 
104.3.2.1 Off Hours oflnspection. Off-hour inspection may be performed outside normal inspection 
hours by prior arrangement and prepayment of fees as set fmih in Section 11 OA, Table lA-G- Inspections, 
Surveys and Repmis - of the Building Code. 
104.3.2.2 Reinspections. A reinspection fee shall be assessed for each inspection or reinspection made 
necessary by any of the following conditions: . 

(1) when the pmiion of the work for which the inspection is requested is not complete or code complying. 
(2) When previously identified deficiencies in the work are not properly coiTected. 
(3) When the approved consttuction documents are not available inspector. 
( 4) When access is not provided on the date and time of the appointment. 
( 5) When work deviates from the approved consttuction 
The first reinspection for failure to comply with code reclUiJ;grrl~h not be assessed a reinspection fee. 

shall be charged a reinspection All subsequent reinspections for the same or subsequent en;ors~or vu.u"'.~'"'\ 
fee. 

Subsequent to inspector dete1mination of · 
inspections shall be made nor shall the job be given 
approval until the required reinspection fees are paid. 
and Reports - of the Building Code for fees. 
104.3.2.3 Survey. A plumbing survey 
to establish code compliance of existing 
Table lA-G- Inspections, Survey and .n.vuvJ.•c 

104.4 Add a ne1v second paragraph to_this section 

An issued pennit entitles the 
does not constitute <>nr' .... "''" 

104.4.3 Replace this section 
!ui:£1! Permit ·· ··· ... ·· · 

Code. Permit 
prior to 
llOA, 

or requested 
and occupancy or fmal 
. - Inspections, Surveys 

~the~rer'n. The issuance of a pe1mit 
-•-..,..,,.m:t,.,.., shall not be transferable. 

Section l06A.4A ofthe San Francisco Building 
"'-'.!!,~':"'"-J.a•.,vu request is made to the Building Official 

of the date of permit issuance. See Section 

oJ;,lj~l:vn reJ~mltt,,._J_! ;xpn Due to Work Not Started. A new permit shall 

more than one year 
reduced fees. See Section 
Code for applicable fees. 

· expired perinit on which no work was performed. If not 
'"'vn, .... ,~t1r1n of the original permit, the applicant is eligible for 

- Other Building Permit and Plan Review Fees - ofthe Building 

_ If a refund has been granted ,_..~'"'""'''~ 1 04.4.3, the applicant shall not be eligible for the reduced fees as 
setfmih in Section llOA, Table -Other Building Permit and Plan Review Fees- of the Building Code. 
1 04.4. 3.2 Add the following section: 

104.4.3.2 Recommencement of Work on Permit Expired Due 'to Work Not Completed. The applicant 
shall obtain a new permit for the work not completed. The permit fee shall be based on work remaining to be 
done. Fees shall be as set forth in Section 11 OA, Table lA-C- Plumbing/Mechanical Pe1mit Issuance and 
Inspection Fees - of the Building Code. 
104.5 Replace this section as follows: 

J.J!~1~J;!l1Permit;'i\'~-~B.'~ Before any permit is issued, the applicant shall pay to the Central Pe1mit Bureau the 
fees as set forth in Section llOA, Table lA-C- Plumbing/ Mechanical Permit Issuance and Inspection Fees-

4 

376 



of the Building Code. The replacement of a plumbing fixture or a gas appliance without a change in drainage, 
piping or venting shall not require the payment of petmit issuance fee. A separate permit issuance fee shall be 
paid for each class of work, i.e., sewers and drainage, gas and water. 

Final inspection will not be made unless all outstanding fees related to the permit work have been paid. 
I 04.5.2 Revise this section as follows: 

The Director may reduce the investigation fee to two times the "'M"Y'-~+~· 
Section 110A, Table lA-C- Plumbing/Mechanical Permit 
Code for work that was constmcted prior to the current u..wu~~HF>' 
was done prior to January 1, 1967, if the owner files · 
documents substantiating such dates of work. 

Appeals of investigation fees may be filed with 
et seq. of the Business & Tax Regulations Code. 
Board of Appeals, The Board of Appeals; in · 
less than two times the permit fee as set 
Issuance and Inspection Fees- of the 
I04.5.3 Replace this section as follows: 

!f:Q.af~i~llt;[\tl~~i For fee refunds, see 

I 06.3 Replace this 

.. .. ,~,H~o~'-"'"''- provided in Section 8 
"""'"''-'-V'A' and mles of the 

rnamll(ifli~l~ or the owner's authorized agent, who violates, disobeys, omits, 
neglects or refuses to or opposes the execution of any of the provisions of this code, 

. shall be liable for a civil $500 for each day such violation is committed or permitted to 
continue, which penalty shall · and recovered .in a civil action brought in the name of the people of 
the City and County of San· · · · ' by the City Attorney in any comt of competent jmisdiction. Any 
penalty assessed and recovered in an action brought pmsuant to this paragraph shall be paid to the City 
Treasmer and credited to the Department of Building Inspection's Special Fund. 

Any person, the owner or the owner's authorized agent, who violates, disobeys, omits, neglects or refuses 
to comply with, or who resists or opposes the execution of any of the provisions of this code, shall be guilty 
of a misdemeanor, and upon conviction thereof shall be punished by a fine not exceeding $500 or by 
imprisonment not exceeding six months, or by both such fme and imprisonment, unless otherwise provided 
in this code, and shall be deemed guilty of a separate offense for every day such violation, disobedience, 
omission, neglect or refusal shall continue. Any- person who shall do any work in violation of any of the 
provisions of this code, and any person having charge of such work who shall permit it to be done, shall be 

377 

5 



liable fot the pei;lalty ]_Jtbvid,ed. . ... . . . . . . . . . . . . 
It ~halJ lJe.Uill!lw.fuL:fqt any !Jl'.rs(>n: tq ip_tetfete· Wltll the pbsti.ng o.f aliY 11oti~e pl'ovided fO.r. htt1Iis coqe or t9 . 

tear' dqwn qr mutll11te m.tY scich: notice posted by the Dep!lJ.1:nienfo:fBuildiug Inspection; 
106.$ Ririifsf! iitfs sf!cilonasfoi(oivs:~ .. .. . . . . . ' . . . ' . . . .. 

i\ll!i!B~I!ili~tiflli!ii~iillf,~!!~~ 
procedim:is~see Section 1 02A.16 of the Building .Co.de; · · 

~'~~f!!i:~!~!;;,~e~~~!!Wli\titS! 
±()9.() 107.0 Board of:ExaJll.ilier$; Applic~tionmayh~nnitd 
aliemate materials~ fuethdds arid. types of consttuction a11d fi , .. 
•BuildhigCod¢;·Sectioril05AJ.. · ·· · · ·. ~··· 

· · ·· · · iu'cl 'of Exaiiiii1ers :for .approval· o£ 
<~~the provisions oftliis code, See · 

}()9,() Aikt:thefoliowingsec_tf/Jlii,· · \~,~ 
·s:EcrrtoN' to9:~<l'~" ·· · s Ta~:IDE 
:nr~::~~:~i.l~·ll;~~~~b~~;:e5r~ fa be ~~~~@l>C~.x~~"'do~ \otb¢~1icshm 
bt} :J:epah'ed~at tliQ <?wner' s ex:Peti[~'EY aJ1lt~B~~~ plumoiji' \contraotor in acc.otdance with this cod~. mtl1e:. . 
e.V~:ri.Hhe· .oWner· - ;rpf!,ir the'O,(ff~lli}ye''ouJJ.fijpg~ sew~_ . _ er written :iJ.otiG¢ has: b¢en sentth~ ciW.Jietby the. 

f!?i~~~~~,~~J~iktai~;~;;;~~;:i;;;;~;;;:~·· 
s~Wefto be repaired" ,r;·,t¢pl:;tc~d. 'the ''2~ · thereof'c-shall be pl:lid frot:tJ.the ''PI1J111birig B4ilQiri:g S~'W~ir · · · · 
Revolving Fundtan.d iills]§E~d again ptopeltJ $etyeclP.ysmcibtJUdip:gs~Ywer. .· · · 
~·1093 )?iumhing BfQ!gW,g s . Revol~i'tig· Flui& .A spedaltevolving.ftnid, to be 1fuown as the 
. '':J;?Jgmbmg~WI.cling s:~we:~; Jt'e~ol .. , .. 4t ~s h~feby· CreP.t¢4 fgr.f.he PUt'Pose ofd~tiayfR:g:ih~ ~osts aJ;Ict 
e ertses . hi~hma. be incun•e ·~ .c e'be. mime +6:fl3UU.' A~...;. I s. ecti mean in Ot.>theauthority' .. · :x,:t? - W , Y, ..... ··· . .F :P )ll~ \4+l.~g 1,). :P. 01).. .. . 7 g, lJ. . ........... , 
C01Uei'ted bytffis code to.!tepaitor replace d~fectiv<:; buildmg sewers• . . . . 

The. Bo.atd df S.npet1rist)i's.shal1 trarl'sfe:fone~Jialfqf'the :iUnds appioj;Jfil').ted fo the "'side.Sewei' R6pai:fi1 :fu:iid • 
:ofthe DepattmenfofBuildiilg mspectiml Ot' shalL approprif\h~~ estciblish 01' increase the specialrevo1v1ng fund. 
with $qch fi:g:HJ~ ?IS. it111,[ty qe~i;Il P,e~essary in o:rdet to expetiite perfo!Watice of the w<Jrk ofxepaj:ririg m i·e'" . 
pla:<dng d~fecctfve. bwidiiig s~wets~. the §p~cia.l tt:lvolvmg ftmd :shali:be.repl~m.ishec;I with all ftu'ids·Golleded 
-i.md~t: the prm:;~eding herewafl:er ptovididfor; either itp.ori: voitmtary pa:yme.tits.or as a):es:u.J.fo:fthe s<1le of. th¢. · 
property aftet· delinquency~ oi otherwise~ Balances re.titaillingin ihe: Plmribmg 13uild1ngSewet Revol'Vip.g 
Fluid afthe tloJ?e Of any fiscal Year shall be cai:.riedfotward in such fUnd; ' 
~ l09A Asses~inent for Costs. The Authority llijving11]f1sdictioil shall take action to have the cbstsof 

Q 

378 



all work done o.r. c&used, to be done pwsq(lJlt to this. Section) 09 .. 0 assessed against the parcel or parcels. of 
land upon which said building is served by thebuilding sewer per Sectionl 02A of the Bui!ding Code. Such 
costs shall inc~ude, jn addition to all costs related to tepa:U:ing or replacing the building sewer or derp.olishihg 
~nd clear,ingthe site, the City and County of: San Fran9isco's'eosts iri administering the required work. See 
Section 11QA, Table lA-K. ,. Penalties, Heafings, Code Enforcement Assessments ., of the Building Code for 
the applicable fee. · 

. ·ch~pter 2J 
DEFINITI()NS@~-~[ 

SECTION 201.0- GENERAD ~ ~~- ---u _______ c__;:,i~t~Jt'{' 
'---~. :c:...:..__· -· --·--~~--------~.::. __ :: _____ . _j ~t.;ic;~~~dfi--

.2.0 1.1 Add the·follQ1·i'ing.fO the end Of the ftist St?-l1tei1ce:: 4=-~El~#i ___ ~i"7~,.}}~;~ 

Where words, terms,and pln·ases are not defined,. they shw~lilv~ theh:;6f~]p~y accepted meaning witbip. the 
context with which they are used. ·- -~s;;:,T"' '":::iilh 

r- . ..-. . . . . ·-c 

SECTION204;0 .. _:c:B 
L::..:::-. ---- '---"- _:, ,,._·_-"'-- - ._- ~ ~::.-~'---- ·_.:._;_...o.,_::_ ___ ~ ----- -· 

204.0 Add thefollmvrng dejlnitiom 

Boiler. Aclosed ves~el used :for Uv<~ULJ.J; 
application of' heat from combustible 

. ~CT!_ON:2_98. 0_ -~Ft,;,f:l~~~'h 
.208.0 Add thejolio}i1ing definit!f5fif:;_;/"'' ''~t~ 
Foot Vent- See-~'ReliefV6i\ti.Sectfon~2,Q.O. 

; ~· -~_;-~ ~ 

--
·~ - · . · .• · ·. · - . . ·f{~s': •.. -"'~'fr:~":SL'". 

~::~;-~::if-~-; -~-"'"-~-
~~8i_--

-'"-='-

-~~If-ol 
·o·~i~4:-

- ---. 
~:~~ .. ~-~-;:;..--:=;:_-;;.::~~ 

or f6t'!gM~rating steam or vap'<5; by direct 

,-~.:-~-= 

---

SECTION216 0- N ~""-:;·-,-"'..,.~·- -~~=-

2~~~ ~~!;~?~~;,:,:~~~~~\:=~~:=~~~:~~:'';ewer, &~S or water lines, 
(5} Inadequat .;:gl11mbing syste~maint~na!i~e,· dilapidation, obsolescence; or damage. 
( 6) Plumbing ofi))l1mlhittg:fixmr6~gas appir!uces otpiping installed .in violation ofthis co~e or withouJ 

------ -:::.'--'__:,"'.:: P. · etnu. · ·.· t..·· · '~T.~ .. · - -~~:'f.'. ·. ·.-- · · 

(7) \\'here a. chmige ffi:i9:ssupancy cf~~ificatioii is ntade without cotnplying with the applicable provisions 
oftbis co~e ~d thei?llildfri'tB,Q_de. --- . . . . . 

218.0 ReVise this definitJon as follows: 

Wi#mhtng Syster11~ wdwles~~ii'Pb'table-wifei;~aft~mat~ .Wif~?~'dtii~~-s-:-bUITiiiliiis-upi)1Y:;~Wi~;d~~irlhttticm:pJp~~;1 
·au plumbwg :fixtUres and tr~ps; ~11. mainage,l:!U~ vent pipes; and all building <irain_s and "bl1il(img sewers, 1. ; 
·incl\ldfug the~'respe~tiv~j ow~s mid tonue<;tions,. de vic~~, r:e~epJots; em<! appl,Wen:mces withlll the propertY] 
Alies •ofthe premises andc_sJi~u includepota!Jle: water J?1l>lilg~.potable\yat¢r-treating·o~'Qsing equip111ent L:-c 
·medica}·gas andm.edical VaCl!11111. syste]Jls_, liquid. and fuel gas piping;@d .Water heaters ®ClYents for sa,fne, 
andfu~sprh;kl-ei: ~ysterus.i>i~ibillg' sy~tetiis ~h~ti iiiCind~ all plbnibb;:g applian~eS, pllimbiniappurt~nances 
andplumbin:g fixtures. · · 

7 

379 



;r..-:-_:-·--::-=-~ .. . , - _. ~--- . - :, "-_<:._1 

BECTION22T.O ~,8! 
~~~---- ~:·;· -··--···--- .••• '•!:..---=-.:.::.;:;: 

, 221.0 Add tlu!.foll.iiwing deft(1itib1i[ 

Story. That portion of a: building ii1Cluded betweenJM uppei; ~rur:face ofany ±1oof and 111~. uppet surfac~ of the 
floor next above. Fat tlie. putpose$ oftl:lls c()cie~ })~1¢9:ti)';; l();ft :N:tc1 wezz;f:ltili.i~ l¥vt'flS.'-tlll'lt 9biltam.PNm941g. 
outlets we ~J~o to be cqtiSjdJ~~e<i as $tQ,ries~ · · ···· · · 

f.: h- ;._ '-- t' . ~- --~l -
l -·_ ap eJ.~/bt __ :~--

. _ · f{j:itlSE ___ .· .:.m-QmwTIIDNS 
J-l:J.-8 313.9 Add tit~ following secUon: · 

and3/4:~inch (19, 051Ilin) widt\se¢utelyn~il-t,£ or screwecFr¥ -­
aro1lU.9:tlie pipe; it shall he securect. wW:t aWL4~m~lt (6,3p.imn ._ 

.. ···-· -~1fi~~~h- ''· 

... ~ 

!·::;-~~~-

·.. .. .. MfA~~m1JiRS· 
~~,GJ1CtN·_.iq4i9~~-=~1!4riikJWA!g:&!§Q~~N'I~,· 

504:1 Addtheforlowii7g as the/irst paragraph of this section:· 

504~1 !bo~~tiiE.~ Water Heaters mounted on tli~ extedot or abuilding and located T ot.mor~ above th~ 
. floor cir gmde shall be provided with a pe:rmanent piatfoiifi._ ca:rable ofsuppolting<).te~ter or maintenance 
per~on,, 

380 

8 



~--------, 

.---:-------:-c----:----'Cbapter ~ _______ _ 
WATERSUPPLYANn:niSTRIBUTioNi 

i§A9~Y-_IO~--.N-c--.. · 6o3.o T cR_oss-toNNEcrioN:QoNrRdll 
603~ 1 4dd a third paragrapft t~ this section as follows: 

Structures with alterrtate watetpiping shalf have a Reduced-PressrtrePrinciple Bacictlow Prevention 
Asse1tibly installed on the domestic supply as close as practical to the meter: 
603.3 ?:ldd¢ secondpcll'i:tgraph to t1tls'.s¢ctioii asjollows: ,. 

Refe~· to SFPTJCs, Rules &Regs Section ''A ;:t:Ud/()r (}Cross ccnmectigJ! Conttol",T~bfe 1 a,ridTable 603.2 of 
thy CPC. The more stringent shl3}1 applY, -~"""" , . 
603.5. 6.4 · Addtlie followiitgsection: 

603.5,6.4 A11 such ii1stallatiorts: shaU be approved in 
installation. : · 

~----'--. ..__--_ - - :-_ - ·-. , --::-;----'·.--c"-:-::o",~-.-1 

SECTION604.0 :MATERIALS! '"':-="'-
6D4:t'A_'da tl;e folr;~ing se~;t;;;~~ ·;t,,~-~~a";ji'h;;;~ndp~'~ff:lpk -~-
Co:nAections' be'tWeeP- ~oppe:t; wa,tel' piping ap.d fet1'ous rrttit~iltls ~hj.Jl~be :made 
fittings or btass:nipples of6 iJ:19hes (152 ... --~- .-_fiiihirm:Jffi.ieli~Ji;=S.:~ 

- ' .. -~,..:._.:; 

I . . . . - . • -- - . , - ~ ~ 

~ECTION.6()6.0·_.·.-VALVB~- .' :::· .. -::-·,· c 

-. -, -;~"'"~-;--o"~--~ -\~~~ . 

60~2: .. Revise:·thts sectidtz rl_S /oliolV~;r~¥~~~to'. ~:;~ ·-=::'~:~~0-' ~~~~,;~_ 
6_06.2. Fullway Valve. A:fullFay-~alv~ co~tf;ijb;g~iltl~t;;h~ll be-ii!St~iie,_d....,o_n_t~h-e"d"---is-ch---a-.r -g-c-e_s_i:-d:-:e~o,_,f-.~....,ac--:h:-c ... ! 

t~~~~bt~;,;;~~Xj;~~~i~e'f~J~j.fl~~Q~8b=~[(~~~~ie~P=~~itki~i1:~h~~~i!lfJfng] 
. ph onepi-ewise shall be equipp~dwith a ;parate fullw~y-valve to each builcfulg, soliltf!llgedth~tthe w~ter i­
~upply e~m be tuined oil or. o:ff to anyjndividualor separate buildmg' provided;-J:towever, that ~~pply pipmg_tg] 
'fi §irtgi~~family residence ;mdljllilding accessory thereto shall be perinitteq to.l?e 2ontrolled by o,ne:yalve •. 1 
Such .shvtoff valve~sha1l·be .iiccessible. AJullw'ay _v;;tlve shall be :iilstalled on th~-disdiarge piping from Vv'ater1 
i"-- .. ·-- . -~----_,.,_ . >. ··:· .. ·· .·"<---_.· ; ·- . ---· .. · ... · :--- .. · ... - ·.-~: .-··-.. ·. -,. __ - ~<- -,:.'--_-·1------~ 

~upply tanks at orneartb,etimf.;A fullvr~y_yalve, shall Pt3 m~t~il.:~d OJ:l th~_9.2lSk!Y~~~S_lll)p}ypjp~,~6. ~acJiJ 
;w':lte.I heater ilt_qf .l!~ar f!±e ~~!~rheat~r-::)n case§k1}'hete one: water beater .ol' boiler supplies hot water to 
multiple units additio~tt1tllway valY~~yvill be mstalled so that the hot water supplies to any apartment/ unit 
l dWelling, ot condorlliillufu::ga:n be sh ~:~ without ihte1:tupting th~ :hot w~ter supply to any other apa1tment l 
urutJ c!we1ling w con:domlD!~-' The alves shall he.accessible in the dwelling unit they control or othet 
'co:rnmon ar¢a;wi1:hin the bnii(f''-""?, · · 
606.3' Revise, this section as jd(ows . , 
~o6j.Multidwelling Units.:.:(n:triultic1we11ingunits,on:e_orcrhoreshttto:t{;afv~~~h~ifi;~-Rro-\lid;I-i;-~ati;J. ·: . . . : .. · - .. . . ... . : . . . ~~- ~--------. r·- .... ------------:----:-- -- ------ .. . ------:----:- . ~ 
;ch;velling writ so th~!_t~,~ hot and cold ,w~ter ~~RPJJ:~s t£ any apartment I unit! :d'\Velling or condominium ~18IJ 
be shut offwithout intenu12ting the water supply tcf, another apart.m~nt! lltlit I ciwelling or 9oncio:rp.inilJ,h1. 
):h~seyalv~s shallbe acc"~ssibl~intlie cb¥:~1J,i!:tg_lfnitthey_c()ntro~ or other common area·withinthe building: 
6063.1 Addthefollowing sectimi:·. 

606.3.1 AnY apmfuient/ lilntl dwellmg or condominium. where a remodel is 'petfonrted shall m(')et t11e 
requirements ofsections 606;2, 606.3' and 6Q6.5. 
~f!§:~ _l_?;_~~T::_qtis!_~~o~ as_foll01vs: ______ _ 
60§.§--- Q{)~trolValve~ . AG011.trol v~lve shaUbe.in.still~9: ]DJI!l~<lj~yly.@.e£5! ot_~a,ch plumbing fixture hot 

381 

9 



-. I, 

at1cl cql6 waters11pply and ~1t~r-~MPi1~~d~i.Pi~1i~~sto pei·mit:s~ryi<;:ilig, and r~p1a¢etQ.ent of fn.ciiyidu~ 
~~ . . . . .. . 

606~9_ AddilieJbllowtng seciton; . . 

' 606.9 Ali buildings four stories Of; fuoie:itil1¢igllt or. watei' supply gteater thanAO ·feetabove the;W'atel~ meter 
shall have an appr()yed bacldloV{assemblyliistalled as nea,ra,s possi'bl~Jothe. water·!meter ai1d before. the:' nist 
fitting or bra'n.Ghli.ne;· The bapkfl.ow.as~9ri1blyinstalled sli~ll. 1J~ w a;¢cordanc(;l tO, the degree ofl:iilicb.:d withiit · 
the building~ b.ut in n-o .Gas.~1essthart M ~pp;royed.double vh:~c1c ~ss~mbiy. SeeTaN~6Q~;2, 

.····D~~;~;~~~~~~~~S~tfi\tf~Ni~WBS.J?lN~~;:rQ.&S'~!'tQ~A.~Q~· 
609 ;l(t2 Air Chambers~ ·· Air. cliafubets shall heliista11ei:t 611 aiJ.¥[oiJil:rci:o61&wa.tetoutiets-st.rp;plyllig qtiick;, 
acting vaht¢s t6 j;n~ovicie'wat$.r liM:.u::n¢rtelief;t:he siZ.e ·ot each· --~ · . __ . et :?hall b~ 241:ihies:thf.1'4iamet~r P.:f 

~~~~ij::0!~lioHiii1g s~ctfon; . . _:4{1/:}j;:;~:~ -:~~!~~~~c- . 
6.09~10.~· .Qti.ick;,ActingValv~;~-Th¢.t6Jlowihg val-y~_if~~Wf1rb~·oonsidered-i:tfrJ!~Jf;,a~fuig~'.fhr$hohietei's, 
single" handle. filUcets, si,iigJe+ handle i:Uh and tub/sh"b~I; combination coJ1trof~5?Si sjl)gli;i4i,aJ1dle. ~hoW~t 

:~~::r~i;t:tdoifE:::~~/e~:;;.~::s:C~\j;f\~ '::,1r1f~(;~=~~!~;;o;:::J~,;_e¢.) .,q· 

:~£?l~~£;f~-~~~~------;-;-,~~~ 

. ·\~~~~~~~#~~~ 
-~~~.. ~iltr : ... IlRAINA.lJE~BY:STEMS 

rJe<;~OROf_~~~~&r.~ll£l~Y¥l;W~ the fcruJt~ttonlme ofth~ bmldmg;:: T;fipysh.~ll~ ~&c..l<:~l?~:!!oJJ,%fsrtfi~!£'1~.J~~~W~J • 
(305 mmj beJ9:Wgj!10Wld,J '· , .. · . . · .. 
701,2(7) A;ddthefalloi'(ingsecti -·"··'-';· . · 

1Q1.2(7)·. do ettubht shall TI:bf,l)g•useci fat ul a! draina e m' a lkations·wh1ch ate de-tf.lnientaUo the: . .. . ~p . g . . ''"'' . . . . . ,111, . . ... g .... 1?1t... .. .. . . .. . . ' . . . . .... . .. . ' 
integi:ity ofcoppe:tfubhig. · · · 

··:" 

§g_f£1'!Q~.-.1~§~9.~~ii<iHt\N~~§":ill.IJ~QII:QN2Q~Ji?M-pqi¥It~f~'1Q-wt· 
706.4 Revise this section as follows: 

10 

382 



withinlO feet (304 mm) of the connection oft11evertical to hotizontal~hauge shall enter: the horizontal 
clra:illage line .at least 10 feet (3 04 l:tlin) downstream n.~om the change cir rnay connect into the next vertical 
downstteam line. · · · 

1

sEcrroN·ifo:o-:-n~AGE~6F.:FrxrUREs·.J1ocATED,BEL.O'Y'fi:IE:· L 
:Ne~IJ!PS'l:'R:gfo.MM:ANfi9:Y~ <?R:J2~19.~.I~ MATN_S~~Bl::EVE~: 

71 OJI Add thefol!owil1g section: . . . 
710.1.1 Drainage of.Fixtures Located Belo\v the F):esh Air :fnlet. Where a fixture is installed with, the 
flood din level equal to or lower than the e1evaticirt of the fresh air ihl,(,:t,servingthe hOuse trap, the pipilig 
serving the fixtm:e shall be protected by infjtalling .a:n a:Pproved.tyR¥i§]iJ3~ckwater valve, When~ a ;fixture is 
installed with the flo.od rim leveLhigher than the elevation oft · ·-·-····-~·air inlet serving the hci1:ise trap, the 
fixture shalf not dischatge through such backwater valVe; 

NoSanFh:mcisco Pluntbing Code Amenq:rLiiiits. -~~-¥:.~~ ~:::~·-:i~: 
;::~;:~~~~~'-

,_;__~,.-.£.."··-· 

"~':.:::~~Sf{f~~ ~. ·-
--:"-c:::;=. -..,;_~,...--~;:o::::-- .~~....,---~~<~-

'\Shaptef,~ cc~'', 
!VENTS;~~"' 
~--_--o:~:.-,-~:- "-- :=o:f..~~-_;_:·--~~~ib-. ~:-IHG~~;gt±~~i:.\~ 

... 

--~=f~~~. -~~~-~izJ~Z- -~,~;#~~ 
-~~~~~--=-:s:Ecffo-N 9-oi:o ·::;;GENERAb 

901, T Add the follmvh1ftg_tf(]011dpqJ·;g;·;gpJ1JC1ti1Y'i;JE:tj¢.rF ·'~~~.;,, 

~~~$~~~~~it~~;~;~!(~!~~:~:"Olfyc~~~{~~~~ Svc4venting ~te)l>.shall imnain 
~~f~-=- ··,:_:.o:.-.. :. · "~. 

·,..5~.--:·-=--- --~-0'-~-~·:i~-~--- ~--------..---~-..---------
!sECTION 907.0 ~·VENT STACKS AND RELiEF·VENTS 

.907.1 R~vis~the fo~t;~~f[ij;~ -oftlis-~~~ti!Jh-;-;j~!Tows?' . --- ... .. .. --- -- ... ·. . . . 
,· .. ;·•-"""·''CC':~·;'·:·~·~;-•·-'"•"'·t;·-''''•'t,;,., .... ,."---.-.-··.o,•""•~~-. -· .. -. ~ ·.. ·• · .. · . · · · ; · . ·--· -~ 

907.1 Dr:~inl:lge Stack_. EaGh drainage sta~kthatextends.six (~)_'ormpre stori~s·sh_all}Je seiv~d by al 
parallel ventstack, which shall t;xte11d undiminish~ci in.siie from its up@r!Y!"!"DL~Lart.9.J~Ol?Jl~£!JQtlud 
·:~m~g~jta~ at or inunedi~telY:J~~J,>j{_th~.!<:J_yv~gJ~eAr~:J 
907.3 .At;/4 tlJe fol!Olving $¢cijpnr .~~:~"f-- "F. 

901 ~3 VentSt:1clrs iUld Relief Y ents. Every bulld!ng hi wNch,piumbing is fustalled s.Q.aU haye at least one 
main stackw:hlch: shallxuri uildi.:rilihished ili siZe and as directly as possible from eachbtiildirig drain serving 
said btdldirtg through to the ope1i aii' above the 1·oof. . . . · 

For the putpo'ses of tlus se~tion~ th:e 1Ilain stack: .shall be defined .as thelatgest size stack that. is coruiected to 
a building drain or sewer, · 

Avent stack shall be installed with a soiL or waste stack whenever relief vents or other branch vents are 
tequi:red in; two or more branch intervals. A vent stack shall be installed in accordance. with Section 706.1; 

The size ofth~ soil stack shall be detennin:ed by the total fixture units on that stack as p.er Table 703 .2. 

383 

11 



9! 1.0 Revise this :,•ectjonasfollowsY 
. . . 

· ~I1:~Q~~~j£~Uit~iiiiilJ Cb,·c11it ·vef!tingi$n6t}:l~~Tbiffed 1lhle$stt 1$ appt.o,v.edasat~. alteti1f!tiveei1gih¢.¢h~d 
design in ayQordatJ.ce witl;tS'eption.301.$i?fthl,s C94e, . .. · ... 

. JQ01;3 A4dtlw.folTowfngsp:tfiJn;. 
1001.3 Placement and :Mhilmum SiZe o:f,... ............. 6 · . sewer or bwiding chain shallh~v~· 
a bUilding trapphtced a~r near ~s pbs~ible:to the eutb JJ11ie,QilJ:t.mJID,ed.I:ateJlY~ftl$l!t1e· any ~uoside:wct!k b~s~tn~ut­
waU lihdert$_e §idewal1c Ttap size: shall be: a ;. ' 

drakage P .. L·u !lD,t>inJ:Cs"Y'Ste:II! 
trap shall 1;>¢ l.,IJ.i> llU,U\,j!'<~1iiTra<»'' 

Table. 703:;2l 
Catch basins: or s:utnps to . ot .collect suBsoil• drah1age shall meet the folloWing 

reql.lil'e':(Ueb,.ts: . . . . . . . . . . . 
(1} • The catch hasfn w sl.unp . . . potn:ed inplacei iilid all. s{de:s a1id bottoin sh!l.U.be ~atei~ight\ . 
(2) A:retn,oya,ble metaT gdl~. \l~J?:tQYei:l Jo:t: al?pfi¢4 dqsi~J()~@ ~hilH "Qe pJ.f!ceq 9!1Jo:p witlJ.,jl. sc~·¢e,ri tq 

p:teVeiltmosquito breeding. . . . . 
. (3} ·Each tatch basin shalf b~: served. with its own P:!:tp and ¢le1;Uiolit .. ·and shall ¢olti1ectt<:i the storni oi~ 

sanJtary sysfemindependel;ltly. .. . . · · · 
(4} If inlet .i~ located below th¢ bwldmg S.ewet or drain; tt~S.utnp pi.lmp ¢1J,iiniurn; of1,_ J}2it 0 Kl !IlJh). 

o1+tletmay be ll'sec1i Th~ botto1It,qfsump s]1all.ma.il1,t$in, <t·l'~ () 'J (3Q4. 8 IitrJ1) distap:9e :trom tJre W~t> (n'e<hing. a 
1'- ou (304.8 tiim) si:rndtrap. ' .. · . . ·. · · 

(5) If the depth of the ~titnp is overS'~ 0'1 (1.521h) alargetcatch basin shall be tequired with ap~rn;l@eJJ.t 
ladder sedw:ely bolted to the interiorto provide access for maintenance. Aminimlirti clea:rs:pace of30'' x 30" 

l2 

384 



(762 mm x 762mm) shall be provided. 
{6) A listed and approved plastic catch basin may be instaUed in areas of residential buildings that are not 

subjected to any vehicular traffic and shill beinsfalled em a coiictete bas.e to prevent settling; provided all 
other code requirements of this section and the listing mid installation requirement~ of such, catch basin are 
met. 

_,-~~-=-·-:-::---" ·--'-·----~· -----=-~-,·-~ --------.... 

· ;chapter 11! · ·· 
SToRivr·nRAINAGE ,'-.- ________ , __________ ! 

SE-CTION:ifo:to~~GENE:RAE 
' -- - _______ :._-_ .~:._ -_ <---~-·~--~-.:....:"~---~-:-~-~<.------.--.-.--_:.__· --.::.~-~,--J 

1l 01.2.1 Ad.dthe jolfo1vfng $ec:tiofz: · 

llOL:tl Le;:tders, Connection to Drain~ Ali storm water.:q _:water fromtoofateas, balconies" 
lightwells, comtyards or sirriilat areas. wbichtotal ll1ore tlL@'2'6'0 squar~:i~-~t {18 A squm·e meters) aggregate 
shall drain or.be coirveyed directly to the building draig;~i'ouilding sevv~~YJ;~~I to an: apptoyed alt~rnate ... 

· locat~on based o:Q, apptoveci geotechnical and etigJ11e~ppg;'(iesigns. Such cb.·ml:i~gc;: shall not bt; dirt;cted to flow 
onto adjacent property or. ovet: pub1ic way; inciud.inl~J~~walks. The opening61'Jh~ leac!et shalf meet the 
:;an1e. reqliii:enwnts ·as Section 1103.0 of the Califm'niaPi~~:nbing C§a~=· ':::·;~,~--
lJ01.2.2 Addthefollowingsection: E~ ~'~~~--~ -?~._,;.:.=~ "".~.,. _, 

. 1101;2;2 Tempo:tiny 'Provisions~ Wheft.tli~sj:qnnwater sew~I:ifnot yet installed, the building st01mwater 
drainage system may dischat'ge into the sew~!i9iifi!l~!1ltreet sidenf'j:he mai.11 trap. as neat to the curbli11.e as 

~~d~~~~e.Add tliefollqWing sf!Ciioi1: ·. ~~-:- . ;~~\ ~:·;~:;~(;~'i;ii§:"' ~~iEi~,." . . . 
1101.23 .. Temporary ProxJ,.s{~ri~~Dl':-~j~ Trap~ -.-Vlheli; u(deyft~~p;rovi;ro\s of Section 1101.2 .. 2 the 
building stormwatei dri:tinl:lg;;,system dl.~~garges tot}l~ §£.'\Yft; a traJi'~i,i?-11 be placed in that drain at a point 
near where it branches into tlr?J?~WeL Tii~ftplp shalCb~;supplied with-'cleatl water by an approved I:Jleans such 

as a hose bibb ol!~;EE:~mer; --~'{:;~~~.-~---~_-._~._ -~_.;._-_-_-~_2:-.·C~--ha .. p"'t~e"c:"r'·--1._2 _____ 1·'.. • · 
_·:::':~:2:t'i'":::-·~~-'i'fi~o-- _ -~ _ - - • 

~~~ijf.~¥;;;::~:0t§~~1~i~-}}~--

~:::~ FiffiL GAS PIPING 
:---:;~~%_.::.····· ~-~=?-:i.::f":-- - __J ;: ----~~·:::i~_ . '-:_;.Ji~. 

··-.:;~~i:: 

sEcrroNT2o8.o.~·oAs-P1PruGsYsfEM t>ES!ol\J~ IViAtERIALs:·AND·: 
tol\1f_QNFNIS.~f;~ -·y;~--- ·-- ~-~-- ... -- ----

J2os.s:t Add a second parag,•apb}asfollo . . .· 

Gas piping in,. eXterior loq'ttlt~~;;·. __ ~o" pt as qtherwi,se regulated bythi::; code~ sli11U bv of galvi,Wlzed. iron at 
stevl~ with glllvanizecifittfu.gs, -c:~%1 '

0 

• • • • 

F"----:c·--·----'C-.-.. --~1 

--.. -~~----~---'-----------~ ... : .. ~- 1Cha.pter 13~~; ~-------· ~­
HEALTH CARE FACILITIES AND, MEDICAL GAS AND " 

VA.CUUMSYSJ;EMS 
··---~~-_:_ _ _:,_:_:__.::..__._.:........._· _____ · ·._.:__.:............, __ .....:..-.......: 

No San F'rancisco_ Plurnbing Code Amendn1ents.. 

13 

385 



. ~h.~pj~;t~,-~~ 
F!RESTOJ> PROTECTJQN 

fro SaiiJri·qndsco Pizinibjj1g Code Amendments; 

~ - - p • • ~tfiiilf·~B 

AJ/fERNATE WATER SOURCES :FO:&NONPOTAJJLE - .. .. . .. APPLICATIONS . . . . .. . .......... . 

386 

· .. ·····mal?I.bNWASTE 
·SYST)1MS· 

. f.:: 

·>.· 

14 



Appendix I 
INSTALLATION STANDARD FOR PEXTUBING 

SYSTEMS FOR BOT- AND C.OL~-WATE.R . 
·.DISTRIBUTION 

No San Fr(lncisco Plumbing Code,Ali1e7tdments. 

AppendiXJ 
COMBINATION OFINDOOR.A1W otrr])()QR 

COMBUSTION.AND·VENTIEAJ:l\IN·opENING.DESIGN 
No San Francisco Plumbing Code Amendnients.. · ·~~q;d ~~'"';.'~;"-" . . .. . . . .. ... .. . . . ·. . .... · .. 

;~~~'t;.: ... 

i1:\lf:gana\as2019\1900415\0l391480.docx 

15 

387 



EXHIBIT A 

STANDARD FINDINGS FOR SAN FRANCISCO 
BUILDING STANDARDS CODE AMENDMENTS 

I . Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk for 
earthquake-induced failure and consequent fire due to local hazardous 
microzones, slide areas, and local liquefaction hazards. 
(Geology) 

2. Certain buildings/occupancies in San Francisco are at increased risk of 
tire due to high density of buildings on very small lots, with many buildings 
built up to the property lines. (Topography) 

3. Topography of San Francisco has let to development of a high density of 
buildings on small lots, necessitating special provisions for exiting, fire 
separation, or fire-resistive construction. (Topography) 

4. Many buildings are built on steep hills and narrow streets, requiring 
special safety consideration. ·(Topography) 

5. Additional fire, structural and other protection is required due to high 
building density and crowded occupancy. (Topography) 

6. San Francisco has narrow, crowded sidewalks due to building and 
population .density and unusual topography. (Topography) 

7. All rain water in San Francisco drains to the building drains and·sewer; 
unusual geology, occasional extremely high local rainfall amounts, and 
the configuration of the City as a peninsula restrict the installation of 
-separate storm water and sewer systems. (Topography, Climate, 
Geology) 

8. Moist, corrosive atmosphere of salt-laden fog in San Francisco 
necessitates additional requirements. (Climate) 

9. Not a building standard; no local findings required. 

10. Soil conditions in this region induce adverse reactions with some 
materials, leading to premature failures and subsequent unsanitary 
conditions. (Climate) 

II. The region is subject to fluctuating rainfall due to changes iri climatic 
conditions. (Climate) 

388 



12. San Francisco is a peninsula surrounded on three sides by water at sea 
level; mitigation of climate change impacts, including sea level rise, is 
critical to the long term protection of the local built environment and local 
infrastructure. (Topography) 

13. Climate and potential climate change impacts San Francisco's water 
resources, including reservoirs and distribution facilities. (Climate) 

14. Organic material in San Francisco's waste breaks down into methane gas 
which is a significant contributor to climate change. (Climate) 

15. San Francisco is topographically constrained and its built environment 
occupies most available land, requiring minimization of debris and solid 
waste. (Topography) 

16. Prevailing winds, coastal mountain ranges, and periodic seasonal high 
temperatures contribute to photochemical reactions that produce smog 
and ozone; limiting the emission of smog's chemical precursors - volatile 
organic chemicals and oxides of nitrogen - is necessary to health and 
safety. (Climate, Topography) 

17. The aquifers underlying San Francisco are small relative to local 
population, necessitating ongoing water imports and special provisions to 
ensure efficient use of water in local buildings. (Geology) 

389 

2 



' 
2019 San Francisco Plumbing Code Findings 

Section#. Finding# Section# Finding# 

CHAPTER 1 104.4.3 9 

101.1 9 1 04.4,3.1 9 

103.1 9 104.4.3.2 9 

103.4 9 104.5 9 

103.5 9 104.5.2 9 

103.6 9 104.5.3 9 

103.7 9 105.2.6 9 

104.1 9 106.3 9 

104.1.1 9 106.5 9 

104.1.2 9 107.0 9 

104.2 9 108.0 9 

104.3 9 109.0 9 

104.3.2 9 109.1 9 

104.3.2.1 . 9 109.2 9 

104.3.2.2 9 109.3 9 

104.3.2.3 9 109.4 9 

104.4 9 

3 

390 



Section# Finding# Section# Finding# 

CHAPTER 2 CHAPTER 3 

201.1 9 313.9 1 

204.0 9 313.9.1 1 

208.0 9 313.9.2 1 

216.0 9 

218.0 9 

221.0 9 

CHAPTER 4 CHAPTER 5 

405.4 7,10 504.1 4,9 

415.2.1 13 

CHAPTER 6 CHAPTER 7 

603.1 4 701.2(2)(a) 5,10 

603.3 9 701.2(3) 1 

603.5.6.4 9 701.2(7) 5 

604.1 5 706.4 5,7 

606.2 4 710.1.1 5,7 

606.3 4 
CHAPTER 8 

606.3.1 4,9 No San Francisco Amendments 

606.5 4 CHAPTER 9 

606.9 5,7 901.1 5,7 

609.10.2 4 907.1 2,4, 14,16 

4 

391 



160B.10.3 4,9 1907.3 2,4, 14,16 

Section# Findin_g # Section# Finding# 

CHAPTER 10 
1001.3 3,7 

1008.1 4,7 

1016.3.1 4,7 

CHAPTER 11 CHAPTER 12 

1101.2.1 12,13,15 1208.5.1 16 
CHAPTER13 

1101.2.2 12,13,15 No San Francisco Amendments 
CHAPTER 14 

1101.2.3 12,13,15 . No San Francisco Amendments 
CHAPTER 15 CHAPTER 16 & 16A 

No San Francisco Amendments No San Francisco Amendments 
CHAPTER 17 Appendix A, B, D, H, I, J 

No San Francisco Amendments No San Francisco Amendments 

n:\legana\as20 19\1900415\0 I 393209 .doc 

5 

392 



Li>~~tin N. Bree'ti 
Mayor 

'cp~_ssiqn · 
Angii~:Met~rtny 
·p"fe~ioent' . :·.·, :.· ·. 

m:Or.iWalk& 
·vi~reilfiifint 

:K:e..iin ~lim:fi:, · 
.Jo!m"Kohstin· 
l'rnnt(tei:-' 
·sihrt:r~ti}~ 
·Jaffies.W'mshefl. 

=.sPny.a:~~m~· 
,;>~f;ary 

Shi.deyW\ing 
·A~sistanr~ti · ,., -· ...... ·· •:· ... J'f 
Tom:£,Hui 
s·~ ..... 
:is?({.,, J:?Jre!!to~ 

BUILDING INSPECTION COMMISSION (BIG). · R[~C~jVo" ~J>v., 0 .,,'b:. 
· . 601\RD Or o'd·~"'+'~-'--[I,'J 

Ms. Angela Calvillo 
Clerk of the Board 
Board of Supervisors, City Hall . 

. 1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 
San Francisco, CA 94102-4694 

.,1 ; •• , 

RE: Code amendments to the 2019 California Building Standards Code, 
including the Building, Existing Building, Residential,. Mechanical, 
Plumbing, Electrical, and Green Building Codes and.recommend approval 
to the Board of Supervisors. 

Dear Ms. Calvillo: 

On July 17, 2019 the Building Inspection Commission held a public 
hearing on the proposed Code amendments referenced above. 

The Commission voted unanimously (6-0) to recommend that the Board of 
Supervisors approve the amendments. 

The Commissioners voted as ·follows: 

President McCarthy Yes 
Commissioner Clinch Yes 
Commissioner Lee Yes 
Commissioner Wars hell Yes 

Vice-President Walker 
Commissioner i<onstin 
Commissioner Moss 

Yes 
Excused 
Yes 

Enclosed please find the Code Advisory Committee's recommendation to the . 
BIC. Under separate cover, copies of the proposed amendments will follow 
fr~m the Technical Services Division of the Department of Building Inspection. 

Should you have any questions, please do not hesitate to.call me at 558-6164. 

Sincerely, 

~Q~~~ 
Sor)ya Harris 
Commission Secretary 

393 



cc: Tom C. Hui, S.E., C.B.O., Director 
Mayor London N. Breed 
Supervisor Vallie Brown 
Supervisor Sandra Lee Fewer 
Supervisor Matt Haney 
Supervisor Rafael Mandelman 
Supervisor Gordon Mar 
Supervisor Aaron Peskin 
Supervisor Hillary Ronen 
Supervisor Ahsha Safai 
Supervisor Catherine Stefani 
Supervisor Shamann Walton 
Supervisor Norman Yee 
Deputy City Attorney Robb Kapla 

394 



Preside1it, District 1 
BOARD of SUPERVISORS 

,··:·;", . ·• · ... City" Hall 
ZOtJJ·®tlto:lB.ltMo~t\t:O\ace; Roont.244 
· ·· · Fr~ncisco, CA 94102~4689 

".\./. " • _' . '6-ir: 
·' · Fax No. '554-1674 

TDDti:TYNo. 544c6546 

:NormiujYee 

.. . 

, PRESIDENTIAL ACTION 

Date: 

Tot Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the B.oard of Supe1Visois 

:Madam Clerk,· 
Pursuant to. Board~Rules, I am hereby: 

' ' 

[8J Waiving 30-Day Rule,(B6ard Rule No.3.Z3) 

[] 

D 

FileNo. 

Title.· 

Title. 

Q)a.te) 

Duration: (!)Partial 

. D St~t End Timfl-r.;...,._,."-'--'-

Meeting 

0 Full Meeting 

Ountil original Committee M"'' l 'rhturns _ 
----~-+~~~~~~--------

Norman Y~e, Pl~es· ent 
Board of Supet-v~s , ·s 

\J 

395 



City and County of San Francisco 
Department of Building Inspection 

· September 20, 2019 

Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board 
Board of Supervisors 
#1 Dr. Carlton B. Goodlett Place, Room 244 
San· Francisco, CA 941 02~4689 

Dear Ms. Calvillo: 

. . . . ~f. r-· . London N. Breed 
REC-t:,~, 6·£~vt.;_;rnrb C. Hui, S.E., C.B.O., Director OF 'i\ur l'i:l'"'-~~tl .. 

F "' ~ ~t{~ \ c, c 0 'j!!( ..... il•<> ~ ~ 

Attached please find an original and two copies (1 electronic CD) of seven proposed ordinances 
(approved by the Building Inspection· Commission on July 17, 2019) for the Board of Supervisors 
approval, which repeal the San Francisco amendments to the 2016 California Building Standards 
Codes and adopt replacement amendments to the new 2019 California Building Standards Codes 
effective January 1, 2019. (One copy of these 2019 California Building Standards Codes are · 
hereby provided for your r~ference.) · · 

The following is a list of accompanying documents: 

1) Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission 
2) San Francisco Building Code and Residential Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest), Exhibit 

A Standard Findings, Findings, proposed ame_ndment text (Building) 
3) ·San Francisco Existing Building Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, proposed amendmenttext. (Existing Building) · 
4) San Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Findings, 

Findings, proposed amendment text (Electrical)· · 
5) San Francisco Mechanical Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text (Mechanical) 
6) ·San Francisco Plumbing Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard Findings, 

Findings, proposed amendment text (Plumbing) · 
7) San Francisco Green Building Code Ordinance, Legislative Digest, Exhibit A Standard 

Findings, Findings, proposed amendment text. (Green), Cost effectiveness study. 
. . 

In order for the San Francisco code amendments to coordinate with the California·codes, which have 
·an effective date of January 1, 2019, the tiineline for approval and adoption requir~s that the codes be 
submitted to the Board of Supervisors on or before SeptE?mber 23, 2019 for introduction and 
assignment to the Land Use Committee (on October 1, 2019). We will be requesting a waiver to the 
thirty-day rule prior to hearing at the Land Use Committee such that the Codes may be heard by the 
Land Use Committee on October 7, 2019. When approved, it is proposed that the Board of Supervisor 
agendize Readings on October 15, 2019 and October 22, 2019. Upon their approval, the ordinances 
will be forwarded to the Mayor for signature within 10 days, followed by a 30-day wait period (ending 
approximately December 9, 2019) before filing with the California Building Standards Commission to 
become effective for an implementation date of January 1, 2020. 

Technical Services Division 
1660 Mission Street- San Francisco GA 94103 

Office (415) 558-6205- FAX (415) 558~6401- WWW:sfdbi.org 

396 



Angela Calvillo, Clerk of the Board Page 2 of 2 

The following person may be contacted regarding this matter: 

Michelle Yu, Manager 
Technical Services Division 
Department of Building Inspection 
Phone: (415) 558-6059 

· A.ttachments: As stated 

Technicai Services Division 

September 20, 2019 

1660 Mission Street- San Francisco CA 94103 
Office (415) 575-6205- FAX (415) 558-6401- www.sfdbi.org 

397 



Table of Content 

1. General 

a. Approval letter from the Building Inspection Commission 

2. Building Code and Residential B.uilding Requirer:nents 

a. Legislative Digf!st 

b.. San Francisco Building Code Ordinance including Residential Building Requirements 

c. Exnibit A- Standard Findings 

d. Findings 

e. San Francisco Bui.lding Code .Amendments 

f. Residential Building Requirements- See Chapter 36 ofthe San Francisco Building Code 

3. Existing Building Code 

a. Legislative Digest . 

. b. ·San Francisco Existing Building Code Ordinance 

c. · Exhibit A- Standard Findings 

d. Findings 

e. San Francisco Existing Building Code Amendments 

4. Electr.ical Code 

a. Legislative Digest 

b. San Francisco Electrical Code Ordinance 

c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 

d. Findings 

e. San Francisco Electrical Code Ame.ndments 

5. Mechanical Code 

a. Legislative Digest 

b. San Francisco Mechanical Code Ordinance 

c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 

d. Findings 

e. ·san Francisco Mechanical Code Amendments 

6. Plumbing Code 

a. Legislative Digest 

b. San Francisco Plumbing Code Ordinance· 

c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings 

d .. Findings· 

e. San Francisco Plumbing Code Amendments 

7. Green Building Code 

a. Legislative Digest 

b. San Francisco Green Building Co9e Ordinance 

c. Exhibit A- Standard Findings. 

d. Findings 

e. San Francisco ~reen Building Code Amendments 

f. Nonresidential New Construction Reach Code Cost Effectiveness Study 

g. Cost-effectiveness Study: Low-Rise. Residential New Construction 

398 


