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Auyong, Angela (PDR)

From: Jessica Sutton <jsutton@pfs-llc.net>

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 4:00 PM

To: Auyong, Angela (PDR)

Subject: RE: Kelson Foundation grant

Hi Angela, 

 

The Crankstart award is $250,000 and the Kelson award is $35,000. These are two separate grants/separate foundations but for the same project. Both grant 

terms can begin Jan 1 – Dec 31 with reports due July 31.  

 

Let me know if you have any other questions. 

 

Best, 

Jessica 

 

 

From: Auyong, Angela (PDR) <angela.auyong@sfgov.org>  

Sent: Thursday, December 10, 2020 3:55 PM 

To: Jessica Sutton <jsutton@pfs-llc.net> 

Subject: RE: Kelson Foundation grant 

 

Hi Jessica, 

 

I hope you are doing well. 

 

I am working on the accept and expend ordinance of the grant.  We are so exciting about the opportunity that you provided us.  We appreciate your support to 

our office and clients!   

 

I have a couple of questions: 

 

1. What is the grant start and end date? 

2. To confirm:  Kelson Foundation will give us $35,000; Crankstart Foundation will award us $215,000, so the total award is $250,000. 

3. Since Kelson Foundation is part of the Crankstart family of foundations, also based on the award letter from your email, can we treat this as one grantor 

who is the Crankstart Foundation for total award of $250,000?   
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Thank you so much! 

Angela 

 
Angela Auyong | Office Manager 

Office of the Public Defender | City & County of San Francisco 

555 7th Street | San Francisco, CA  94103 

Phone: (415) 553-1677 | Fax: (415) 553-1607 | Email: Angela.Auyong@sfgov.org 

 

From: Jessica Sutton [mailto:jsutton@pfs-llc.net]  

Sent: Tuesday, December 08, 2020 6:07 PM 

To: Razzaq, Hadi (PDR) <hadi.razzaq@sfgov.org> 

Cc: Auyong, Angela (PDR) <angela.auyong@sfgov.org> 

Subject: Kelson Foundation grant 

 

  

Hi Hadi, 

 

The Kelson Foundation, which is part of the Crankstart family of foundations, has awarded the San Francisco Public Defender’s Office a grant of $35,000 for the 

clean slate program work that Crankstart has funded (Crankstart funding should arrive this week). I have attached the award letter for the recent Crankstart 

grant and will follow up once the wire transfer is processed.  

 

Angela, can I use the same payment information to process this new grant from Kelson? 

 

Thank you, 

Jessica 

 

Jessica Sutton | Senior Grants Manager 

CRANKSTART 

1660 Bush Street, Suite 300, San Francisco, CA 94109 | 415.561.6540 ext. 238 

Pronouns: she/her 

A partner of Pacific Foundation Services 

 

Please note: In response to the current public health crisis, our offices remain closed and our team is balancing the various demands of working remotely. We 

appreciate your understanding that response times may be delayed. 

 

  This message is from outside the City email system. Do not open links or attachments from untrusted sources. 


